

Please note there are additional hours relating to 2023 starting on page 77.

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Adams	David Gifford	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
		1098	3/17/2023	SW District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language and Uniformity and Legislative Update	1.50
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
		1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
		1113	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Small	1.00
		1203	9/22/2023	SW District Mtg - LIHTC Update, Sen. Terry Johnson, County Abstracts	2.00
		1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
		1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
		1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
		1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
		1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

	1313	3/15/2024	SW District Meeting - Real Estate Assessment Fund, Special Assessments, Legislative Update	2.00
	1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>				<b>47.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Allen	Rachael S. Gilroy	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Emergency and Qualifying Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1000	5/10/2023	Enterprise Service Requests Roundtable	1.00
		1048	5/10/2023	Accrual Payroll Buyouts, Let's Explore Your Options!	1.00
		1049	5/10/2023	Accounts Overview: Balances, Debits, and Credits, Oh My!	1.00
		1050	5/8/2023	Enterprise ERP General Session	1.00
		1051	5/8/2023	All the Single Lines-AP Invoice Imports	1.00
		1052	5/8/2023	1099 Manager-Tackling Tax Season with Ease	1.00
		1053	5/8/2023	All Aboard for Better Employee Onboarding Training	1.00
		1054	5/9/2023	CAVU eLicense Interface Module Overview	1.00
		1055	5/9/2023	Benefit Enrollment Campaigns and More	1.00
		1056	5/9/2023	RAM: Realization, Assessment, and Motivation	1.00
		1057	5/9/2023	Employee Training: From Waitlist to Class List and Beyond	1.00
		1063	4/26/2023	Ohio Land Bank Association Legislative Agenda	1.00
		1064	4/26/2023	County Government in Ohio	1.00
		1065	4/26/2023	Financial Best Practices of Land Banks	1.00
		1066	4/26/2023	Land Bank 101	1.00
		1067	4/26/2023	Managing Your Land Bank	1.00
		1068	4/26/2023	Making Rural Land Banks Work	1.00
		1069	4/26/2023	Land Bank Opportunities to Build Back after Disasters	1.00
		1189	4/28/2023	NW District Mtg - BORs - BTA - HB126	1.00
		1194	5/19/2023	*NW District Mtg - Ethics Commission Susan Willeke	1.00
		1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>				<b>36.25</b>	

**County**                      **Auditor**                      **Course #**                      **Date**                      **Course Title**                      **Hours**

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

Ashland	Cindy Funk	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		1096	9/8/2023	NE District Meeting - McKinley Monument	1.50
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
		1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
		1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
		1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
		1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
		1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
		1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1333	3/22/2024	NW District Meeting - Budget Commission	1.00		
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00		

**Total Hours: 35.50**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Ashtabula	David Thomas	969	3/29/2023	*Local Government Officials Conference	11.00
		982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
1075	3/28/2023	Day 1 Local Government Official Conference	6.00
1096	9/8/2023	NE District Meeting - McKinley Monument	1.50
1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
1098	3/17/2023	SW District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language and Uniformity and Legislative Update	1.50
1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1189	4/28/2023	NW District Mtg - BORs - BTA - HB126	1.00
1204	8/4/2023	NE District Mtg - Soil & Water Update, CAUV Update, The Honorable Sandra O'Brien, Legislative Update	2.00
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00

**Total Hours: 70.75**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Athens	Jill A. Davidson	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
1059	10/11/2023	Ohio GFOA Annual Conference	15.00
1070	5/16/2023	**Certified Public Records Training	3.00
1071	9/14/2023	How to Respond to Employee Leave	2.00
1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1193	7/14/2023	SE District Mtg - Cyber Security, Parcel Mapping, Legislative Update	2.00
1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
1217	2/6/2024	2024: Updates on Investing & Debt Markets	1.20
1269	1/12/2024	SE District Mtg - Special Assessment and Legislative Updated	1.50
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1302	4/12/2024	Southeast District Meeting - REA Fund, Legislative Update, Roundtable	1.50
1314	5/7/2024	*23rd Annual Emerging Trends in Fraud	3.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1315	5/7/2024	23rd Annual Emerging Trends in Fraud	13.00
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>91.95</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Auglaize	Linda Bice	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1060	10/5/2023	*The Ohio Ethics Law 2023	1.00
		1098	3/17/2023	SW District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language and Uniformity and Legislative Update	1.50
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
		1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
		1113	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Small	1.00
		1196	5/19/2023	SW District Mtg - Sen. Bob Hackett, Rep. Bernie Willis, Legislative Update	1.50
		1199	10/20/2023	SW District Mtg - Ohio Chief Justice Kennedy, Rep. Tom Hall	1.50
		1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

1203	9/22/2023	SW District Mtg - LIHTC Update, Sen. Terry Johnson, County Abstracts	2.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1313	3/15/2024	SW District Meeting - Real Estate Assessment Fund, Special Assessments, Legislative Update	2.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>54.25</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Belmont	Cindi Henry	985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
		1191	4/14/2023	SE District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language, BOR Season, Legislative Update	1.50
		1269	1/12/2024	SE District Mtg - Special Assessment and Legislative Updated	1.50
		1302	4/12/2024	Southeast District Meeting - REA Fund, Legislative Update, Roundtable	1.50
<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>26.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Brown	Jill A. Hall	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1199	10/20/2023	SW District Mtg - Ohio Chief Justice Kennedy, Rep. Tom Hall	1.50
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1301	4/3/2024	**Sunshine Law Training	3.00
1316	5/1/2024	Securing Our Cities: Preventing MFA Bypass Attacks and Financial Cyber Fraud	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>44.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Butler	Nancy Nix	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1115	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Large	1.00
1196	5/19/2023	SW District Mtg - Sen. Bob Hackett, Rep. Bernie Willis, Legislative Update	1.50
1199	10/20/2023	SW District Mtg - Ohio Chief Justice Kennedy, Rep. Tom Hall	1.50
1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
1203	9/22/2023	SW District Mtg - LIHTC Update, Sen. Terry Johnson, County Abstracts	2.00
1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1313	3/15/2024	SW District Meeting - Real Estate Assessment Fund, Special Assessments, Legislative Update	2.00
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00

**Total Hours: 65.25**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Carroll	Lynn Fairclough	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
1096	9/8/2023	NE District Meeting - McKinley Monument	1.50
1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1204	8/4/2023	NE District Mtg - Soil & Water Update, CAUV Update, The Honorable Sandra O'Brien, Legislative Update	2.00
1270	2/7/2024	**The Sunshine Law	3.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>34.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Champaign	Karen T. Bailey	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		1098	3/17/2023	SW District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language and Uniformity and Legislative Update	1.50
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1199	10/20/2023	SW District Mtg - Ohio Chief Justice Kennedy, Rep. Tom Hall	1.50
		1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
		1313	3/15/2024	SW District Meeting - Real Estate Assessment Fund, Special Assessments, Legislative Update	2.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

1317	5/1/2024	Investigating Conflicts of Interest - Part 2	3.20
1318	5/1/2024	Investigating Conflicts of Interest - Part 1	4.80
1331	4/26/2024	NW District Meeting - Toledo Metroparks Update, Port Authority Update and Legislative Report	1.50
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>19.25</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>		
Clark	Hillary Hamilton	1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00		
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25		
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75		
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00		
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00		
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00		
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00		
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75		
		1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00		
		1136	11/14/2023	*The Ohio Ethics Law 2023: The Refresher Course	1.00		
		1199	10/20/2023	SW District Mtg - Ohio Chief Justice Kennedy, Rep. Tom Hall	1.50		
		1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75		
		1203	9/22/2023	SW District Mtg - LIHTC Update, Sen. Terry Johnson, County Abstracts	2.00		
		1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00		
		1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00		
		1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00		
		1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00		
		1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00		
		1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00		
		1310	4/9/2024	**Certified Public Records Training	3.00		
		1322	3/4/2024	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00		
		1323	2/9/2024	Workshop 411: Health Workplace Culture	2.00		
		1324	11/27/2023	The Mount Vernon Project: School of Public Service	1.00		
		1325	11/27/2023	*The Mount Vernon Project: School of Public Service - Rules of Ethics	0.32		
		1326	11/27/2023	**The Mount Vernon Project: School of Public Service - Public Records	0.26		
		1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00		
		1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00		
		<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>36.58</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Clermont	Linda L. Fraley	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
		1117	9/12/2023	Detecting Account Fraud Before It's Too Late	8.00
		1118	6/12/2023	*The Ohio Ethics Law 2023: The Refresher Course	1.00
		1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
		1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>27.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Clinton	Terence G. Habermehl	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1098	3/17/2023	SW District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language and Uniformity and Legislative Update	1.50
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
		1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
		1113	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Small	1.00
		1199	10/20/2023	SW District Mtg - Ohio Chief Justice Kennedy, Rep. Tom Hall	1.50
		1203	9/22/2023	SW District Mtg - LIHTC Update, Sen. Terry Johnson, County Abstracts	2.00
		1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>29.25</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Columbiana	Nancy Milliken	985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1154	1/29/2024	Workplace Substance Abuse Awareness	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>18.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Coshocton	Grant K. Daugherty	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1096	9/8/2023	NE District Meeting - McKinley Monument	1.50
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>38.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Crawford	Robyn Sheets	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
		1099	3/24/2023	NW District Meeting - Courthouse K9 Unit Demonstration	1.00
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
		1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
		1114	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Medium	1.00
		1189	4/28/2023	NW District Mtg - BORs - BTA - HB126	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1194	5/19/2023	*NW District Mtg - Ethics Commission Susan Willeke	1.00
1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
1205	7/28/2023	NW District Mtg - Four Flags fo Freedom, Legislative Update	1.00
1208	8/25/2023	NW District Mtg - LogistiQ Update, Coach Legando, Prepration of Value Abstracts, Legislative Update	1.50
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1316	5/1/2024	Securing Our Cities: Preventing MFA Bypass Attacks and Financial Cyber Fraud	1.00
1333	3/22/2024	NW District Meeting - Budget Commission	1.00
1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00

**Total Hours: 61.75**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Cuyahoga	Michael W. Chambers	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		1096	9/8/2023	NE District Meeting - McKinley Monument	1.50
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
		1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
		1115	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Large	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

1204	8/4/2023	NE District Mtg - Soil & Water Update, CAUV Update, The Honorable Sandra O'Brien, Legislative Update	2.00
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>38.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Darke	Carol A. Ginn	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1061	5/22/2023	22nd Annual Emerging Trends in Fraud Investigation & Prevention Conference	13.50
		1062	5/23/2023	*22nd Annual Emerging Trends In Fraud Investigation & Prevention Ethics Training	2.50
		1098	3/17/2023	SW District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language and Uniformity and Legislative Update	1.50
		1196	5/19/2023	SW District Mtg - Sen. Bob Hackett, Rep. Bernie Willis, Legislative Update	1.50
		1203	9/22/2023	SW District Mtg - LIHTC Update, Sen. Terry Johnson, County Abstracts	2.00
		1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
		1313	3/15/2024	SW District Meeting - Real Estate Assessment Fund, Special Assessments, Legislative Update	2.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>40.25</b>

**County**                      **Auditor**                      **Course #**                      **Date**                      **Course Title**                      **Hours**

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

Defiance	Jill R. Little	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1099	3/24/2023	NW District Meeting - Courthouse K9 Unit Demonstration	1.00
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
		1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		1194	5/19/2023	*NW District Mtg - Ethics Commission Susan Willeke	1.00
		1205	7/28/2023	NW District Mtg - Four Flags fo Freedom, Legislative Update	1.00
		1260	9/22/2023	NW District Mtg - Partnership with Regional Planning, Legislative Update	1.00
		1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00		
1331	4/26/2024	NW District Meeting - Toledo Metroparks Update, Port Authority Update and Legislative Report	1.50		
1333	3/22/2024	NW District Meeting - Budget Commission	1.00		
<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>35.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Delaware	George Kaitsa	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1115	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Large	1.00
1191	4/14/2023	SE District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language, BOR Season, Legislative Update	1.50
1198	9/8/2023	SE District Mtg - Abstract of Real Property and Legislative Update	1.50
1269	1/12/2024	SE District Mtg - Special Assessment and Legislative Updated	1.50
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

**Total Hours: 52.50**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Erie	Rick Jeffrey	1099	3/24/2023	NW District Meeting - Courthouse K9 Unit Demonstration	1.00
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
		1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
		1114	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Medium	1.00
		1189	4/28/2023	NW District Mtg - BORs - BTA - HB126	1.00
		1194	5/19/2023	*NW District Mtg - Ethics Commission Susan Willeke	1.00
		1197	10/27/2023	NW District Mtg - Artificial Intelligence	1.00
		1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
		1208	8/25/2023	NW District Mtg - LogistiQ Update, Coach Legando, Preperation of Value Abstracts, Legislative Update	1.50
		1260	9/22/2023	NW District Mtg - Partnership with Regional Planning, Legislative Update	1.00
		1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
		1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
		1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
		1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
		1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
		1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
		1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
		1331	4/26/2024	NW District Meeting - Toledo Metroparks Update, Port Authority Update and Legislative Report	1.50
		1333	3/22/2024	NW District Meeting - Budget Commission	1.00
		1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>33.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Fairfield	Carri Brown	971	3/17/2023	*Advancing Community Based Solutions for Justice Involved People	1.00
		972	3/16/2023	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
		1001	6/7/2023	Grow Your Garden-Create Opportunities to Advance Yourself	1.50
		1014	3/14/2023	*The Ohio Ethics Law 2023: Following the Right Path	1.00
		1016	4/11/2023	*Ohio Ethics-The Refresher Course	1.00
		1017	4/12/2023	*Ethics and Decisions	2.00
		1018	4/17/2023	*Mini-Mental Health First Aid Training/Substance Abuse Prevention	1.00
		1019	4/20/2023	Generations Working Together	4.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1020	5/5/2023	Teamwork and Leadership	1.00
1021	5/6/2023	Winter 2022 Journal Quiz: Value Creation in Government	3.00
1022	5/7/2023	Spring 2022 Journal Quiz: Government and the Pandemic: Transitions	3.00
1023	5/7/2023	Fall 2022 Journal Quiz: Government and the Pandemic: Financial Outcomes	3.00
1024	5/7/2023	Winter 2023 Journal Quiz: Government and the Pandemic: Reporting on Results	3.00
1025	5/19/2023	Ohio University Women's Leadership Summit	26.00
1026	5/20/2023	Spring 2023 Journal Quiz: Now What?	3.00
1147	7/24/2023	AGA Professional Development Seminars	20.00
1148	8/30/2023	Critical Thinking: Get Creative In Your Problem Solving Professional Development	1.00
1149	9/21/2023	REA Summit Serving Those Who Served	2.50
1150	10/11/2023	It's All In Your Head: Psychology, Money, and the Economics of Our Lives	1.50
1151	10/26/2023	Leadership In Public Finance and Economic Development: The Role of Fiscal Officers in Ohio's Future	6.00
1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
1202	6/20/2023	FBI Citizen Academy - Cyber Security, Forensic Accounting	24.50
1255	1/4/2024	*County Auditor's Third Annual Retreat - Ethics	1.00
1256	1/4/2024	County Auditor's Third Annual Retreat - Mindfulness/Wellness, Unlawful Harrassment Training	1.00
1257	1/4/2024	Organizational Health - Making High Functioning and High Performing Elements Less Fuzzy	1.00
1258	2/14/2024	Setting a Clear Vision for Your Team: Lessons from an Olympic Athlete Turned Executive	1.50
1268	2/29/2024	2024 National Leadership Training	14.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>136.25</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Fayette	Brenda Mossbarger	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
1098	3/17/2023	SW District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language and Uniformity and Legislative Update	1.50
1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1196	5/19/2023	SW District Mtg - Sen. Bob Hackett, Rep. Bernie Willis, Legislative Update	1.50
1199	10/20/2023	SW District Mtg - Ohio Chief Justice Kennedy, Rep. Tom Hall	1.50
1203	9/22/2023	SW District Mtg - LIHTC Update, Sen. Terry Johnson, County Abstracts	2.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1313	3/15/2024	SW District Meeting - Real Estate Assessment Fund, Special Assessments, Legislative Update	2.00
1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>39.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Franklin	Michael Stinziano	1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
		1115	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Large	1.00
		1170	5/12/2023	Residential Real Property In Ohio: What Owners Need To Know	2.00
		1171	6/8/2023	*Ethics Information Session	2.50
		1172	6/8/2023	The 44th Annual John E. Sullivan Lecture	2.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1173	10/9/2023	Substance Abuse, Why Is It A Bigger Problem In The Legal Profession	1.00
1174	12/6/2023	Property Taxation and Property Valuation	1.50
1175	12/14/2023	The Function Of An Auditor As A Consumer Advocate And Protector	1.00
1176	6/8/2023	Public Practice Professional Conduct, CLE Seminar	2.50
1177	10/12/2023	Sullivan Lecture, To Trust The People With Arms, The Supreme Court and The Second Amendment	2.00
1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00

**Total Hours: 36.75**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Fulton	Brett J. Kolb	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1113	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Small	1.00
1205	7/28/2023	NW District Mtg - Four Flags fo Freedom, Legislative Update	1.00
1260	9/22/2023	NW District Mtg - Partnership with Regional Planning, Legislative Update	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1333	3/22/2024	NW District Meeting - Budget Commission	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>33.25</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Gallia	Robbie Jacks	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1191	4/14/2023	SE District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language, BOR Season, Legislative Update	1.50
		1193	7/14/2023	SE District Mtg - Cyber Security, Parcel Mapping, Legislative Update	2.00
		1198	9/8/2023	SE District Mtg - Abstract of Real Property and Legislative Update	1.50
		1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
		1269	1/12/2024	SE District Mtg - Special Assessment and Legislative Updated	1.50
		1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1300	4/10/2024	**Ohio Public Records Law Course	2.50
1302	4/12/2024	Southeast District Meeting - REA Fund, Legislative Update, Roundtable	1.50
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>57.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Geauga	Charles E. Walder	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
		1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
		1204	8/4/2023	NE District Mtg - Soil & Water Update, CAUV Update, The Honorable Sandra O'Brien, Legislative Update	2.00
		1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>31.00</b>

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

<b>County</b>	<b>Auditor</b>	<b>Course #</b>	<b>Date</b>	<b>Course Title</b>	<b>Hours</b>
Greene	David Graham	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
		1098	3/17/2023	SW District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language and Uniformity and Legislative Update	1.50
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
		1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
		1114	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Medium	1.00
		1191	4/14/2023	SE District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language, BOR Season, Legislative Update	1.50
		1199	10/20/2023	SW District Mtg - Ohio Chief Justice Kennedy, Rep. Tom Hall	1.50
		1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
		1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
		1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
		1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
		1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
		1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
		1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
		1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1313	3/15/2024	SW District Meeting - Real Estate Assessment Fund, Special Assessments, Legislative Update	2.00
1316	5/1/2024	Securing Our Cities: Preventing MFA Bypass Attacks and Financial Cyber Fraud	1.00
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>63.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Guernsey	Cory Johnson	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
		1188	10/13/2023	SE District Mtg - Performance Audits: Bond Levy Millage Calculation, Legislative Update	2.00
		1191	4/14/2023	SE District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language, BOR Season, Legislative Update	1.50
		1198	9/8/2023	SE District Mtg - Abstract of Real Property and Legislative Update	1.50
		1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1302	4/12/2024	Southeast District Meeting - REA Fund, Legislative Update, Roundtable	1.50
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>42.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Hamilton	Brigid Kelly	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
		1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
		1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
		1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>16.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Hancock	Charity Rauschenberg	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1099	3/24/2023	NW District Meeting - Courthouse K9 Unit Demonstration	1.00
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
		1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		1114	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Medium	1.00
		1189	4/28/2023	NW District Mtg - BORs - BTA - HB126	1.00
		1194	5/19/2023	*NW District Mtg - Ethics Commission Susan Willeke	1.00
		1197	10/27/2023	NW District Mtg - Artificial Intelligence	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
1208	8/25/2023	NW District Mtg - LogistiQ Update, Coach Legando, Prepration of Value Abstracts, Legislative Update	1.50
1260	9/22/2023	NW District Mtg - Partnership with Regional Planning, Legislative Update	1.00
1261	10/11/2023	Ohio GFOA 36th Annual Conference and Membership Meeting	19.00
1262	5/10/2023	Ohio GFOA Debt Seminar	6.00
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1331	4/26/2024	NW District Meeting - Toledo Metroparks Update, Port Authority Update and Legislative Report	1.50
1333	3/22/2024	NW District Meeting - Budget Commission	1.00
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>75.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>		
Hardin	Michael T. Bacon	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00		
		1099	3/24/2023	NW District Meeting - Courthouse K9 Unit Demonstration	1.00		
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00		
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25		
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00		
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75		
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00		
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00		
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00		
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00		
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00		
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75		
		1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00		
		1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00		
		1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00		
		1113	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Small	1.00		
		1119	10/25/2023	How to Respond to Employee Leave Requests and "Playing Nice" with Others in the Workplace	2.00		
		1194	5/19/2023	*NW District Mtg - Ethics Commission Susan Willeke	1.00		
		1197	10/27/2023	NW District Mtg - Artificial Intelligence	1.00		
		1331	4/26/2024	NW District Meeting - Toledo Metroparks Update, Port Authority Update and Legislative Report	1.50		
		<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>21.25</b>

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Harrison	Allison M. Anderson	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		1096	9/8/2023	NE District Meeting - McKinley Monument	1.50
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1204	8/4/2023	NE District Mtg - Soil & Water Update, CAUV Update, The Honorable Sandra O'Brien, Legislative Update	2.00
		1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
		<b>Total Hours:</b>			

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Henry	Elizabeth Fruchey	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
1099	3/24/2023	NW District Meeting - Courthouse K9 Unit Demonstration	1.00
1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1113	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Small	1.00
1120	10/11/2023	36th Ohio GFOA Annual Conference and Membership Meeting	19.00
1121	10/25/2023	Software Solutions Inc. CPE Classroom Program	9.00
1189	4/28/2023	NW District Mtg - BORs - BTA - HB126	1.00
1194	5/19/2023	*NW District Mtg - Ethics Commission Susan Willeke	1.00
1197	10/27/2023	NW District Mtg - Artificial Intelligence	1.00
1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
1205	7/28/2023	NW District Mtg - Four Flags fo Freedom, Legislative Update	1.00
1208	8/25/2023	NW District Mtg - LogistiQ Update, Coach Legando, Prepration of Value Abstracts, Legislative Update	1.50
1260	9/22/2023	NW District Mtg - Partnership with Regional Planning, Legislative Update	1.00
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1316	5/1/2024	Securing Our Cities: Preventing MFA Bypass Attacks and Financial Cyber Fraud	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1319	3/5/2024	The Mount Vernon Project: School of Public Service - Rules of Ethics	1.00
1320	3/5/2024	*The Mount Vernon Project: School of Public Service	0.32
1321	3/5/2024	**The Mount Vernon Project: School of Public Service	0.26
1331	4/26/2024	NW District Meeting - Toledo Metroparks Update, Port Authority Update and Legislative Report	1.50
1333	3/22/2024	NW District Meeting - Budget Commission	1.00
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>97.83</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Highland	Alex Butler	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
		1098	3/17/2023	SW District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language and Uniformity and Legislative Update	1.50
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1113	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Small	1.00
1199	10/20/2023	SW District Mtg - Ohio Chief Justice Kennedy, Rep. Tom Hall	1.50
1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
1203	9/22/2023	SW District Mtg - LIHTC Update, Sen. Terry Johnson, County Abstracts	2.00
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1313	3/15/2024	SW District Meeting - Real Estate Assessment Fund, Special Assessments, Legislative Update	2.00
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>61.25</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Hocking	Christopher Robers	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1113	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Small	1.00
1188	10/13/2023	SE District Mtg - Performance Audits: Bond Levy Millage Calculation, Legislative Update	2.00
1191	4/14/2023	SE District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language, BOR Season, Legislative Update	1.50
1193	7/14/2023	SE District Mtg - Cyber Security, Parcel Mapping, Legislative Update	2.00
1198	9/8/2023	SE District Mtg - Abstract of Real Property and Legislative Update	1.50
1269	1/12/2024	SE District Mtg - Special Assessment and Legislative Updated	1.50
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1302	4/12/2024	Southeast District Meeting - REA Fund, Legislative Update, Roundtable	1.50
1316	5/1/2024	Securing Our Cities: Preventing MFA Bypass Attacks and Financial Cyber Fraud	1.00
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>62.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Holmes	Jackie McKee	1187	1/9/2024	**Certified Public Records Sunshine Law	3.00
		1259	1/9/2024	*Drug Free Workplace 101: Employee Essentials	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>4.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Huron	Roland Tkach	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
1099	3/24/2023	NW District Meeting - Courthouse K9 Unit Demonstration	1.00
1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1114	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Medium	1.00
1189	4/28/2023	NW District Mtg - BORs - BTA - HB126	1.00
1194	5/19/2023	*NW District Mtg - Ethics Commission Susan Willeke	1.00
1208	8/25/2023	NW District Mtg - LogistiQ Update, Coach Legando, Preperation of Value Abstracts, Legislative Update	1.50
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1333	3/22/2024	NW District Meeting - Budget Commission	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>44.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Jackson	Tiffany Ridgeway	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1113	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Small	1.00
1188	10/13/2023	SE District Mtg - Performance Audits: Bond Levy Millage Calculation, Legislative Update	2.00
1191	4/14/2023	SE District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language, BOR Season, Legislative Update	1.50
1193	7/14/2023	SE District Mtg - Cyber Security, Parcel Mapping, Legislative Update	2.00
1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
1209	11/9/2023	CORSA - Employee Leave Requests and First Amendment Audits	2.00
1264	4/27/2023	**Certified Public Records Training	3.00
1269	1/12/2024	SE District Mtg - Special Assessment and Legislative Updated	1.50
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1302	4/12/2024	Southeast District Meeting - REA Fund, Legislative Update, Roundtable	1.50
1316	5/1/2024	Securing Our Cities: Preventing MFA Bypass Attacks and Financial Cyber Fraud	1.00
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>73.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Jefferson	E.J. Conn	1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

**Total Hours: 0.75**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Knox	Sarah Thorne	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
		1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
		1113	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Small	1.00
		1123	9/13/2023	Workplace Civility Training	1.50
		1124	9/20/2023	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.33
		1125	10/26/2023	USERRA Training	1.00
1126	11/14/2023	How to Respond to Employee Leave Request and Playing Nice With Others in the Workplace	2.00		
1127	11/20/2023	The Mount Vernon Project: School of Public Service	1.00		
1128	12/5/2023	**Certified Public Records Training	3.00		
1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75		

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1204	8/4/2023	NE District Mtg - Soil & Water Update, CAUV Update, The Honorable Sandra O'Brien, Legislative Update	2.00
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1316	5/1/2024	Securing Our Cities: Preventing MFA Bypass Attacks and Financial Cyber Fraud	1.00
1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>67.58</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Lake	Christopher A. Galloway	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		1096	9/8/2023	NE District Meeting - McKinley Monument	1.50
		1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		1115	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Large	1.00
		1191	4/14/2023	SE District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language, BOR Season, Legislative Update	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1204	8/4/2023	NE District Mtg - Soil & Water Update, CAUV Update, The Honorable Sandra O'Brien, Legislative Update	2.00
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>40.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Lawrence	Paul David Knipp	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
		1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		1191	4/14/2023	SE District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language, BOR Season, Legislative Update	1.50
		1198	9/8/2023	SE District Mtg - Abstract of Real Property and Legislative Update	1.50
		1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
		1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>41.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Licking	Michael L. Smith	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
		1114	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Medium	1.00
		1211	11/13/2023	*The Ohio Ethics Law 2023: Following the Right Path	1.00
		1212	10/19/2023	**Certified Public Records Training	3.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>24.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Logan	Jack Reser	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		1030	3/21/2023	Engaging Your Legislators	1.00
		1031	3/28/2023	Best Practices Investment	1.00
		1032	3/28/2023	Small Towns/Big Future	1.00
		1033	3/28/2023	OPERS Reporting	1.00
		1034	3/28/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	3.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1035	3/29/2023	Employer of Choice	1.00
1036	3/29/2023	Dark Web/Ransomware	1.00
1037	3/29/2023	Keith Faber Auditor of State	1.00
1038	3/29/2023	Prepare Single Audit	1.00
1039	3/25/2023	Confessions of Fraudster	1.00
1040	3/29/2023	Performance Audit	1.00
1041	4/11/2023	Legislative Update/Impact	1.00
1042	4/19/2023	Do's and Don'ts of Pharmacy	1.00
1043	4/20/2023	OPERS Update	1.00
1044	6/14/2023	Deploying Resources for Mental Health	1.00
1045	8/1/2023	HB 33 Highlights	1.00
1046	8/9/2023	Ohio Virtual Tax Academy	3.00
1047	8/16/2023	State and Local Fiscal Recovery Funds 2023 Interim Rule	1.00
1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
1098	3/17/2023	SW District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language and Uniformity and Legislative Update	1.50
1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1199	10/20/2023	SW District Mtg - Ohio Chief Justice Kennedy, Rep. Tom Hall	1.50
1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
1203	9/22/2023	SW District Mtg - LIHTC Update, Sen. Terry Johnson, County Abstracts	2.00
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00

**Total Hours: 76.50**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Lorain	J. Craig Snodgrass	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
1072	4/27/2023	Leveraging Robotics and AI in Government Financial Management	7.00
1096	9/8/2023	NE District Meeting - McKinley Monument	1.50
1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1115	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Large	1.00
1275	3/16/2023	Town Halls 2023	1.00
1276	3/22/2023	Ohio Professional Standards and Responsibilities	3.00
1277	4/5/2023	Mentor/Mentee Day	8.00
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1279	4/12/2023	Fraud Prevention, Fraud Mystery Day	4.00
1280	5/12/2023	Drug Trends with Josh Hunt, Director of Medway Drug Enforcement Agency District Meeting	1.00
1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1282	8/2/2023	Advanced Governmental Accounting Seminar	13.00
1283	9/6/2023	NEO ILA Monthly Meeting Fraud Training	4.00
1284	11/3/2023	Fall Advance 2023	3.00
1285	5/5/2023	Spring Advance 2023	3.00
1286	4/27/2023	Leveraging Robotics and AI in Government Financial Management	7.00
1289	3/6/2024	Tax Season Update for Individuals with Steve Dilley	4.00
1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1303	4/15/2024	Monthly Federal Tax Update - April 2024	2.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1304	2/29/2024	Individual Tax Update - Recent Developments February 2024	2.00
1305	3/4/2024	Monthly Federal Tax Update - March 2024	2.00
1306	3/20/2024	Basic Individual Taxation Course	2.00
1333	3/22/2024	NW District Meeting - Budget Commission	1.00
1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>118.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>		
Lucas	Anita Lopez Katie Moline	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00		
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00		
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00		
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00		
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50		
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00		
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00		
		1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50		
		1194	5/19/2023	*NW District Mtg - Ethics Commission Susan Willeke	1.00		
		1197	10/27/2023	NW District Mtg - Artificial Intelligence	1.00		
		1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00		
		1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00		
		1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00		
		1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00		
		1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00		
		1307	3/28/2024	2024 Local Government Officials Conference	14.75		
		1308	3/27/2024	*2024 Local Government Officials Conference: Ethics Part 1 and 2	2.00		
		1331	4/26/2024	NW District Meeting - Toledo Metroparks Update, Port Authority Update and Legislative Report	1.50		
		1332	4/23/2024	An Update from the Lucas County Land Bank	1.00		
		1333	3/22/2024	NW District Meeting - Budget Commission	1.00		
		<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>40.25</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Madison	Jennifer S. Hunter, CPA	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		1098	3/17/2023	SW District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language and Uniformity and Legislative Update	1.50
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1203	9/22/2023	SW District Mtg - LIHTC Update, Sen. Terry Johnson, County Abstracts	2.00
1220	1/5/2024	**Certified Public Records Training	3.00
1226	4/27/2023	3 Questions to Answer to Retire with Confidence	1.00
1227	4/5/2023	Choosing Cultural Humility, Racial Empathy, and Resilience	1.00
1228	5/8/2023	Fraud: What to Look for and Where to Look	1.00
1229	5/11/2023	3 Questions to Answer to Retire with Confidence	1.00
1230	5/26/2023	Accounting Basics	1.00
1231	6/20/2023	Excel Tips & Tricks	1.50
1232	6/21/2023	Learning from Log4j: Got Application Security	1.50
1233	6/22/2023	Navigating Complexity with Hybrid Clouds	1.00
1234	6/28/2023	Warning Signs of Alzheimers: What CPAs Must Know	1.00
1235	7/11/2023	Stress Management at Work	1.40
1236	7/17/2023	Understanding Schedule C Audits	1.00
1237	7/19/2023	Bringing Agility to Modern Security Operations	1.00
1238	7/26/2023	Financial Tools to Fund Long-Term Care in 2023	1.00
1239	8/6/2023	Maximizing Social Security as a Foundation for Retirement	1.00
1240	8/24/2023	Finding Your Flow in Constant Chaos	1.00
1241	9/13/2023	Increase Your Impact: How to Ask Powerful Questions	1.00
1242	9/14/2023	How to Fight Threats to the Software Supply Chain	1.00
1243	9/28/2023	Fraud: What to Look for and Where to Look	1.00
1244	10/27/2023	Accounting Fall Conference	4.00
1245	10/24/2023	How Agencies Can Adopt AI Swiftly and Securely	1.00
1246	10/26/2023	Take Action Against Fraud: 5 Things You Can Do Today	1.00
1247	10/31/2023	2023 Year-End Tax Strategy Plan	1.00
1248	11/2/2023	Cyber Resilience 2023 - Day Two	2.50
1249	2/9/2024	Overcoming Your Inner Debbie Downer	1.00
1250	2/9/2024	Facing a Rapidly Changing Landscape	1.50
1251	2/1/2024	Mental Health Triage in the Workplace	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1309	3/21/2024	AI Can Boost Election Integrity, if Done Correctly	1.00
1313	3/15/2024	SW District Meeting - Real Estate Assessment Fund, Special Assessments, Legislative Update	2.00

**Total Hours: 66.15**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Mahoning	Ralph T. Meacham, CPA	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
1073	5/7/2023	On Cloud 9 (NASBA-FINANCE) Enterprise ERP Network Infrastructure Best Practice	2.00
1074	7/19/2023	Maher Duessel Nonprofit Update	16.00
1096	9/8/2023	NE District Meeting - McKinley Monument	1.50
1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1115	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Large	1.00
1131	12/5/2023	2023 CPE MONTH WEBINAR SERIES: TAX UPDATE	3.00
1132	12/7/2023	2023 CPE MONTH WEBINAR SERIES: CONSULTING, TECHNOLOGY, ADVISORY	3.00
1133	12/12/2023	2023 CPE MONTH WEBINAR SERIES: AUDIT UPDATE	2.50
1166	9/26/2023	Mahoning County Tax Issues	6.00
1167	5/7/2023	On Cloud 9, Enterprise ERP Network Infrastructure Best Prace	2.00
1168	12/18/2023	Maher Duessel Government Update	16.00
1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>90.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Marion	Joan M. Kasotis	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1099	3/24/2023	NW District Meeting - Courthouse K9 Unit Demonstration	1.00
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
		1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
		1114	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Medium	1.00
		1194	5/19/2023	*NW District Mtg - Ethics Commission Susan Willeke	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1208	8/25/2023	NW District Mtg - LogistiQ Update, Coach Legando, Prepration of Value Abstracts, Legislative Update	1.50
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>40.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Medina	Anthony P. Capretta	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1096	9/8/2023	NE District Meeting - McKinley Monument	1.50
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
		1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		1204	8/4/2023	NE District Mtg - Soil & Water Update, CAUV Update, The Honorable Sandra O'Brien, Legislative Update	2.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1208	8/25/2023	NW District Mtg - LogistiQ Update, Coach Legando, Prepration of Value Abstracts, Legislative Update	1.50
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>47.25</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Meigs	Mary T. Byer-Hill	1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
		1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
		1113	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Small	1.00
		1198	9/8/2023	SE District Mtg - Abstract of Real Property and Legislative Update	1.50
		1269	1/12/2024	SE District Mtg - Special Assessment and Legislative Updated	1.50
		1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
		1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
		1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>25.25</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Mercer	Randall E. Grapner	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1141	4/26/2023	Residential Property Inspection for Appraisers	7.00
1142	4/28/2023	2022-2023 National USPAP Update Course	7.00
1197	10/27/2023	NW District Mtg - Artificial Intelligence	1.00
1208	8/25/2023	NW District Mtg - LogistiQ Update, Coach Legando, Preperation of Value Abstracts, Legislative Update	1.50
1260	9/22/2023	NW District Mtg - Partnership with Regional Planning, Legislative Update	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1333	3/22/2024	NW District Meeting - Budget Commission	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>49.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Miami	Matthew W. Gearhardt	1098	3/17/2023	SW District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language and Uniformity and Legislative Update	1.50
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1134	12/14/2023	*The Ohio Ethics Law 2023: The Refresher Course	1.00
1135	9/27/2023	How to Respond to Employee Leave Requests and Play Nice with Others in the Workplace	2.00
1185	12/21/2023	**Sunshine Law Training	3.32
1313	3/15/2024	SW District Meeting - Real Estate Assessment Fund, Special Assessments, Legislative Update	2.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>18.57</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Monroe	Denise Stoneking	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
		1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		1191	4/14/2023	SE District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language, BOR Season, Legislative Update	1.50
		1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
		1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
		1302	4/12/2024	Southeast District Meeting - REA Fund, Legislative Update, Roundtable	1.50
		1327	4/9/2024	**Certified Public Records Training	3.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>46.75</b>

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Montgomery	Karl L. Keith	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1077	4/27/2023	Turning Data Into Action, Lunch and Plenary Session, Mobile Tour #3	4.75
		1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1199	10/20/2023	SW District Mtg - Ohio Chief Justice Kennedy, Rep. Tom Hall	1.50
		1271	3/8/2024	Property Valuations, Appeals, and You (Instructor)	1.00
		1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
		1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
		1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
		1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
		1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
		1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
		1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
		1313	3/15/2024	SW District Meeting - Real Estate Assessment Fund, Special Assessments, Legislative Update	2.00
		1328	5/1/2024	Roll-out of Housing Policy Toolkit	1.00
		<b>Total Hours:</b>			

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Morgan	Randy Williams	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1188	10/13/2023	SE District Mtg - Performance Audits: Bond Levy Millage Calculation, Legislative Update	2.00
1193	7/14/2023	SE District Mtg - Cyber Security, Parcel Mapping, Legislative Update	2.00
1198	9/8/2023	SE District Mtg - Abstract of Real Property and Legislative Update	1.50
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1311	3/28/2024	**Certified Public Records Training Parts 1-3	3.00
1312	1/9/2024	The Mount Vernon Project: School of Public Service	1.00

**Total Hours: 39.75**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Morrow	Conni McChesney	969	3/29/2023	*Local Government Officials Conference	11.00
		982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
1099	3/24/2023	NW District Meeting - Courthouse K9 Unit Demonstration	1.00
1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1113	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Small	1.00
1153	10/27/2023	Software Solutions Fall Conference	12.00
1189	4/28/2023	NW District Mtg - BORs - BTA - HB126	1.00
1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
1205	7/28/2023	NW District Mtg - Four Flags fo Freedom, Legislative Update	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1331	4/26/2024	NW District Meeting - Toledo Metroparks Update, Port Authority Update and Legislative Report	1.50
1333	3/22/2024	NW District Meeting - Budget Commission	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>78.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Muskingum	Debra J. Nye	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1188	10/13/2023	SE District Mtg - Performance Audits: Bond Levy Millage Calculation, Legislative Update	2.00
1191	4/14/2023	SE District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language, BOR Season, Legislative Update	1.50
1193	7/14/2023	SE District Mtg - Cyber Security, Parcel Mapping, Legislative Update	2.00
1198	9/8/2023	SE District Mtg - Abstract of Real Property and Legislative Update	1.50
1269	1/12/2024	SE District Mtg - Special Assessment and Legislative Updated	1.50
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>55.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Noble	Ruth Hayes	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1113	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Small	1.00
1188	10/13/2023	SE District Mtg - Performance Audits: Bond Levy Millage Calculation, Legislative Update	2.00
1191	4/14/2023	SE District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language, BOR Season, Legislative Update	1.50
1198	9/8/2023	SE District Mtg - Abstract of Real Property and Legislative Update	1.50
1302	4/12/2024	Southeast District Meeting - REA Fund, Legislative Update, Roundtable	1.50

**Total Hours: 28.25**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Ottawa	Jennifer J. Widmer	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
		1099	3/24/2023	NW District Meeting - Courthouse K9 Unit Demonstration	1.00
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
		1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1114	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Medium	1.00
1189	4/28/2023	NW District Mtg - BORs - BTA - HB126	1.00
1194	5/19/2023	*NW District Mtg - Ethics Commission Susan Willeke	1.00
1197	10/27/2023	NW District Mtg - Artificial Intelligence	1.00
1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
1205	7/28/2023	NW District Mtg - Four Flags fo Freedom, Legislative Update	1.00
1208	8/25/2023	NW District Mtg - LogistiQ Update, Coach Legando, Prepration of Value Abstracts, Legislative Update	1.50
1260	9/22/2023	NW District Mtg - Partnership with Regional Planning, Legislative Update	1.00
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1331	4/26/2024	NW District Meeting - Toledo Metroparks Update, Port Authority Update and Legislative Report	1.50
1333	3/22/2024	NW District Meeting - Budget Commission	1.00
1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00

**Total Hours: 65.25**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Paulding	Claudia J. Fickel	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1076	7/25/2023	*Ohio Ethics	1.00
		1099	3/24/2023	NW District Meeting - Courthouse K9 Unit Demonstration	1.00
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1189	4/28/2023	NW District Mtg - BORs - BTA - HB126	1.00
1194	5/19/2023	*NW District Mtg - Ethics Commission Susan Willeke	1.00
1197	10/27/2023	NW District Mtg - Artificial Intelligence	1.00
1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
1205	7/28/2023	NW District Mtg - Four Flags fo Freedom, Legislative Update	1.00
1260	9/22/2023	NW District Mtg - Partnership with Regional Planning, Legislative Update	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1331	4/26/2024	NW District Meeting - Toledo Metroparks Update, Port Authority Update and Legislative Report	1.50
1333	3/22/2024	NW District Meeting - Budget Commission	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>43.25</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Perry	Drew Cannon Derek Householder	1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1188	10/13/2023	SE District Mtg - Performance Audits: Bond Levy Millage Calculation, Legislative Update	2.00
		1198	9/8/2023	SE District Mtg - Abstract of Real Property and Legislative Update	1.50
		1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>6.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Pickaway	Brad Washburn	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1188	10/13/2023	SE District Mtg - Performance Audits: Bond Levy Millage Calculation, Legislative Update	2.00
1191	4/14/2023	SE District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language, BOR Season, Legislative Update	1.50
1198	9/8/2023	SE District Mtg - Abstract of Real Property and Legislative Update	1.50
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1313	3/15/2024	SW District Meeting - Real Estate Assessment Fund, Special Assessments, Legislative Update	2.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>37.25</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Pike	David Brown	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
		1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
		1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
		1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
		1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1113	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Small	1.00
1188	10/13/2023	SE District Mtg - Performance Audits: Bond Levy Millage Calculation, Legislative Update	2.00
1191	4/14/2023	SE District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language, BOR Season, Legislative Update	1.50
1193	7/14/2023	SE District Mtg - Cyber Security, Parcel Mapping, Legislative Update	2.00
1198	9/8/2023	SE District Mtg - Abstract of Real Property and Legislative Update	1.50
1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
1269	1/12/2024	SE District Mtg - Special Assessment and Legislative Updated	1.50
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1302	4/12/2024	Southeast District Meeting - REA Fund, Legislative Update, Roundtable	1.50
1316	5/1/2024	Securing Our Cities: Preventing MFA Bypass Attacks and Financial Cyber Fraud	1.00
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>66.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Portage	Matt Kelly	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>8.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Preble	Lavon Wright	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		1098	3/17/2023	SW District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language and Uniformity and Legislative Update	1.50
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1196	5/19/2023	SW District Mtg - Sen. Bob Hackett, Rep. Bernie Willis, Legislative Update	1.50
1199	10/20/2023	SW District Mtg - Ohio Chief Justice Kennedy, Rep. Tom Hall	1.50
1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
1203	9/22/2023	SW District Mtg - LIHTC Update, Sen. Terry Johnson, County Abstracts	2.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1313	3/15/2024	SW District Meeting - Real Estate Assessment Fund, Special Assessments, Legislative Update	2.00

**Total Hours: 41.00**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Putnam	Robert L. Benroth	1078	5/9/2023	**Sunshine Law Training	3.00
		1091	8/1/2023	How to Respond to Employee Leave Requests and "Playing Nice" with Others in the Workplace	2.00
		1099	3/24/2023	NW District Meeting - Courthouse K9 Unit Demonstration	1.00
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1129	12/1/2023	2023 Education Day: Human Resources, Info Security, Ethics and Security	1.33
		1189	4/28/2023	NW District Mtg - BORs - BTA - HB126	1.00
		1205	7/28/2023	NW District Mtg - Four Flags fo Freedom, Legislative Update	1.00
		1207	10/9/2023	UBC Conference	6.00
		1218	1/23/2024	BAI Learning Manager: Cybercrime, Ethics, Compliance, Community & Information Security	3.50
		1219	1/31/2024	1031 Tax Deferred Exchange	3.00
		1333	3/22/2024	NW District Meeting - Budget Commission	1.00

**Total Hours: 28.83**

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Richland	Patrick W. Dropsey	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		1079	5/25/2023	Intro to Data Protection	0.50
		1080	6/2/2023	Jasper the Disaster in Workplace Security	0.50
		1081	6/2/2023	Restricted Intelligence Auditor Season 4	0.50
		1082	8/30/2023	Putting Data Protection Into Practice	0.25
		1083	9/20/2023	10 Ways to Avoid Phishing Scams	0.13
		1084	10/10/2023	Employee Leave Requests	2.00
		1085	10/16/2023	2023 Your Role: Internet Security and You	0.25
		1086	3/21/2023	Ransomware Foundations	0.50
		1087	4/21/2023	Data Privacy Basics	0.50
		1155	12/7/2023	Know B4 Security Awareness Training	0.50
		1156	1/11/2024	AI Chatbots: Understanding Their Use	0.25
		1157	12/7/2023	QR Codes: Safe Scanning	0.10
		1158	2/2/2024	Anti Phishing Essentials	0.10
		1265	3/8/2024	**Sunshine Law Training	3.00
		1266	3/8/2024	*Ohio Ethics Law 2024: 50 Years of Promoting Governmental Ethics	1.00
		1267	3/8/2024	Links & Attachments: Think Before You Click	0.17
		1329	4/25/2024	2024 Kevin Mitnick Security Awareness Training	0.25
<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>18.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>		
Ross	Jeff Lehner	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00		
		1143	4/11/2023	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00		
		1252	10/24/2023	How to Respond to Employee Leave Request and Playing Nice With Others in the Workplace	2.00		
		1253	7/31/2023	On-site Budget Training	1.50		
		1254	7/31/2023	On-Site Budget Commission Training	1.50		
		1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00		
		1290	7/31/2023	On Site Budget and Budget Commission Training	1.50		
		1291	7/31/2023	On Site Real Estate Operations Training	1.50		
		<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>20.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Sandusky	Jerri A. Miller	984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1099	3/24/2023	NW District Meeting - Courthouse K9 Unit Demonstration	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1114	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Medium	1.00
1179	10/11/2023	36th Ohio GFOA Annual Conference and Membership Meeting	18.00
1194	5/19/2023	*NW District Mtg - Ethics Commission Susan Willeke	1.00
1197	10/27/2023	NW District Mtg - Artificial Intelligence	1.00
1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
1205	7/28/2023	NW District Mtg - Four Flags fo Freedom, Legislative Update	1.00
1208	8/25/2023	NW District Mtg - LogistiQ Update, Coach Legando, Prepration of Value Abstracts, Legislative Update	1.50
1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1331	4/26/2024	NW District Meeting - Toledo Metroparks Update, Port Authority Update and Legislative Report	1.50
1333	3/22/2024	NW District Meeting - Budget Commission	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>58.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Scioto	David L. Green	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1191	4/14/2023	SE District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language, BOR Season, Legislative Update	1.50
1193	7/14/2023	SE District Mtg - Cyber Security, Parcel Mapping, Legislative Update	2.00
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>36.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Seneca	Julie A. Adkins	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1122	11/3/2023	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
1186	1/9/2024	Protection From Ransomware and Phishing Attacks	1.00
1189	4/28/2023	NW District Mtg - BORs - BTA - HB126	1.00
1194	5/19/2023	*NW District Mtg - Ethics Commission Susan Willeke	1.00
1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
1205	7/28/2023	NW District Mtg - Four Flags fo Freedom, Legislative Update	1.00
1208	8/25/2023	NW District Mtg - LogistiQ Update, Coach Legando, Prepration of Value Abstracts, Legislative Update	1.50
1215	10/18/2023	CORSA - Employee Leave Requests	2.00
1216	10/11/2023	Ohio GFOA 36th Annual Conference and Membership Meeting	16.80
1260	9/22/2023	NW District Mtg - Partnership with Regional Planning, Legislative Update	1.00
1263	2/21/2024	2024 FMLA 101	1.00
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1316	5/1/2024	Securing Our Cities: Preventing MFA Bypass Attacks and Financial Cyber Fraud	1.00
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>88.55</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Shelby	Amy L. Berning	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
1098	3/17/2023	SW District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language and Uniformity and Legislative Update	1.50
1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1113	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Small	1.00
1199	10/20/2023	SW District Mtg - Ohio Chief Justice Kennedy, Rep. Tom Hall	1.50
1203	9/22/2023	SW District Mtg - LIHTC Update, Sen. Terry Johnson, County Abstracts	2.00
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1313	3/15/2024	SW District Meeting - Real Estate Assessment Fund, Special Assessments, Legislative Update	2.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>49.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Stark	Alan Harold	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
1096	9/8/2023	NE District Meeting - McKinley Monument	1.50
1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>30.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Summit	Kristen M. Scalise, CPA, CFE	998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		1088	9/27/2023	Privacy and the Fraud Examiner	4.00
		1089	7/24/2023	**Records Management	3.00
		1090	7/24/2023	Accounting Ethics: Understanding Unethical Behaviors	4.00
		1130	9/25/2023	Auditing for Vendor Fraud	4.00
		1138	8/3/2023	Financial Forecasting and Modeling	5.00
		1139	9/6/2023	Ten Infamous Fraud Cases of the 21st Century	4.00
		1140	11/20/2023	Treasurer's Guidebook	16.00
		1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
		1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
		1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
		1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>45.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Trumbull	Martha Yoder	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
1096	9/8/2023	NE District Meeting - McKinley Monument	1.50
1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1115	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Large	1.00
1204	8/4/2023	NE District Mtg - Soil & Water Update, CAUV Update, The Honorable Sandra O'Brien, Legislative Update	2.00
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00

**Total Hours: 43.50**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Tuscarawas	Larry Lindberg	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1114	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Medium	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1330	4/3/2024	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>34.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Union	Andrea L. Weaver	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
1093	5/23/2023	*22nd Annual Emerging Trends in Fraud Investigation and Prevention Conference	1.20
1094	5/22/2023	22nd Annual Emerging Trends in Fraud Investigation and Prevention Conference	14.90
1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
1098	3/17/2023	SW District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language and Uniformity and Legislative Update	1.50
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1199	10/20/2023	SW District Mtg - Ohio Chief Justice Kennedy, Rep. Tom Hall	1.50
1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
1203	9/22/2023	SW District Mtg - LIHTC Update, Sen. Terry Johnson, County Abstracts	2.00
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1313	3/15/2024	SW District Meeting - Real Estate Assessment Fund, Special Assessments, Legislative Update	2.00
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00

**Total Hours: 77.10**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Van Wert	Jami Bradford	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1113	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Small	1.00
1189	4/28/2023	NW District Mtg - BORs - BTA - HB126	1.00
1194	5/19/2023	*NW District Mtg - Ethics Commission Susan Willeke	1.00
1197	10/27/2023	NW District Mtg - Artificial Intelligence	1.00
1205	7/28/2023	NW District Mtg - Four Flags fo Freedom, Legislative Update	1.00
1260	9/22/2023	NW District Mtg - Partnership with Regional Planning, Legislative Update	1.00
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00

**Total Hours: 50.50**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Vinton	Cindy Waugh	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1113	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Small	1.00
1180	10/13/2023	*Ethical Intelligence	2.00
1191	4/14/2023	SE District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language, BOR Season, Legislative Update	1.50
1193	7/14/2023	SE District Mtg - Cyber Security, Parcel Mapping, Legislative Update	2.00
1198	9/8/2023	SE District Mtg - Abstract of Real Property and Legislative Update	1.50
1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
1261	10/11/2023	Ohio GFOA 36th Annual Conference and Membership Meeting	19.00
1269	1/12/2024	SE District Mtg - Special Assessment and Legislative Updated	1.50
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>80.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Warren	Matt Nolan	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1137	11/14/2023	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
1203	9/22/2023	SW District Mtg - LIHTC Update, Sen. Terry Johnson, County Abstracts	2.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1313	3/15/2024	SW District Meeting - Real Estate Assessment Fund, Special Assessments, Legislative Update	2.00
1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>34.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Washington	Matthew Livengood	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1114	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Medium	1.00
1188	10/13/2023	SE District Mtg - Performance Audits: Bond Levy Millage Calculation, Legislative Update	2.00
1191	4/14/2023	SE District Mtg - HB140 Ballot Language, BOR Season, Legislative Update	1.50
1198	9/8/2023	SE District Mtg - Abstract of Real Property and Legislative Update	1.50
1269	1/12/2024	SE District Mtg - Special Assessment and Legislative Updated	1.50
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1302	4/12/2024	Southeast District Meeting - REA Fund, Legislative Update, Roundtable	1.50
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>53.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Wayne	Jarra L. Underwood	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
1096	9/8/2023	NE District Meeting - McKinley Monument	1.50
1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1114	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Medium	1.00
1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>53.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Williams	Vickie L Grimm	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1189	4/28/2023	NW District Mtg - BORs - BTA - HB126	1.00
1205	7/28/2023	NW District Mtg - Four Flags fo Freedom, Legislative Update	1.00
1208	8/25/2023	NW District Mtg - LogistiQ Update, Coach Legando, Prepration of Value Abstracts, Legislative Update	1.50
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>28.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Wood	Matthew R. Oestreich	983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal Emergency and Qualifying	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		996	6/8/2023	CAUV & Certified Forestry	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
		1099	3/24/2023	NW District Meeting - Courthouse K9 Unit Demonstration	1.00
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25
		1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
		1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
		1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
		1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
		1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1114	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Medium	1.00
1189	4/28/2023	NW District Mtg - BORs - BTA - HB126	1.00
1194	5/19/2023	*NW District Mtg - Ethics Commission Susan Willeke	1.00
1197	10/27/2023	NW District Mtg - Artificial Intelligence	1.00
1205	7/28/2023	NW District Mtg - Four Flags fo Freedom, Legislative Update	1.00
1208	8/25/2023	NW District Mtg - LogistiQ Update, Coach Legando, Prepration of Value Abstracts, Legislative Update	1.50
1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1331	4/26/2024	NW District Meeting - Toledo Metroparks Update, Port Authority Update and Legislative Report	1.50
1333	3/22/2024	NW District Meeting - Budget Commission	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>46.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Wyandot	George W. Kitzler	982	4/5/2023	New Auditor/Mentor Education Day	8.00
		983	6/6/2023	Weights & Measures	1.00
		984	6/6/2023	Generational Differences in the Workplace	1.00
		985	6/7/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		986	6/7/2023	IRS Rules: Fringe Benefits and Employee or Independent Contractor	1.00
		987	6/7/2023	Government Finance	1.00
		988	6/7/2023	Fraud in Government Case Study: Vinton County/Township	1.50
		989	6/7/2023	Budget Commission	1.00
		990	6/7/2023	Payroll	1.00
		991	6/8/2023	Components of Reassessment	1.00
		992	6/8/2023	Informal Reviews and BORs using Technology	1.00
		993	6/8/2023	10 Mill Limitation 20 Mill Floor Tax Rates Reduction Factors	1.00
		994	6/8/2023	Certifying Levies Replacement Renewal	1.00
		995	6/8/2023	Emergency and Qualifying Homestead Owner Occupancy and How to Spread the Word	0.50
		997	6/8/2023	Breakout Sessions	0.75
		998	6/9/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
		999	6/9/2023	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health in the Legal Profession	1.00
		1095	9/19/2023	AGA Central Ohio 2023 Professional Development Training Fall Event	16.00
		1097	4/26/2023	CAAO Legislative Day	5.50
		1099	3/24/2023	NW District Meeting - Courthouse K9 Unit Demonstration	1.00
		1100	11/15/2023	Nurturing Mental Health	1.00
		1101	11/15/2023	Ohio Dept. of Taxation Update	1.25

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1102	11/15/2023	Solar and Wind Tax Issues	1.00
1103	11/15/2023	Ohio Department of Natural Resources Update, Jeremy Scherf	0.75
1104	11/15/2023	Basics to Detail Explanation: Reduction Factors and Real Estate Value Increase	1.00
1105	11/15/2023	BORBTA: Preparing Appraisal Reports, Defending Values, Analysis of Complainants Documents	1.00
1106	11/16/2023	Auditor of State Bulletins, Common Citations, Finding Info on the OCS	1.00
1107	11/16/2023	ODJFS: Unemployment Fraud	1.00
1108	11/16/2023	OPERS: Reporting and Other Items of Importance	1.00
1109	11/16/2023	Cyber Security, CORSA Security	0.75
1110	11/16/2023	Dealing with Difficult Employees	1.00
1111	11/17/2023	Legislative Update	1.00
1112	11/17/2023	**Country Government Records	1.00
1113	11/17/2023	Breakout Sessions Small	1.00
1189	4/28/2023	NW District Mtg - BORs - BTA - HB126	1.00
1194	5/19/2023	*NW District Mtg - Ethics Commission Susan Willeke	1.00
1197	10/27/2023	NW District Mtg - Artificial Intelligence	1.00
1201	2/7/2024	CAAO Leadership Summit	5.75
1205	7/28/2023	NW District Mtg - Four Flags fo Freedom, Legislative Update	1.00
1208	8/25/2023	NW District Mtg - LogistiQ Update, Coach Legando, Prepration of Value Abstracts, Legislative Update	1.50
1213	8/24/2023	Vision 2023: Transforming Ohio Through Technology	3.00
1260	9/22/2023	NW District Mtg - Partnership with Regional Planning, Legislative Update	1.00
1278	4/6/2023	April Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1281	7/6/2023	July Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1293	8/3/2023	August Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1294	10/5/2023	October Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1295	6/6/2023	CAAO Business Meeting	1.00
1296	9/7/2023	September CAAO Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1297	1/4/2024	January Executive and Legislative Committee Meeting 2024	1.00
1298	2/2/2024	February 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1299	3/7/2024	March 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1316	5/1/2024	Securing Our Cities: Preventing MFA Bypass Attacks and Financial Cyber Fraud	1.00
1331	4/26/2024	NW District Meeting - Toledo Metroparks Update, Port Authority Update and Legislative Report	1.50
1333	3/22/2024	NW District Meeting - Budget Commission	1.00
1334	4/4/2024	April 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1335	5/2/2024	May 2024 Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>89.75</b>

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

NOTE: The 2019-2022 course work information on this "**Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report**" (pages 77-215) is the same information that is in the links for the March 31, 2022 and the January 3, 2023 status reports, however we did not confirm that the course work information appearing in this file for 2019-2022 is a complete representation of the information in the previous two status reports. Auditors using this file to determine continuing education compliance for 2019-2022 should also refer to those previous reports first if they note any issues with not having sufficient course work for that time frame.

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Adams	David Gifford	1	3/15/2019	Downtown Redevelopment Districts	0.50
		32	5/17/2019	Ohio Auditor of State	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
		65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
		105	9/20/2019	Ohio Weights & Measures Update	0.75
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
		162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
		163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
		175	1/17/2020	Proposed Solar Farms & Update from State Reps.	1.00
		261	9/18/2020	Drone Technology	1.00
		305	6/1/2020	Managing Federal Funds for COVID 19	1.00
		390	1/15/2021	Senate President Huffman; Legislative Update	1.50
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
		500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
		513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
		563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
		564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
		565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
		566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
		567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
		568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
		569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
		570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
		571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
		572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
		573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
		608	9/17/2021	Representative Creech / Legislative Update	1.00
		635	10/15/2021	*Star House Rehab Facility	1.00

\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tifs, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
844	9/9/2022	**Ohio Public Records Training	3.00
873	9/16/2022	Representative Adam Bird; Judge Byrne-Ohio 12th Dst. Court of Appeals; Legislative Update	1.00
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
1206	1/20/2023	SW District Mtg - U-Turn, Recovery Docket, Clinton County Common Pleas, Legislative Update	1.50
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>113.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Allen	Rachael S. Gilroy	5	3/22/2019	AOS Update & Sheriff K-9 Unit	1.50
		23	5/9/2019	Emerging Trends in Fraud Investigation	16.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
70	7/24/2019	Protection from Ransomware & Phishing	1.00
71	7/24/2019	Computer Security Basics	1.00
73	7/26/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
82	8/8/2019	Advanced Accounting Seminar	13.00
115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
130	10/21/2019	Ohio Pooled Collateral System	0.75
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
216	4/13/2020	County Auditor Roundtable Discussion	1.00
217	4/17/2020	Reforecasting Budgets in Uncertain Times	1.00
219	4/23/2020	Navigating Unemployment Ins during COVID 19	1.00
222	4/24/2020	COVID Economic Recovery	1.00
452	2/26/2021	Automated Data Synchronization To/From CAMA / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
519	4/13/2021	Local Government Officials Conference	5.75
528	4/29/2021	American Rescue Plan Act Guidance/Local Government Update	1.00
532	5/10/2021	House Speaker Cupp/Senate President Huffman	1.50
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
600	8/19/2021	**Ohio Public Records	3.00
759	4/22/2022	GIS-Not Just Nosey Neighbors; Time Travel with GIS	1.00
760	4/28/2022	Ohio Land Bank Association Conference	8.00
780	5/16/2022	2022 Tyler Connect Conference	13.25
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tifs, Oh My!	1.50
869	9/23/2022	The 20-mil Floor & Inside Millage Shift; Legislative Update	1.00
872	9/27/2022	Dealing with Angry Employees - Course #HUMR122	1.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>138.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Ashland	Cindy Funk	24	5/10/2019	Ohio Forest Tax Law	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
		65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
		77	8/2/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
		214	3/6/2020	Local Government Funds	1.00
		216	4/13/2020	County Auditor Roundtable Discussion	1.00
		217	4/17/2020	Reforecasting Budgets in Uncertain Times	1.00
		223	3/20/2020	Frequently Asked Employer Questions	2.00
		262	8/21/2020	HB481 - Cares Act; HB485; Legislative	1.00
		265	10/2/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00
		433	2/5/2021	NE District Mtg-County Dog Warden & Their Responsibilities	1.00
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
		500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
		513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
		516	4/2/2021	School Report Card Reform Legislation {Rep. Don Jones}; Legislative Update	1.50
		517	4/9/2021	Representative Stephens; Legislative Update	1.00
		533	5/6/2021	**Ohio Public Records Training	3.00
		597	8/6/2021	Senator Hoagland; Legislative Update	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

616	10/1/2021	*Current Drug Trend; COVID Impact on Drug Use; Drug Dog Demo	1.00
617	10/1/2021	Active Shooter: How to React in a Crisis Situation	1.00
618	10/1/2021	COVID in Terms of Stress & Our Mental Health	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
738	4/1/2022	Western Reserve Land Conservancy; ODA Update; Legislative Update	1.00
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption-Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
824	8/5/2022	Drone Use in Law Enforcement; Special Assessments; Property Transfers; Delinquent Tax	2.50
854	9/9/2022	Tax Lien Foreclosures; State Forefeitures; Outreach to Tax Delinquent Property Owners	1.50
907	3/4/2022	Muskingum Watershed Conservancy District; Voucher Issues; ODNR Presentation	2.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
1200	3/10/2023	NE District Mtg - ODT Tax Commissioner, Weights & Measures Update, GIS Update	2.00
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00

**Total Hours: 97.00**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Ashtabula	David Thomas	49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
77	8/2/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
214	3/6/2020	Local Government Funds	1.00
262	8/21/2020	HB481 - Cares Act; HB485; Legislative	1.00
265	10/2/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00
266	10/16/2020	Montgomery County Land Bank	1.00
433	2/5/2021	NE District Mtg-County Dog Warden & Their Responsibilities	1.00
454	3/5/2021	Fee Exempt Conveyances / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
516	4/2/2021	School Report Card Reform Legislation {Rep. Don Jones}; Legislative Update	1.50
616	10/1/2021	*Current Drug Trend; COVID Impact on Drug Use; Drug Dog Demo	1.00
617	10/1/2021	Active Shooter: How to React in a Crisis Situation	1.00
618	10/1/2021	COVID in Terms of Stress & Our Mental Health	1.00
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
712	1/21/2022	Improve Your Federal Policies & Remain in Compliance; Legislative Update	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

713	2/4/2022	Current Residential Valuations in NE District; Legislative Update; AOS Keith Faber	1.50
738	4/1/2022	Western Reserve Land Conservancy; ODA Update; Legislative Update	1.00
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption-Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
824	8/5/2022	Drone Use in Law Enforcement; Special Assessments; Property Transfers; Delinquent Tax	2.50
854	9/9/2022	Tax Lien Foreclosures; State Forefeitures; Outreach to Tax Delinquent Property Owners	1.50
880	10/7/2022	Ashtabula County Port Authority; Legislative Update	1.00
895	10/25/2022	**Certified Public Records Training	3.00
902	10/20/2022	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
907	3/4/2022	Muskingum Watershed Conservancy District; Voucher Issues; ODNR Presentation	2.00
909	9/23/2022	Sexual Harassment for Managers	2.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
1116	2/22/2023	Investment and Financing Update for 2023	1.20
1200	3/10/2023	NE District Mtg - ODT Tax Commissioner, Weights & Measures Update, GIS Update	2.00
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00

**Total Hours: 118.70**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Athens	Jill A. Davidson	2	3/20/2019	Planning - Foundation of Appraisal Activity	7.00
		23	5/9/2019	Emerging Trends in Fraud Investigation	16.00
		80	7/2/2019	Protection from Ransomware & Phishing	1.00
		87	8/14/2019	2019 Personnel Training	2.00
		88	8/15/2019	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		106	9/20/2019	Ohio GFOA 2019 Conference	15.10

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
174	1/10/2020	Update from State Representative Stephens	1.25
185	1/28/2020	Social Media: Records Management Challenge	1.00
215	3/13/2020	COVID 19 by Rick Hoffman	1.00
216	4/13/2020	County Auditor Roundtable Discussion	1.00
217	4/17/2020	Reforecasting Budgets in Uncertain Times	1.00
219	4/23/2020	Navigating Unemployment Ins during COVID 19	1.00
220	4/30/2020	Next Step for Employers	1.00
221	4/30/2020	U.S. Public Financial Markets Update	1.00
240	7/16/2020	*Ohio Ethics Law 20/20	1.00
248	6/11/2020	Map a Course through Crisis	1.00
251	9/16/2020	OH GFOA Virt. Annual Conference/Meeting	11.80
260	9/25/2020	HB481 - Local Government Cares Act	1.00
263	8/14/2020	History of the Local Government Fund: Cares Act	1.50
266	10/16/2020	Montgomery County Land Bank	1.00
267	10/30/2020	Abstracts Roundtable	1.00
277	9/16/2020	*Ethics in the Real World	3.00
279	5/14/2020	US Public Financial Markets Update	1.00
280	6/5/2020	Understanding the Federal Cares Act	1.00
281	5/24/2020	Coronavirus Relief Fund Local Assistance	1.00
282	8/5/2020	Impact of OH Dpt. of Health Travel Advisory	1.00
283	8/14/2020	The Resilient Women in Public Finance	1.00
284	8/17/2020	Learn How to Use Cares Acts Funds	1.00
285	8/21/2020	How Counties are using Cares Act Dollars - Fairfield/Richland	1.00
286	9/18/2020	S & P Global Ratings: Shape of Recovery	1.00
287	9/24/2020	COVID-19 & Impact on Single Audits	1.00
288	9/25/2020	Subgranting of Cares Act Funding	1.00
289	10/1/2020	Auditing of Cares Act Funding	1.00
312	12/11/2020	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
389	1/8/2021	Special/Delinquent Assessments/Legislative Update	1.50
433	2/5/2021	NE District Mtg-County Dog Warden & Their Responsibilities	1.00
435	10/7/2020	Defensive Driving Refresher Webinar	2.00
436	10/15/2020	Managing Employees During a Crisis	2.00
437	10/15/2020	U.S. Public Finance Market Updates	1.00
438	10/29/2020	Ohio Public Finance Credits in the Wake of Coronavirus	1.00
439	12/17/2020	Annual Economic & Financial Markets Webinar	1.00
440	1/14/2021	2021 Southeast Local-Regional Finance Summit	1.50
441	1/20/2021	Follow the Money: Fighting Fraud / Unemployment Insurance System-During COVID- 19	1.00
442	1/21/2021	Leverage Digital Marketing Virtual Training	1.00
443	1/29/2021	Best Practices for Securing Your Zoom Meetings	1.00
452	2/26/2021	Automated Data Synchronization To/From CAMA / Legislative Update	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
501	2/12/2021	Zoom: Back to Basics	1.00
502	2/24/2021	Lessons Learned on Remote Work	1.00
503	3/11/2021	NACo National Membership Call {State/Local CRF Funds}; {Part of American Rescue Plan Act}	0.50
504	3/17/2021	Cryptocurrency: So What's the Big Deal?	1.00
505	3/19/2021	Celebrating Women 2021	6.00
508	3/30/2021	Maximizing the Impact of American Rescue Plan: Planning Tools/Emerging Best Practices	1.00
516	4/2/2021	School Report Card Reform Legislation {Rep. Don Jones}; Legislative Update	1.50
517	4/9/2021	Representative Stephens; Legislative Update	1.00
519	4/13/2021	Local Government Officials Conference	10.75
537	5/13/2021	State & Local Fiscal Recovery Program	0.50
544	5/17/2021	20th Annual Emerging Trends in Fraud Investigation & Prevention Conference	16.00
545	5/19/2021	What You Need to Know About American Rescue Plan Act	1.00
555	6/24/2021	OBM Local Government Update ARPA	1.00
557	6/24/2021	SLFRF Reporting-#1-Counties w/pop Below 250,000	1.00
558	6/24/2021	Alternative Energy Zone Tax Exemptions for Wind & Solar Projects	1.00
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
578	5/20/2021	Practical Ideas for ARPA Implementation	1.00
579	5/25/2021	NACo National Membership Call-US Department of Treasury	0.50
580	6/9/2021	Ohio's 2021 Biennial Budget	1.80
581	6/10/2021	Session #3: Recognize Monitoring & Compliance Needs for ARPA Funds	1.00
582	6/23/2021	Athens County Human Resources Training	2.00
614	9/22/2021	Ohio GFOA 34th Annual Conference	15.40
630	9/29/2021	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
662	8/3/2021	Understanding Eligible Uses of the Fiscal Recovery Fund: Broadband Infrastructure	1.00
663	8/10/2021	CSLFRF Compliance & Reporting Guidance	1.00
664	8/11/2021	SLFRF Recovery Plan Reporting: Evidence-based Interventions/Project Evaluations	1.00
665	8/12/2021	Intro to ARPA for Water Bill Assistance & Projects	1.25
666	9/16/2021	Women in Leadership: Sports	1.00
667	9/28/2021	How Tech is Helping Local Government Do More With Less	2.50
668	10/8/2021	Are You Paid What You Are Worth?	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

669	10/12/2021	ARPA Funds: Non-Entitlement Units	1.00
670	10/15/2021	Ohio SE ED Now {Also 10/29/2021}	3.00
675	10/29/2021	Ohio SE ED Now - 3 of 4	1.50
676	11/12/2021	Ohio SE ED Now - 4 of 4	1.50
677	11/16/2021	ARPA Funds: Non-Entitlement Units	1.00
678	12/7/2021	2nd Annual Ohio Grants Summit	6.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
701	1/10/2022	State & Local Fiscal Recovery Funds: Final Rule: Non-tribal Recipient Briefing	1.00
710	1/24/2022	State & Local Recovery Funds Update	1.00
713	2/4/2022	Current Residential Valuations in NE District; Legislative Update; AOS Keith Faber	1.50
720	1/6/2022	US State & Local Gov't 2022 Sector Outlook	1.00
721	1/18/2022	NACo Central Region Meeting-January 2022	0.50
722	1/20/2022	Information Session-Final Rule for ARPA Fiscal Recovery Fund: Broadband Infrastructure	0.75
723	1/21/2022	Building Opportunities Beyond Coal Accelerating Transition Network	1.50
724	2/16/2022	Two-for-One Hot Topics	1.50
725	2/17/2022	Lunch & Learn: Hiring & Retaining Great Employees	1.00
726	2/24/2022	Russia-Ukraine: The Impact on the Global Economy	1.00
740	4/12/2022	*The Ohio Ethics Law: Watching Our Step	1.00
743	4/13/2022	2022 Local Government Officials Conference	10.50
755	4/21/2022	*The Ohio Ethics Law: A Deeper Study	1.00
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption-Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
777	5/16/2022	ACFE 21st Annual Emerging Trends in Fraud Investigation/Protection Conference	16.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
855	6/22/2022	2022 Regional Roundtable: Dollars & Sense	3.00
856	6/13/2022	CORSA HR Training	2.00
857	7/14/2022	Managing Up - WPF	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

858	7/16/2022	Win'ing Conversations - Work-Life Balance	1.00
859	8/23/2022	Europe's Next Recession	1.00
888	10/14/2022	Update on HB 126; Legislative Update	1.50
900	10/5/2022	Ohio GFOA 35th Annual Conference (Oct 5-7)	16.80
907	3/4/2022	Muskingum Watershed Conservancy District; Voucher Issues; ODNR Presentation	2.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
1190	1/13/2023	SE District Mtg - Certificate of Transition, Trees to Textbook, Ohio Forest Law, Legislative Update	2.00
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>344.15</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Auglaize	Linda Bice	15	4/23/2019	**Sunshine Law Training	3.00
		76	8/5/2019	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
		162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
		163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
		216	4/13/2020	County Auditor Roundtable Discussion	1.00
		219	4/23/2020	Navigating Unemplymnt Ins during COVID 19	1.00
		226	4/17/2020	Layoffs & Furloughs under Civil Service Law	1.50
		234	4/3/2020	Ethics of Working from Home	1.00
		235	4/24/2020	PERS Healthcare	1.00
		260	9/25/2020	HB481 - Local Government Cares Act	1.00
		261	9/18/2020	Drone Technology	1.00
		263	8/14/2020	History of the Local Government Fund: Cares Act	1.50
		266	10/16/2020	Montgomery County Land Bank	1.00
		272	5/13/2020	Navigating Workplace Accomodations	1.00
		273	5/15/2020	COVID 19 Economic Webinar Series - County Models	1.00
		282	8/5/2020	Impact of OH Dpt. of Health Travel Advisory	1.00
		289	10/1/2020	Auditing of Cares Act Funding	1.00
		290	5/22/2020	How to use FEMA Public Assistance Funding	1.00
		291	8/21/2020	How Cntyys use Cares Act Dollars - Ottawa & Henry	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

292	8/27/2020	Environmental Regulation	1.00
293	10/29/2020	Social Security vs Medicare - Question	1.00
390	1/15/2021	Senate President Huffman; Legislative Update	1.50
433	2/5/2021	NE District Mtg-County Dog Warden & Their Responsibilities	1.00
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
635	10/15/2021	*Star House Rehab Facility	1.00
917	10/21/2022	Neil Armstrong Airport Improvements/History; Legislative Update	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
			<b>Total Hours: 62.25</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Belmont	Cindi Henry	563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
		564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
		565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
		566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
		567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
		568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
		569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
		570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
		571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
		573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
		577	4/13/2021	2021 Local Gov't Officials Conference	11.75
		671	11/23/2021	*The Ethics Law: Building a Culture of Integrity	1.00
		802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
		803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
		804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
		805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
		806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
		831	8/12/2022	CAUV Compliance; Muskingum Watershed Conservancy District	1.50
		947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
		948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
		949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00		
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50		
				<b>Total Hours: 35.25</b>	

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Brown	Jill A. Hall	1	3/15/2019	Downtown Redevelopment Districts	0.50
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
105	9/20/2019	Ohio Weights & Measures Update	0.75
117	10/2/2019	Cybersecurity	1.00
118	10/2/2019	CORSA Loss Control Services	1.00
131	10/25/2019	Ohio House Update - Representative Seitz	1.00
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
175	1/17/2020	Proposed Solar Farms & Update from State Reps.	1.00
223	3/20/2020	Frequently Asked Employer Questions	2.00
224	4/30/2020	Leading Re-Entry after COVID 19	1.00
261	9/18/2020	Drone Technology	1.00
272	5/13/2020	Navigating Workplace Accommodations	1.00
289	10/1/2020	Auditing of Cares Act Funding	1.00
291	8/21/2020	How Cntys use Cares Act Dollars - Ottawa & Henry	1.00
363	10/7/2020	CORSA-Loss Control to Avoid Employment Claims	2.00
390	1/15/2021	Senate President Huffman; Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
508	3/30/2021	Maximizing the Impact of American Rescue Plan: Planning Tools/Emerging Best Practices	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
519	4/13/2021	Local Government Officials Conference	6.00
524	4/16/2021	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
599	8/18/2021	Human Resources Training-Brown County	2.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

608	9/17/2021	Representative Creech / Legislative Update	1.00
613	10/6/2021	Utility Scale Solar Presentation	1.00
635	10/15/2021	*Star House Rehab Facility	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
712	1/21/2022	Improve Your Federal Policies & Remain in Compliance; Legislative Update	1.50
739	3/18/2022	Brownfield Redevelopment at It's Finest; Legislative Update	1.00
756	4/21/2022	Cybersecurity Threats to Public Entities; Defensive Driving Basics	2.00
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption-Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
873	9/16/2022	Representative Adam Bird; Judge Byrne-Ohio 12th Dst. Court of Appeals; Legislative Update	1.00
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50

**Total Hours: 128.75**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Butler	Nancy Nix	1	3/15/2019	Downtown Redevelopment Districts	0.50
		32	5/17/2019	Ohio Auditor of State	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
390	1/15/2021	Senate President Huffman; Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
608	9/17/2021	Representative Creech / Legislative Update	1.00
712	1/21/2022	Improve Your Federal Policies & Remain in Compliance; Legislative Update	1.50
739	3/18/2022	Brownfield Redevelopment at It's Finest; Legislative Update	1.00
890	10/21/2022	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>37.25</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Carroll	Lynn Fairclough	3	3/19/2019	Concepts in Records Management - Electronic Records	1.00
		24	5/10/2019	Ohio Forest Tax Law	1.00
		32	5/17/2019	Ohio Auditor of State	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
		77	8/2/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
		99	9/6/2019	*Lorain County Alcohol & Drug Services	1.00
		115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
		116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
		120	10/4/2019	Ransomware Attacks	2.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
214	3/6/2020	Local Government Funds	1.00
219	4/23/2020	Navigating Unemployment Ins during COVID 19	1.00
226	4/17/2020	Layoffs & Furloughs under Civil Service Law	1.00
262	8/21/2020	HB481 - Cares Act; HB485; Legislative	1.00
265	10/2/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00
312	12/11/2020	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
433	2/5/2021	NE District Mtg-County Dog Warden & Their Responsibilities	1.00
454	3/5/2021	Fee Exempt Conveyances / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
516	4/2/2021	School Report Card Reform Legislation {Rep. Don Jones}; Legislative Update	1.50
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
597	8/6/2021	Senator Hoagland; Legislative Update	1.00
616	10/1/2021	*Current Drug Trend; COVID Impact on Drug Use; Drug Dog Demo	1.00
617	10/1/2021	Active Shooter: How to React in a Crisis Situation	1.00
618	10/1/2021	COVID in Terms of Stress & Our Mental Health	1.00
661	10/19/2021	2021 CORSA/FDAR Human Resources Training-Carroll County	2.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
738	4/1/2022	Western Reserve Land Conservancy; ODA Update; Legislative Update	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tifs, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
824	8/5/2022	Drone Use in Law Enforcement; Special Assessments; Property Transfers; Delinquent Tax	2.50
826	8/11/2022	FMLA Training for Supervisors - Course #GNHR128	1.00
854	9/9/2022	Tax Lien Foreclosures; State Forefeitures; Outreach to Tax Delinquent Property Owners	1.50
880	10/7/2022	Ashtabula County Port Authority; Legislative Update	1.00
907	3/4/2022	Muskingum Watershed Conservancy District; Voucher Issues; ODNR Presentation	2.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
1200	3/10/2023	NE District Mtg - ODT Tax Commissioner, Weights & Measures Update, GIS Update	2.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>119.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Champaign	Karen T. Bailey	1	3/15/2019	Downtown Redevelopment Districts	0.50
		32	5/17/2019	Ohio Auditor of State	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		91	8/23/2019	Erie County Development Issues & Legislation	1.50
		106	9/20/2019	Ohio GFOA 2019 Conference	12.00
		131	10/25/2019	Ohio House Update - Representative Seitz	1.00
		143	11/13/2019	Ohio Virtual Tax Academy	3.00
		175	1/17/2020	Proposed Solar Farms & Update from State Reps.	1.00
		198	2/27/2020	*Ohio Ethics Law 20/20	1.00
		222	4/24/2020	COVID Economic Recovery	1.00
		226	4/17/2020	Layoffs & Furloughs under Civil Service Law	1.00
		251	9/16/2020	OH GFOA Virt. Annual Conference/Meeting	11.80
		252	8/11/2020	Using Data Analytics to Fight Fraud	4.20
		253	6/22/2020	31st Annual ACFE Global Fraud Conference	17.00
		261	9/18/2020	Drone Technology	1.00
		263	8/14/2020	History of the Local Government Fund: Cares Act	1.50
		266	10/16/2020	Montgomery County Land Bank	1.00
		448	2/10/2021	Budget Basics	1.80
		452	2/26/2021	Automated Data Synchronization To/From CAMA / Legislative Update	1.50
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
		588	3/31/2021	Mass Appraisal Practices & Procedures	30.00
		589	2/26/2021	Fundamentals of Mass Appraisal	30.00
		777	5/16/2022	ACFE 21st Annual Emerging Trends in Fraud Investigation/Protection Conference	16.00
		802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
		803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
884	3/8/2022	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00

**Total Hours: 157.55**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Clark	Hillary Hamilton	1	3/15/2019	Downtown Redevelopment Districts	0.50
		32	5/17/2019	Ohio Auditor of State	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
		105	9/20/2019	Ohio Weights & Measures Update	0.75
		131	10/25/2019	Ohio House Update - Representative Seitz	1.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
		175	1/17/2020	Proposed Solar Farms & Update from State Reps.	1.00
		261	9/18/2020	Drone Technology	1.00
		266	10/16/2020	Montgomery County Land Bank	1.00
		372	10/2/2020	CORSA Clark County Human Resources Training	1.00
		390	1/15/2021	Senate President Huffman; Legislative Update	1.50
		453	2/24/2021	**Ohio Sunshine Laws-Public Records	3.00
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
		500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
		513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
		563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
		564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
		565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
		566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
		567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
		568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
		569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
		570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
609	5/14/2021	Transportation Improvement Districts; Legislative Update	1.00
635	10/15/2021	*Star House Rehab Facility	1.00
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
712	1/21/2022	Improve Your Federal Policies & Remain in Compliance; Legislative Update	1.50
739	3/18/2022	Brownfield Redevelopment at It's Finest; Legislative Update	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tifs, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25
911	7/18/2022	Real Property Value Complaints; Board of Revision	7.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
955	12/6/2022	**Certified Public Records Training	3.00
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00

**Total Hours: 120.00**

**County                      Auditor                      Course #                      Date                      Course Title                      Hours**

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

Clermont	Linda L. Fraley	32	5/17/2019	Ohio Auditor of State	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		90	8/21/2019	Ohio Virtual Tax Academy	3.50
		105	9/20/2019	Ohio Weights & Measures Update	0.75
		131	10/25/2019	Ohio House Update - Representative Seitz	1.00
		132	10/14/2019	Partnership Accounting	1.00
		133	10/14/2019	TCJA: Guide to Small Business	5.00
		134	10/14/2019	Tax Basis of Assets	5.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		175	1/17/2020	Proposed Solar Farms & Update from State Reps.	1.00
		216	4/13/2020	County Auditor Roundtable Discussion	1.00
		226	4/17/2020	Layoffs & Furloughs under Civil Service Law	1.00
		236	4/15/2020	Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		241	1/13/2020	LLC or Corpotation	12.00
		242	1/14/2020	March/April 2019 CPA Voice	1.00
		243	1/16/2020	May/June 2019 CPA Voice	1.00
		244	1/21/2020	January/February 2019 CPA Voice	1.00
		245	4/29/2020	Management Services - COVID 19	1.10
		261	9/18/2020	Drone Technology	1.00
		266	10/16/2020	Montgomery County Land Bank	1.00
		328	4/6/2020	Corona Virus Tax Update	1.00
		345	8/11/2020	Accounting Controls	12.00
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
		513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
		524	4/16/2021	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
		575	4/27/2021	Making Tyler Hub Content Work For You-2021 Virtual Conference	1.00
		576	4/28/2021	2021 Tyler Connect Conference-IAAO Recertification	7.00
		593	8/5/2021	*Ohio Ethics Laws: A Deeper Study	1.00
		635	10/15/2021	*Star House Rehab Facility	1.00
		651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
		683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
		684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
		685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
		686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
		689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
		690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
		778	5/9/2022	HIPPA Privacy & Security Training	1.00
		794	5/15/2022	Property Data and Analytics	1.00
		802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
		803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
		804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
		805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
		806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tifs, Oh My!	1.50
		807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
		808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
		809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50		

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

822	8/3/2022	Accounting for COVID-19 & the Cares Act	4.00
823	8/3/2022	The Treatment of Virtual Currency	2.00
836	8/23/2022	Detecting Accounting Fraud Before It's too Late	8.00
838	8/24/2022	Individual Retirement Accounts	4.00
839	8/27/2022	Guide to Tax Resolution	6.00
873	9/16/2022	Representative Adam Bird; Judge Byrne-Ohio 12th Dst. Court of Appeals; Legislative Update	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>126.35</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Clinton	Terence G. Habermehl	32	5/17/2019	Ohio Auditor of State	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
		105	9/20/2019	Ohio Weights & Measures Update	0.75
		115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
		116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
		131	10/25/2019	Ohio House Update - Representative Seitz	1.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
		162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
		163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
		175	1/17/2020	Proposed Solar Farms & Update from State Reps.	1.00
		266	10/16/2020	Montgomery County Land Bank	1.00
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
		500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
		513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
		683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
		684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
		685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
		686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
		687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
		688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
		689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
		690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
		691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
		692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

712	1/21/2022	Improve Your Federal Policies & Remain in Compliance; Legislative Update	1.50
739	3/18/2022	Brownfield Redevelopment at It's Finest; Legislative Update	1.00
792	10/28/2021	**Public Records Training	3.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
873	9/16/2022	Representative Adam Bird; Judge Byrne-Ohio 12th Dst. Court of Appeals; Legislative Update	1.00
917	10/21/2022	Neil Armstrong Airport Improvements/History; Legislative Update	1.00
1206	1/20/2023	SW District Mtg - U-Turn, Recovery Docket, Clinton County Common Pleas, Legislative Update	1.50

**Total Hours: 74.00**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Columbiana	Nancy Milliken	24	5/10/2019	Ohio Forest Tax Law	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		77	8/2/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
		99	9/6/2019	*Lorain County Alcohol & Drug Services	1.00
		120	10/4/2019	Ransomware Attacks	2.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
		262	8/21/2020	HB481 - Cares Act; HB485; Legislative	1.00
		265	10/2/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00
		433	2/5/2021	NE District Mtg-County Dog Warden & Their Responsibilities	1.00
		454	3/5/2021	Fee Exempt Conveyances / Legislative Update	1.50
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
		513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
		519	4/13/2021	Local Government Officials Conference	11.75
		597	8/6/2021	Senator Hoagland; Legislative Update	1.00
		616	10/1/2021	*Current Drug Trend; COVID Impact on Drug Use; Drug Dog Demo	1.00
		617	10/1/2021	Active Shooter: How to React in a Crisis Situation	1.00
		684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
		685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
		686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
		687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
		688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
		689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
		738	4/1/2022	Western Reserve Land Conservancy; ODA Update; Legislative Update	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption- Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
824	8/5/2022	Drone Use in Law Enforcement; Special Assessments; Property Transfers; Delinquent Tax	2.50
885	6/16/2020	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
907	3/4/2022	Muskingum Watershed Conservancy District; Voucher Issues; ODNR Presentation	2.00
968	1/4/2023	*Ohio Ethics Laws 2022: Just the Facts	1.00
981	1/4/2023	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
1200	3/10/2023	NE District Mtg - ODT Tax Commissioner, Weights & Measures Update, GIS Update	2.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>67.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Coshocton	Grant K. Daugherty	49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
		65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
		77	8/2/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
		115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
		116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
		120	10/4/2019	Ransomware Attacks	2.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
		162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
		163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
		214	3/6/2020	Local Government Funds	1.00
		219	4/23/2020	Navigating Unemployment Ins during COVID 19	1.00
		223	3/20/2020	Frequently Asked Employer Questions	2.00
		262	8/21/2020	HB481 - Cares Act; HB485; Legislative	1.00
		265	10/2/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00
		433	2/5/2021	NE District Mtg-County Dog Warden & Their Responsibilities	1.00
		454	3/5/2021	Fee Exempt Conveyances / Legislative Update	1.50
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

490	3/10/2021	County Land Banks: Overview and Future Directions	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
516	4/2/2021	School Report Card Reform Legislation {Rep. Don Jones}; Legislative Update	1.50
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
597	8/6/2021	Senator Hoagland; Legislative Update	1.00
616	10/1/2021	*Current Drug Trend; COVID Impact on Drug Use; Drug Dog Demo	1.00
617	10/1/2021	Active Shooter: How to React in a Crisis Situation	1.00
618	10/1/2021	COVID in Terms of Stress & Our Mental Health	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
713	2/4/2022	Current Residential Valuations in NE District; Legislative Update; AOS Keith Faber	1.50
738	4/1/2022	Western Reserve Land Conservancy; ODA Update; Legislative Update	1.00
743	4/13/2022	2022 Local Government Officials Conference	5.25
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption-Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
897	3/8/2022	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
903	10/20/2022	How to Avoid Claims Based on HR Case Studies	2.00
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
1200	3/10/2023	NE District Mtg - ODT Tax Commissioner, Weights & Measures Update, GIS Update	2.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>132.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>		
Crawford	Robyn Sheets	683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00		
		684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50		
		685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00		
		686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50		
		687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00		
		688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50		
		689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00		
		690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75		
		691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00		
		692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50		
		734	3/25/2022	Picking Up the Pieces-Employee Mental Health; Legislative Update	1.00		
		759	4/22/2022	GIS-Not Just Nosey Neighbors; Time Travel with GIS	1.00		
		779	5/26/2022	Roundtable Discussion: Best Practice; Legislative Update	1.00		
		821	7/12/2022	**Certified Public Records Training	3.00		
		830	8/14/2022	*Ohio Ethics Laws 2022: Just the Facts	1.00		
		832	7/22/2022	Confessions of Fraudsters - AOS	1.50		
		840	8/26/2022	Energy, Utility & Local Government Policy	1.00		
		894	10/25/2022	*Opioids in the Workplace; Drug-free Workplace Programs-Policy	1.00		
		904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25		
		905	10/28/2022	Update on HB 377; Legislative Update	1.00		
		942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00		
		943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25		
		944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75		
		946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75		
		947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00		
		948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00		
		949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00		
		950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00		
		952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00		
		953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00		
		954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50		
		1192	2/24/2023	NW District Mtg - Media Training	1.00		
		<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>39.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Cuyahoga	Michael W. Chambers	61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

214	3/6/2020	Local Government Funds	1.00
251	9/16/2020	OH GFOA Virt. Annual Conference/Meeting	11.80
433	2/5/2021	NE District Mtg-County Dog Warden & Their Responsibilities	1.00
454	3/5/2021	Fee Exempt Conveyances / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
495	3/10/2021	Fundamentals of Debt Issuance	1.80
516	4/2/2021	School Report Card Reform Legislation {Rep. Don Jones}; Legislative Update	1.50
521	4/14/2021	Financial Report, Audit and Internal Control Basics	1.80
527	4/29/2021	Ohio GFOA - Tell the Story of Your Finances	1.20
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
614	9/22/2021	Ohio GFOA 34th Annual Conference	19.00
616	10/1/2021	*Current Drug Trend; COVID Impact on Drug Use; Drug Dog Demo	1.00
617	10/1/2021	Active Shooter: How to React in a Crisis Situation	1.00
618	10/1/2021	COVID in Terms of Stress & Our Mental Health	1.00
655	8/25/2021	GASB-87: Building an Action Plan for GASB-87 Compliance	1.80
656	10/26/2021	Highlights of Great Debt & Lease Management Practices	1.20
657	10/29/2021	*Fraud Detection/Prevention Tools & Techniques; OH Ethics Laws: Building a Culture of Integrity	3.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
700	12/7/2021	Ohio Grants Summit	5.50
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption-Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
774	4/13/2021	Ohio Recorders' Assoc. Spring Conference	4.00
775	9/16/2021	Ohio Recorders' Assoc. Fall Conference	4.00
776	11/15/2021	95th Annual Ohio Recorders' Assoc. Winter Conference	8.50
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tifs, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
824	8/5/2022	Drone Use in Law Enforcement; Special Assessments; Property Transfers; Delinquent Tax	2.50
854	9/9/2022	Tax Lien Foreclosures; State Forefeitures; Outreach to Tax Delinquent Property Owners	1.50
895	10/25/2022	**Certified Public Records Training	3.00
900	10/5/2022	Ohio GFOA 35th Annual Conference (Oct 5-7)	16.60
907	3/4/2022	Muskingum Watershed Conservancy District; Voucher Issues; ODNR Presentation	2.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
956	2/16/2022	Two-for-One Hot Topics	1.80
957	3/3/2022	Cybersecurity Summit	3.00
958	10/7/2022	GFOA-The Value of Values for Accountants	3.00
959	10/21/2022	3rd Annual MiniMuni Conference {10/20 - 10/21}	6.00
960	10/25/2022	GASB Updates: Understanding the Impact	1.00
961	10/26/2022	'City of Columbus' Digital Transformation Project: Lessons Learned	1.80
962	11/2/2022	2022 Single Audit & Compliance Supplement Update	2.00
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>177.05</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Darke	Carol A. Ginn	1	3/15/2019	Downtown Redevelopment Districts	0.50
		23	5/9/2019	Emerging Trends in Fraud Investigation	16.00
		30	5/15/2019	*Ohio Ethics Law Training	1.00
		32	5/17/2019	Ohio Auditor of State	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		105	9/20/2019	Ohio Weights & Measures Update	0.75
		106	9/20/2019	Ohio GFOA 2019 Conference	14.00
		107	9/11/2019	2019 IAAO Annual Conference	17.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
175	1/17/2020	Proposed Solar Farms & Update from State Reps.	1.00
217	4/17/2020	Reforecasting Budgets in Uncertain Times	1.00
226	4/17/2020	Layoffs & Furloughs under Civil Service Law	1.00
256	9/30/2020	Human Resources Training	2.25
265	10/2/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00
276	6/24/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide	1.50
280	6/5/2020	Understanding the Federal Cares Act	1.00
289	10/1/2020	Auditing of Cares Act Funding	1.00
291	8/21/2020	How Cntys use Cares Act Dollars - Ottawa & Henry	1.00
299	7/15/2020	COVID 19 Funding Impact on your Single Audit	1.00
300	7/22/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide Update HB 481	2.00
305	6/1/2020	Managing Federal Funds for COVID 19	1.00
308	7/14/2020	Retirement Plan Relief Under The Cares Act	1.00
309	6/19/2020	Southwest District Meeting	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
528	4/29/2021	American Rescue Plan Act Guidance/Local Government Update	1.00
533	5/6/2021	**Ohio Public Records Training	3.00
538	5/18/2021	Local Government Update: American Rescue Plan	1.00
539	3/11/2021	Coronavirus Rescue Bill	0.50
555	6/24/2021	OBM Local Government Update ARPA	1.00
556	6/25/2021	SLFRF Reporting-#2-Counties w/pop below 250,000-Received <\$5 mil.	1.00
609	5/14/2021	Transportation Improvement Districts; Legislative Update	1.00
635	10/15/2021	*Star House Rehab Facility	1.00
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
712	1/21/2022	Improve Your Federal Policies & Remain in Compliance; Legislative Update	1.50
739	3/18/2022	Brownfield Redevelopment at It's Finest; Legislative Update	1.00
770	5/16/2022	21st Annual Emerging Trends in Fraud Investigation & Prevention	16.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
900	10/5/2022	Ohio GFOA 35th Annual Conference (Oct 5-7)	16.60
917	10/21/2022	Neil Armstrong Airport Improvements/History; Legislative Update	1.00
1206	1/20/2023	SW District Mtg - U-Turn, Recovery Docket, Clinton County Common Pleas, Legislative Update	1.50
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>159.60</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Defiance	Jill R. Little	5	3/22/2019	AOS Update & Sheriff K-9 Unit	1.50
		17	4/26/2019	Outside Bank Accounts	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
		73	7/26/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
		130	10/21/2019	Ohio Pooled Collateral System	0.75
		138	9/13/2019	Assessment Administration	30.00
		139	11/6/2019	Standards of Professional Practice & Ethics	7.00
		140	6/26/2019	National USPAP Update Course	7.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
		162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
		163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
		260	9/25/2020	HB481 - Local Government Cares Act	1.00
		452	2/26/2021	Automated Data Synchronization To/From CAMA / Legislative Update	1.50
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
		513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

514	3/26/2021	Special Assessments; Creating the Tax Bill; Legislative Update	1.50
517	4/9/2021	Representative Stephens; Legislative Update	1.00
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
604	8/27/2021	AOS Keith Faber; Legislative Update; Tri Start Career Compact	1.00
610	9/1/2021	87th Annual Conference on Assessment Administration	13.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
727	2/25/2022	Your County's Social Media Presence; Legislative Update	1.00
735	3/29/2022	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
759	4/22/2022	GIS-Not Just Nosey Neighbors; Time Travel with GIS	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
869	9/23/2022	The 20-mil Floor & Inside Millage Shift; Legislative Update	1.00
905	10/28/2022	Update on HB 377; Legislative Update	1.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

953            11/18/2022    Legislative Update    1.00  
**Total Hours: 157.75**

<b>County</b>	<b>Auditor</b>	<b>Course #</b>	<b>Date</b>	<b>Course Title</b>	<b>Hours</b>
Delaware	George Kaitsa	21	5/3/2019	Bureau of Underground Storage Tank Regs	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
		65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
		79	9/8/2019	Technology for Weights & Measures Calculations	1.00
		115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
		116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
		142	6/13/2019	Land Records Modernization Conference	6.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
		162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
		163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
		174	1/10/2020	Update from State Representative Stephens	1.25
		215	3/13/2020	COVID 19 by Rick Hoffman	1.00
		263	8/14/2020	History of the Local Government Fund: Cares Act	1.50
		265	10/2/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00
		266	10/16/2020	Montgomery County Land Bank	1.00
		267	10/30/2020	Abstracts Roundtable	1.00
		365	11/19/2020	**Sunshine Laws Training-Ohio Public Records/Open Meetings	3.00
		389	1/8/2021	Special/Delinquent Assessments/Legislative Update	1.50
		452	2/26/2021	Automated Data Synchronization To/From CAMA / Legislative Update	1.50
		454	3/5/2021	Fee Exempt Conveyances / Legislative Update	1.50
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
		513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
		554	6/22/2021	Land Records Modernization Conference 2021	6.00
		563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
		564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
		565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
590	8/10/2021	Governmental Auditing	2.00
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
654	10/8/2021	Legislative Update; Informational Session w/CAAO Bsn Partners	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
700	12/7/2021	Ohio Grants Summit	6.50
728	3/8/2022	Ohio Compliance Supplement Update	2.00
738	4/1/2022	Western Reserve Land Conservancy; ODA Update; Legislative Update	1.00
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption-Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
911	7/18/2022	Real Property Value Complaints; Board of Revision	7.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
1200	3/10/2023	NE District Mtg - ODT Tax Commissioner, Weights & Measures Update, GIS Update	2.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>150.25</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Erie	Rick Jeffrey	5	3/22/2019	AOS Update & Sheriff K-9 Unit	1.50
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		73	7/26/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
		91	8/23/2019	Erie County Development Issues & Legislation	1.50
		128	10/18/2019	Deed and Conveyance Workshop	7.00
		130	10/21/2019	Ohio Pooled Collateral System	0.75
		137	9/25/2019	2019 Ohio GIS Conference	7.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
		162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
		163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
		172	12/9/2019	Concepts in Records Management	1.00
		205	2/28/2020	Fulton County Health Center & Legislation	1.00
		216	4/13/2020	County Auditor Roundtable Discussion	1.00
		219	4/23/2020	Navigating Unemplymnt Ins during COVID 19	1.00
		225	4/14/2020	Understanding Liabilities & Employment Regs	1.00
		226	4/17/2020	Layoffs & Furloughs under Civil Service Law	1.00
		452	2/26/2021	Automated Data Synchronization To/From CAMA / Legislative Update	1.50
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
		513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
		514	3/26/2021	Special Assessments; Creating the Tax Bill; Legislative Update	1.50
		529	4/23/2021	Enhanced 911 Update; Legislative Update	1.00
		532	5/10/2021	House Speaker Cupp/Senate President Huffman	1.50
		533	5/6/2021	**Ohio Public Records Training	3.00
		651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
		683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
		689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
		690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
727	2/25/2022	Your County's Social Media Presence; Legislative Update	1.00
779	5/26/2022	Roundtable Discussion: Best Practice; Legislative Update	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
840	8/26/2022	Energy, Utility & Local Government Policy	1.00
862	9/20/2022	2022 GIS Conference	5.00
905	10/28/2022	Update on HB 377; Legislative Update	1.00
912	9/12/2022	Real Property Value Complaints; Board of Revision	7.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
1192	2/24/2023	NW District Mtg - Media Training	1.00
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>125.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Fairfield	Carri Brown	708	1/15/2022	2021 Fall Journal Quiz: Control the Risk!	3.00
		709	1/20/2022	Thoughts from 'Glass Ceiling' Breakers	1.50
		730	2/23/2022	2022 National AGA Leadership Conference	14.00
		731	3/2/2022	Improper Payments: Leveraging Tech to Improve Payment Integrity	2.00
		733	3/16/2022	A Retrospective on the Financial Report of US Gov't: Past, Present & Future	1.50
		736	3/23/2022	Attacks on Key Infrastructure: How to Prepare & Respond	2.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

741	4/6/2022	*Ethics Update: More Ethical Dilemmas-You Make the Calls	2.00
744	11/3/2021	The Influential Power of Workplace	2.00
745	11/24/2021	Customer Service Insights for the Public Sector	3.00
746	12/15/2021	Performance Management	2.00
747	1/5/2022	Leadership; Workplace Harassment; Strategic Planning; Public Relations; Building Trust	3.00
748	1/5/2022	*The Ohio Ethics Law	0.50
749	1/5/2022	*Ohio Ethics Law: Building a Culture of Integrity	1.00
750	1/14/2022	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
751	1/15/2022	*Key Principles of Substance Abuse Prevention	1.00
752	1/20/2022	Upskilling Your Workforce Virtually	1.00
753	1/20/2022	How Managers Can Better Identify & Manage Fraud Risk in COVID-19 Funding	1.00
754	1/21/2022	New Uniform Guidance & Compliance Supplement-Tools for Grant Professionals/Auditors	2.00
758	4/20/2022	Cares Act Challenges & Solutions to Oversight of Pandemic Relief Funds	2.00
766	5/1/2022	Right Sizing the Use of Analytics to Prevent & Detect Fraud	2.00
772	5/18/2022	Proper Public Purpose	1.25
817	5/16/2022	Public Policy from a Constitutional Viewpoint	6.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
973	3/2/2023	Critical Thinking and Decisions	1.00
974	3/1/2023	Strategic Planning	1.00
976	1/26/2023	Cybersecurity Stays Front of Mind: State and Local Cybersecurity	2.00
977	1/31/2023	Cybersecurity Stays Front of Mind: Data Protection & Cloud Security	2.00
978	1/25/2023	Personal Development	1.50
979	1/11/2023	Uniform Guidance and Grant Accounting	2.00
980	1/5/2023	*Living Our Values: Ethical and Inclusive Leaders	0.75
1009	2/1/2023	GASB Update	2.00
1010	2/8/2023	Defensive Driving Basics	1.00
1145	3/8/2023	Grants Management 101	3.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>74.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Fayette	Brenda Mossbarger	49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		105	9/20/2019	Ohio Weights & Measures Update	0.75
		115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
		116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
175	1/17/2020	Proposed Solar Farms & Update from State Reps.	1.00
216	4/13/2020	County Auditor Roundtable Discussion	1.00
217	4/17/2020	Reforecasting Budgets in Uncertain Times	1.00
218	3/27/2020	Employment Law FAQ's on Family First Act	1.00
219	4/23/2020	Navigating Unemplymnt Ins during COVID 19	1.00
223	3/20/2020	Frequently Asked Employer Questions	2.00
226	4/17/2020	Layoffs & Furloughs under Civil Service Law	1.00
227	3/31/2020	Coronavirus Latest State & Fed Updates	1.00
236	4/15/2020	Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
261	9/18/2020	Drone Technology	1.00
266	10/16/2020	Montgomery County Land Bank	1.00
312	12/11/2020	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
390	1/15/2021	Senate President Huffman; Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
609	5/14/2021	Transportation Improvement Districts; Legislative Update	1.00
635	10/15/2021	*Star House Rehab Facility	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
712	1/21/2022	Improve Your Federal Policies & Remain in Compliance; Legislative Update	1.50
738	4/1/2022	Western Reserve Land Conservancy; ODA Update; Legislative Update	1.00
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption-Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
869	9/23/2022	The 20-mil Floor & Inside Millage Shift; Legislative Update	1.00
873	9/16/2022	Representative Adam Bird; Judge Byrne-Ohio 12th Dist. Court of Appeals; Legislative Update	1.00
875	9/29/2022	Sexual Harrassment for Managers	2.00
917	10/21/2022	Neil Armstrong Airport Improvements/History; Legislative Update	1.00
965	6/29/2022	FMLA Training for Supervisors	1.00
966	12/28/2022	*Ethical Behavior for Local Government	1.00
1200	3/10/2023	NE District Mtg - ODT Tax Commissioner, Weights & Measures Update, GIS Update	2.00
1206	1/20/2023	SW District Mtg - U-Turn, Recovery Docket, Clinton County Common Pleas, Legislative Update	1.50
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>108.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Franklin	Michael Stinziano	49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
		65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
		115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
		116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
		119	10/9/2019	Discovering Insightful Patterns in Property Data	2.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
		174	1/10/2020	Update from State Representative Stephens	1.25
		389	1/8/2021	Special/Delinquent Assessments/Legislative Update	1.50
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
737	4/18/2019	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
843	8/30/2022	IAAO 2022 Annual Conference	3.50
846	4/8/2022	2022 Real Property Law Institute - Day #2	1.00
847	4/5/2022	*Ohio Ethics Law: Just the Facts	1.00
848	3/8/2021	*The Ohio Ethics Law: Building A Culture of Integrity	1.00
849	2/4/2021	2021 Real Property Law Institute - Day #1, #2 (2/4/21-2/5/21)	6.75
850	8/12/2020	Ohio Secretary of State 2020 Summer Conference	10.75
851	2/1/2020	*The Ohio Ethics Law: 20/20	1.00
852	1/15/2020	My Story: A Wellness Journey	1.50
853	1/1/2020	What Icons of Mt. Rushmore Can Teach Us About Practice of Law	1.50
854	9/9/2022	Tax Lien Foreclosures; State Forefeitures; Outreach to Tax Delinquent Property Owners	1.50
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
1169	1/2/2023	ABA Accredited Law Schools Legislation Course, 2023 Spring Semester	1.50
1190	1/13/2023	SE District Mtg - Certificate of Transition, Trees to Textbook, Ohio Forest Law, Legislative Update	2.00
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

**Total Hours: 117.25**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Fulton	Brett J. Kolb	49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		130	10/21/2019	Ohio Pooled Collateral System	0.75
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
		162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
		163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
		205	2/28/2020	Fulton County Health Center & Legislation	1.00
		452	2/26/2021	Automated Data Synchronization To/From CAMA / Legislative Update	1.50
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
		524	4/16/2021	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
		564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
		565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
		566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
		567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
		568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
		569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
		570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
		571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
		572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
		573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
		683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
		684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
		685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
		686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
		687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
		689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
		690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
		691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
		802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
		803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
		804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
		805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
		806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
1192	2/24/2023	NW District Mtg - Media Training	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>88.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Gallia	Robbie Jacks	732	3/11/2022	ODNR K9 Program; Legislative Update	1.00
		769	5/13/2022	20 Mill Floor & Inside Millage Shift; Legislative Update	1.00
		791	6/13/2022	*The Ohio Ethics Law: Watching Our Step	1.00
		802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
		803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
		804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
		805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
		806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
		807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
		808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
		809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
		810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
		811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
		812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
		813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
		814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
		815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
		819	7/14/2022	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
		891	10/21/2022	*Opioids in the Workplace; Drug-Free Workplace Programs	2.50
		1190	1/13/2023	SE District Mtg - Certificate of Transition, Trees to Textbook, Ohio Forest Law, Legislative Update	2.00
		<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>25.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Geauga	Charles E. Walder	24	5/10/2019	Ohio Forest Tax Law	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
77	8/2/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
433	2/5/2021	NE District Mtg-County Dog Warden & Their Responsibilities	1.00
454	3/5/2021	Fee Exempt Conveyances / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
516	4/2/2021	School Report Card Reform Legislation {Rep. Don Jones}; Legislative Update	1.50
533	5/6/2021	**Ohio Public Records Training	3.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
713	2/4/2022	Current Residential Valuations in NE District; Legislative Update; AOS Keith Faber	1.50
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption- Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
907	3/4/2022	Muskingum Watershed Conservancy District; Voucher Issues; ODNR Presentation	2.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
1200	3/10/2023	NE District Mtg - ODT Tax Commissioner, Weights & Measures Update, GIS Update	2.00

**Total Hours: 59.25**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Greene	David Graham	1	3/15/2019	Downtown Redevelopment Districts	0.50
		42	6/28/2019	**Certified Public Records Training	3.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
105	9/20/2019	Ohio Weights & Measures Update	0.75
115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
175	1/17/2020	Proposed Solar Farms & Update from State Reps.	1.00
261	9/18/2020	Drone Technology	1.00
265	10/2/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00
266	10/16/2020	Montgomery County Land Bank	1.00
390	1/15/2021	Senate President Huffman; Legislative Update	1.50
500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
609	5/14/2021	Transportation Improvement Districts; Legislative Update	1.00
635	10/15/2021	*Star House Rehab Facility	1.00
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
712	1/21/2022	Improve Your Federal Policies & Remain in Compliance; Legislative Update	1.50
739	3/18/2022	Brownfield Redevelopment at It's Finest; Legislative Update	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
873	9/16/2022	Representative Adam Bird; Judge Byrne-Ohio 12th Dst. Court of Appeals; Legislative Update	1.00
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
1206	1/20/2023	SW District Mtg - U-Turn, Recovery Docket, Clinton County Common Pleas, Legislative Update	1.50
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>113.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Guernsey	Cory Johnson	21	5/3/2019	Bureau of Underground Storage Tank Regs	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
174	1/10/2020	Update from State Representative Stephens	1.25
225	4/14/2020	Understanding Liabilities & Employment Regs	1.00
226	4/17/2020	Layoffs & Furloughs under Civil Service Law	1.00
233	3/12/2020	What is a Deed & How Does Conveyance Work	6.00
265	10/2/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00
389	1/8/2021	Special/Delinquent Assessments/Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
490	3/10/2021	County Land Banks: Overview and Future Directions	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
608	9/17/2021	Representative Creech / Legislative Update	1.00
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption-Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00

**Total Hours: 76.50**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Hamilton	Brigid Kelly	32	5/17/2019	Ohio Auditor of State	1.00
		33	5/28/2019	*Ohio Ethics Law Training	2.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

41	6/10/2019	**Certified Public Records Training	3.00
115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
131	10/25/2019	Ohio House Update - Representative Seitz	1.00
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
184	1/21/2020	2019 Tax Valuation	1.00
206	11/27/2019	2018 Ransomware	0.50
266	10/16/2020	Montgomery County Land Bank	1.00
390	1/15/2021	Senate President Huffman; Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
608	9/17/2021	Representative Creech / Legislative Update	1.00
712	1/21/2022	Improve Your Federal Policies & Remain in Compliance; Legislative Update	1.50
739	3/18/2022	Brownfield Redevelopment at It's Finest; Legislative Update	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tifs, Oh My!	1.50
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>50.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Hancock	Charity Rauschenberg	5	3/22/2019	AOS Update & Sheriff K-9 Unit	1.50
		17	4/26/2019	Outside Bank Accounts	1.00
		27	5/15/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
73	7/26/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
130	10/21/2019	Ohio Pooled Collateral System	0.75
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
205	2/28/2020	Fulton County Health Center & Legislation	1.00
260	9/25/2020	HB481 - Local Government Cares Act	1.00
267	10/30/2020	Abstracts Roundtable	1.00
452	2/26/2021	Automated Data Synchronization To/From CAMA / Legislative Update	1.50
454	3/5/2021	Fee Exempt Conveyances / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
514	3/26/2021	Special Assessments; Creating the Tax Bill; Legislative Update	1.50
529	4/23/2021	Enhanced 911 Update; Legislative Update	1.00
532	5/10/2021	House Speaker Cupp/Senate President Huffman	1.50
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
674	10/22/2021	Legislative Update-NW District Mtg	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
712	1/21/2022	Improve Your Federal Policies & Remain in Compliance; Legislative Update	1.50
713	2/4/2022	Current Residential Valuations in NE District; Legislative Update; AOS Keith Faber	1.50
734	3/25/2022	Picking Up the Pieces-Employee Mental Health; Legislative Update	1.00
759	4/22/2022	GIS-Not Just Nosey Neighbors; Time Travel with GIS	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

779	5/26/2022	Roundtable Discussion: Best Practice; Legislative Update	1.00
793	7/14/2021	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
879	10/5/2022	Ohio GFOA 2022 Annual Conference - 3 days	15.00
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25
905	10/28/2022	Update on HB 377; Legislative Update	1.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
1192	2/24/2023	NW District Mtg - Media Training	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>135.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Hardin	Michael T. Bacon	5	3/22/2019	AOS Update & Sheriff K-9 Unit	1.50
		27	5/15/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		66	7/10/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.00
		67	7/10/2019	Loss Control Services to Avoid Employment Claims	1.00
		73	7/26/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
		124	10/17/2019	**Certified Public Records Training	3.00
		130	10/21/2019	Ohio Pooled Collateral System	0.75
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
		162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
		163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

216	4/13/2020	County Auditor Roundtable Discussion	1.00
218	3/27/2020	Employment Law FAQ's on Family First Act	1.00
223	3/20/2020	Frequently Asked Employer Questions	2.00
227	3/31/2020	Coronavirus Latest State & Fed Updates	1.00
260	9/25/2020	HB481 - Local Government Cares Act	1.00
273	5/15/2020	COVID 19 Economic Webinar Series - County Models	1.00
276	6/24/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide	1.50
280	6/5/2020	Understanding the Federal Cares Act	1.00
285	8/21/2020	How Counties are using Cares Act Dollars - Fairfield/Richland	1.00
288	9/25/2020	Subgranting of Cares Act Funding	1.00
289	10/1/2020	Auditing of Cares Act Funding	1.00
300	7/22/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide Update HB 481	2.00
314	6/5/2020	Understanding Federal Cares Act-How Cty's Can Use Fund Pymts	1.00
388	9/18/2020	Use of Cares Act Funding	1.00
452	2/26/2021	Automated Data Synchronization To/From CAMA / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
699	1/7/2022	*Ohio Ethics Law: Building a Culture of Integrity	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>50.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Harrison	Allison M. Anderson	7	3/19/2019	Records Management - Electronic Records	1.00
		24	5/10/2019	Ohio Forest Tax Law	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
		65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
		101	9/13/2019	**Certified Public Records Training	3.00
		113	9/24/2019	*Sorting Out Confusion on CBD	0.50
		115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
		116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
		120	10/4/2019	Ransomware Attacks	2.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
214	3/6/2020	Local Government Funds	1.00
217	4/17/2020	Reforecasting Budgets in Uncertain Times	1.00
224	4/30/2020	Leading Re-Entry after COVID 19	1.00
228	4/3/2020	Employment Implications during COVID Pandemic	1.00
233	3/12/2020	What is a Deed & How Does Conveyance Work	7.00
262	8/21/2020	HB481 - Cares Act; HB485; Legislative	1.00
265	10/2/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00
433	2/5/2021	NE District Mtg-County Dog Warden & Their Responsibilities	1.00
448	2/10/2021	Budget Basics	1.80
450	2/23/2021	Deeper Dive Into the Universal Waste Rules	1.00
454	3/5/2021	Fee Exempt Conveyances / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
516	4/2/2021	School Report Card Reform Legislation {Rep. Don Jones}; Legislative Update	1.50
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
608	9/17/2021	Representative Creech / Legislative Update	1.00
611	9/22/2021	Regionals: Dollars & Sense	1.50
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption- Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
816	6/22/2022	Cash / Liquidity Management	1.00
824	8/5/2022	Drone Use in Law Enforcement; Special Assessments; Property Transfers; Delinquent Tax	2.50
860	9/14/2022	*The Ohio Ethics Laws: Watching Our Step!	1.00
907	3/4/2022	Muskingum Watershed Conservancy District; Voucher Issues; ODNR Presentation	2.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
1200	3/10/2023	NE District Mtg - ODT Tax Commissioner, Weights & Measures Update, GIS Update	2.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>118.80</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Henry	Elizabeth Fruchey	660	10/22/2021	Software Solutions Fall Conference	8.00
		681	12/15/2021	**Ohio Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
		682	12/16/2021	*The Ohio Ethics Laws: Building a Culture of Integrity	1.00
		683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
		684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
		685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
		686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
		687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
		688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
		689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
		690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
		691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
		692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
		693	12/20/2021	*Ohio Ethics Laws: A Deeper Study	1.00
		727	2/25/2022	Your County's Social Media Presence; Legislative Update	1.00
		734	3/25/2022	Picking Up the Pieces-Employee Mental Health; Legislative Update	1.00
		759	4/22/2022	GIS-Not Just Nosey Neighbors; Time Travel with GIS	1.00
		765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption-Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
		768	5/11/2022	Overview for Executives & Senior Leaders	3.00
		779	5/26/2022	Roundtable Discussion: Best Practice; Legislative Update	1.00
		802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
		803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
		804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
		805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
		806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
		807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
		808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
		809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
		810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
		811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
		812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
		813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
820	7/28/2022	*Comprehensive Substance Abuse Training	8.00
832	7/22/2022	Confessions of Fraudsters - AOS	1.50
869	9/23/2022	The 20-mil Floor & Inside Millage Shift; Legislative Update	1.00
900	10/5/2022	Ohio GFOA 35th Annual Conference (Oct 5-7)	19.00
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25
905	10/28/2022	Update on HB 377; Legislative Update	1.00
912	9/12/2022	Real Property Value Complaints; Board of Revision	7.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
1192	2/24/2023	NW District Mtg - Media Training	1.00
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>108.25</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Highland	Alex Butler	1	3/15/2019	Downtown Redevelopment Districts	0.50
		32	5/17/2019	Ohio Auditor of State	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
		65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
		105	9/20/2019	Ohio Weights & Measures Update	0.75
		131	10/25/2019	Ohio House Update - Representative Seitz	1.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
175	1/17/2020	Proposed Solar Farms & Update from State Reps.	1.00
261	9/18/2020	Drone Technology	1.00
266	10/16/2020	Montgomery County Land Bank	1.00
390	1/15/2021	Senate President Huffman; Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
609	5/14/2021	Transportation Improvement Districts; Legislative Update	1.00
873	9/16/2022	Representative Adam Bird; Judge Byrne-Ohio 12th Dst. Court of Appeals; Legislative Update	1.00
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25
1206	1/20/2023	SW District Mtg - U-Turn, Recovery Docket, Clinton County Common Pleas, Legislative Update	1.50
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
			<b>Total Hours: 71.25</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Hocking	Christopher Robers	21	5/3/2019	Bureau of Underground Storage Tank Regs	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

79	9/8/2019	Technology for Weights & Measures Calculations	1.00
126	10/11/2019	DTE 93 Abstract & DTE 94 Exempt Abstract	1.00
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
174	1/10/2020	Update from State Representative Stephens	1.25
263	8/14/2020	History of the Local Government Fund: Cares Act	1.50
267	10/30/2020	Abstracts Roundtable	1.00
389	1/8/2021	Special/Delinquent Assessments/Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
517	4/9/2021	Representative Stephens; Legislative Update	1.00
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
584	7/9/2021	A Look Back at the Roles & Responsibilities of the County Auditor	1.00
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
654	10/8/2021	Legislative Update; Informational Session w/CAAO Bsn Partners	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
732	3/11/2022	ODNR K9 Program; Legislative Update	1.00
757	4/21/2022	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption-Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
769	5/13/2022	20 Mill Floor & Inside Millage Shift; Legislative Update	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
831	8/12/2022	CAUV Compliance; Muskingum Watershed Conservancy District	1.50
835	8/22/2022	*The Ohio Ethics Laws: Watching Our Step!	1.00
882	9/28/2022	Employment Matters Affecting Public Employers	1.00
888	10/14/2022	Update on HB 126; Legislative Update	1.50
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
1190	1/13/2023	SE District Mtg - Certificate of Transition, Trees to Textbook, Ohio Forest Law, Legislative Update	2.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>118.25</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Holmes	Jackie McKee	10	4/15/2019	*Good Government in Action	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
		104	9/19/2019	**Certified Public Records Training	3.00
		115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
		116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
		120	10/4/2019	Ransomware Attacks	2.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
170	12/4/2019	Crucial Conversations	5.50
216	4/13/2020	County Auditor Roundtable Discussion	1.00
223	3/20/2020	Frequently Asked Employer Questions	2.00
255	8/27/2020	Environmental Regulations	1.00
273	5/15/2020	COVID 19 Economic Webinar Series - County Models	1.00
276	6/24/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide	1.50
285	8/21/2020	How Counties are using Cares Act Dollars - Fairfield/Richland	1.00
300	7/22/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide Update HB 481	1.50
303	6/3/2020	Effectvie Property Tax Oversight Responses with COVID 19	2.00
314	6/5/2020	Understanding Federal Cares Act-How Cty's Can Use Fund Pymts	1.00
315	4/20/2020	*Drug Free 201	1.00
316	5/1/2020	Responsible Restart	1.00
317	5/18/2020	Impact of History/Now COVID-19	1.00
354	10/1/2020	Auditing of Cares Act	1.00
383	1/14/2021	Going Virtual-A Shift in Appeals Collaboration	1.00
386	1/20/2021	Fighting Fraud in the Unemployment Insurance System	1.00
454	3/5/2021	Fee Exempt Conveyances / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
496	2/10/2021	Budget Basics	1.50
498	3/15/2021	Budget Forecasting	1.00
508	3/30/2021	Maximizing the Impact of American Rescue Plan: Planning Tools/Emerging Best Practices	1.00
509	3/22/2021	Fraud Red Flags, Schemes & Proactive Prevention	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
516	4/2/2021	School Report Card Reform Legislation {Rep. Don Jones}; Legislative Update	1.50
517	4/9/2021	Representative Stephens; Legislative Update	1.00
519	4/13/2021	Local Government Officials Conference	11.75
526	4/20/2021	OPERS Pension & Healthcare	1.00
527	4/29/2021	Ohio GFOA - Tell the Story of Your Finances	1.20
528	4/29/2021	American Rescue Plan Act Guidance/Local Government Update	1.00
538	5/18/2021	Local Government Update: American Rescue Plan	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
587	7/21/2021	Appeals Filing and Resolution	1.00
615	9/28/2021	How Technology is Helping Local Gov't do More with Less	2.00
710	1/24/2022	State & Local Recovery Funds Update	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

732	3/11/2022	ODNR K9 Program; Legislative Update	1.00
896	10/25/2022	Appalachian Community Grant Program	1.50
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>117.95</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Huron	Roland Tkach	5	3/22/2019	AOS Update & Sheriff K-9 Unit	1.50
		12	4/9/2019	Challenging Issues: Commercial Property Valuation	7.00
		13	4/18/2019	FDIC Director College	5.50
		17	4/26/2019	Outside Bank Accounts	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
		65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
		73	7/26/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
		91	8/23/2019	Erie County Development Issues & Legislation	1.50
		99	9/6/2019	*Lorain County Alcohol & Drug Services	1.00
		115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
		162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
		163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
		205	2/28/2020	Fulton County Health Center & Legislation	1.00
		266	10/16/2020	Montgomery County Land Bank	1.00
		433	2/5/2021	NE District Mtg-County Dog Warden & Their Responsibilities	1.00
		452	2/26/2021	Automated Data Synchronization To/From CAMA / Legislative Update	1.50
		454	3/5/2021	Fee Exempt Conveyances / Legislative Update	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
514	3/26/2021	Special Assessments; Creating the Tax Bill; Legislative Update	1.50
516	4/2/2021	School Report Card Reform Legislation {Rep. Don Jones}; Legislative Update	1.50
517	4/9/2021	Representative Stephens; Legislative Update	1.00
529	4/23/2021	Enhanced 911 Update; Legislative Update	1.00
532	5/10/2021	House Speaker Cupp/Senate President Huffman	1.50
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
596	7/23/2021	Legislative Update; Mary Ellen Withrow-40th Treasurer of the U.S.	1.00
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
674	10/22/2021	Legislative Update-NW District Mtg	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
727	2/25/2022	Your County's Social Media Presence; Legislative Update	1.00
734	3/25/2022	Picking Up the Pieces-Employee Mental Health; Legislative Update	1.00
738	4/1/2022	Western Reserve Land Conservancy; ODA Update; Legislative Update	1.00
759	4/22/2022	GIS-Not Just Nosey Neighbors; Time Travel with GIS	1.00
779	5/26/2022	Roundtable Discussion: Best Practice; Legislative Update	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tifs, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
824	8/5/2022	Drone Use in Law Enforcement; Special Assessments; Property Transfers; Delinquent Tax	2.50
832	7/22/2022	Confessions of Fraudsters - AOS	1.50
840	8/26/2022	Energy, Utility & Local Government Policy	1.00
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25
912	9/12/2022	Real Property Value Complaints; Board of Revision	7.00
918	12/2/2022	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
1192	2/24/2023	NW District Mtg - Media Training	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00

**Total Hours: 154.75**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Jackson	Tiffany Ridgeway	21	5/3/2019	Bureau of Underground Storage Tank Regs	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
		65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
		79	9/8/2019	Technology for Weights & Measures Calculations	1.00
		115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
		116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
		117	10/2/2019	Cybersecurity	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

122	10/16/2019	Loss Control to Avoid Employment Claims & Social Media	2.00
126	10/11/2019	DTE 93 Abstract & DTE 94 Exempt Abstract	1.00
128	10/18/2019	Deed and Conveyance Workshop	7.00
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
174	1/10/2020	Update from State Representative Stephens	1.25
215	3/13/2020	COVID 19 by Rick Hoffman	1.00
218	3/27/2020	Employment Law FAQ's on Family First Act	1.00
226	4/17/2020	Layoffs & Furloughs under Civil Service Law	1.00
227	3/31/2020	Coronavirus Latest State & Fed Updates	1.00
263	8/14/2020	History of the Local Government Fund: Cares Act	1.50
265	10/2/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00
267	10/30/2020	Abstracts Roundtable	1.00
272	5/13/2020	Navigating Workplace Accomodations	1.00
273	5/15/2020	COVID 19 Economic Webinar Series - County Models	1.00
276	6/24/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide	1.50
278	9/18/2020	Protection from Ransomware and Phishing	1.00
280	6/5/2020	Understanding the Federal Cares Act	1.00
285	8/21/2020	How Counties are using Cares Act Dollars - Fairfield/Richland	1.00
288	9/25/2020	Subgranting of Cares Act Funding	1.00
289	10/1/2020	Auditing of Cares Act Funding	1.00
290	5/22/2020	How to use FEMA Public Assistance Funding	1.00
291	8/21/2020	How Cntys use Cares Act Dollars - Ottawa & Henry	1.00
297	6/26/2020	CAUV TY2020 Agricultural Advisory Meeting	0.50
300	7/22/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide Update HB 481	1.50
344	8/17/2020	Virtual State of the Region Q&A - Ohio OBM	1.00
371	9/18/2020	Cybersecurity Training	1.00
389	1/8/2021	Special/Delinquent Assessments/Legislative Update	1.50
430	1/14/2021	1099 NEC Awareness Day	1.00
431	2/4/2021	CORSA/FDAR Jackson County Human Resources Training	1.75
434	9/15/2019	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
508	3/30/2021	Maximizing the Impact of American Rescue Plan: Planning Tools/Emerging Best Practices	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
517	4/9/2021	Representative Stephens; Legislative Update	1.00
522	4/14/2021	Defensive Driving Training	1.50
523	4/14/2021	American Rescue Plan: Briefing: Everything You Need to Know	1.00
528	4/29/2021	American Rescue Plan Act Guidance/Local Government Update	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

538	5/18/2021	Local Government Update: American Rescue Plan	1.00
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
584	7/9/2021	A Look Back at the Roles & Responsibilities of the County Auditor	1.00
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
654	10/8/2021	Legislative Update; Informational Session w/CAAO Bsn Partners	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
694	11/9/2021	CORSA: Cybersecurity; Corrective Action-Employee Claims-Discriminaton (Jackson County)	2.00
705	1/10/2022	NACo Update: Overview of US Treasury's Final Rule	1.25
710	1/24/2022	State & Local Recovery Funds Update	1.00
732	3/11/2022	ODNR K9 Program; Legislative Update	1.00
764	4/14/2022	ARPA Fiscal Recovery Fund: Overview of Reporting Requirements/Uniform Guidance	1.00
769	5/13/2022	20 Mill Floor & Inside Millage Shift; Legislative Update	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
831	8/12/2022	CAUV Compliance; Muskingum Watershed Conservancy District	1.50
888	10/14/2022	Update on HB 126; Legislative Update	1.50
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
1190	1/13/2023	SE District Mtg - Certificate of Transition, Trees to Textbook, Ohio Forest Law, Legislative Update	2.00
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>172.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Jefferson	E.J. Conn	23	5/9/2019	Emerging Trends in Fraud Investigation	16.00
		24	5/10/2019	Ohio Forest Tax Law	1.00
		34	5/15/2019	Ohio Virtual Tax Academy	3.50
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		77	8/2/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
		99	9/6/2019	*Lorain County Alcohol & Drug Services	1.00
		106	9/20/2019	Ohio GFOA 2019 Conference	13.00
		115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
		116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
		120	10/4/2019	Ransomware Attacks	2.00
		214	3/6/2020	Local Government Funds	1.00
		262	8/21/2020	HB481 - Cares Act; HB485; Legislative	1.00
		433	2/5/2021	NE District Mtg-County Dog Warden & Their Responsibilities	1.00
		454	3/5/2021	Fee Exempt Conveyances / Legislative Update	1.50
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
		563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption- Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
796	3/12/2019	**Sunshine Laws Training - December 11, 2018	3.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>112.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Knox	Sarah Thorne	49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
120	10/4/2019	Ransomware Attacks	2.00
128	10/18/2019	Deed and Conveyance Workshop	7.00
152	10/30/2019	Family & Medical Leave Act	2.00
153	12/2/2019	**Sunshine Law Training	3.00
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
214	3/6/2020	Local Government Funds	1.00
217	4/17/2020	Reforecasting Budgets in Uncertain Times	1.00
222	4/24/2020	COVID Economic Recovery	1.00
260	9/25/2020	HB481 - Local Government Cares Act	1.00
262	8/21/2020	HB481 - Cares Act; HB485; Legislative	1.00
265	10/2/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00
276	6/24/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide	1.50
288	9/25/2020	Subgranting of Cares Act Funding	1.00
289	10/1/2020	Auditing of Cares Act Funding	1.00
291	8/21/2020	How Cntys use Cares Act Dollars - Ottawa & Henry	1.00
292	8/27/2020	Environmental Regulation	1.00
300	7/22/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide Update HB 481	2.00
433	2/5/2021	NE District Mtg-County Dog Warden & Their Responsibilities	1.00
452	2/26/2021	Automated Data Synchronization To/From CAMA / Legislative Update	1.50
454	3/5/2021	Fee Exempt Conveyances / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
490	3/10/2021	County Land Banks: Overview and Future Directions	1.00
500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
516	4/2/2021	School Report Card Reform Legislation {Rep. Don Jones}; Legislative Update	1.50
519	4/13/2021	Local Government Officials Conference	11.75
556	6/25/2021	SLFRF Reporting-#2-Counties w/pop below 250,000-Received <\$5 mil.	1.00
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
616	10/1/2021	*Current Drug Trend; COVID Impact on Drug Use; Drug Dog Demo	1.00
617	10/1/2021	Active Shooter: How to React in a Crisis Situation	1.00
618	10/1/2021	COVID in Terms of Stress & Our Mental Health	1.00
678	12/7/2021	2nd Annual Ohio Grants Summit	4.75
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
713	2/4/2022	Current Residential Valuations in NE District; Legislative Update; AOS Keith Faber	1.50
738	4/1/2022	Western Reserve Land Conservancy; ODA Update; Legislative Update	1.00
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption- Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
907	3/4/2022	Muskingum Watershed Conservancy District; Voucher Issues; ODNR Presentation	2.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00

**Total Hours: 141.75**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Lake	Christopher A. Galloway	16	4/25/2019	Intro to Finance Office & Government Accounting	10.50
		22	5/7/2019	Ohio Legislative & Budget Update	2.40
		26	5/17/2019	*Ohio's Opioid Curricula: Fundamentals of Addiction	1.00
		28	5/14/2019	**Sunshine Law Training	3.00
		29	5/22/2019	Good Government in Action	1.00
		35	5/22/2019	Address Employee Performance, Avoid Claims	2.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
69	7/18/2019	Records Management - Disaster Preparedness	1.00
77	8/2/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
79	9/8/2019	Technology for Weights & Measures Calculations	1.00
81	7/23/2019	Evaluating Internal Controls	8.00
90	8/21/2019	Ohio Virtual Tax Academy	3.50
106	9/20/2019	Ohio GFOA 2019 Conference	13.00
115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
190	12/5/2019	Annual Governmentl GAAP Update	4.00
248	6/11/2020	Map a Course through Crisis	1.00
251	9/16/2020	OH GFOA Virt. Annual Conference/Meeting	11.80
262	8/21/2020	HB481 - Cares Act; HB485; Legislative	1.00
265	10/2/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00
452	2/26/2021	Automated Data Synchronization To/From CAMA / Legislative Update	1.50
454	3/5/2021	Fee Exempt Conveyances / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
469	9/16/2020	*Ethics in the Real World	3.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
516	4/2/2021	School Report Card Reform Legislation {Rep. Don Jones}; Legislative Update	1.50
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
574	6/30/2021	Human Resources Training	2.00
597	8/6/2021	Senator Hoagland; Legislative Update	1.00
616	10/1/2021	*Current Drug Trend; COVID Impact on Drug Use; Drug Dog Demo	1.00
617	10/1/2021	Active Shooter: How to React in a Crisis Situation	1.00
618	10/1/2021	COVID in Terms of Stress & Our Mental Health	1.00
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
738	4/1/2022	Western Reserve Land Conservancy; ODA Update; Legislative Update	1.00
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption-Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
907	3/4/2022	Muskingum Watershed Conservancy District; Voucher Issues; ODNR Presentation	2.00
1200	3/10/2023	NE District Mtg - ODT Tax Commissioner, Weights & Measures Update, GIS Update	2.00
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00

**Total Hours: 162.45**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Lawrence	Paul David Knipp	155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
		163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
		174	1/10/2020	Update from State Representative Stephens	1.25
		266	10/16/2020	Montgomery County Land Bank	1.00
		389	1/8/2021	Special/Deliquent Assessments/Legislative Update	1.50
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
		513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
		517	4/9/2021	Representative Stephens; Legislative Update	1.00
		563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
		565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
		566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
		567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
		568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
		569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
584	7/9/2021	A Look Back at the Roles & Responsibilities of the County Auditor	1.00
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
654	10/8/2021	Legislative Update; Informational Session w/CAAO Bsn Partners	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
732	3/11/2022	ODNR K9 Program; Legislative Update	1.00
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption-Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
769	5/13/2022	20 Mill Floor & Inside Millage Shift; Legislative Update	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tifs, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
831	8/12/2022	CAUV Compliance; Muskingum Watershed Conservancy District	1.50
863	7/1/2020	2020 Kentucky Laws Update	17.75
864	6/7/2021	Updates from the Capitol - Pt. 1	3.50
865	6/28/2021	Updates from the Capitol - Pt. 2	6.00
866	7/1/2021	*Ethics Update	2.00
867	7/1/2021	2021 Kentucky Laws Update	6.00
876	9/15/2022	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
888	10/14/2022	Update on HB 126; Legislative Update	1.50
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
1190	1/13/2023	SE District Mtg - Certificate of Transition, Trees to Textbook, Ohio Forest Law, Legislative Update	2.00
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>128.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Licking	Michael L. Smith	49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
		162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
		163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
		191	1/30/2020	**Sunshin Law Training	3.00
		192	2/14/2020	*Ohio Ethics Law 2020	1.00
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
		513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
		563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
		564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
		565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
		566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
		567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
		568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
		569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
		570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
		571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
		572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
		573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
		683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
		684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
		685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
		686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
		687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
		688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
		689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
		690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
		691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
		692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
		802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
		803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
		804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
		805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
		807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
		808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
		809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
		810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>78.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Logan	Jack Reser	5	3/22/2019	AOS Update & Sheriff K-9 Unit	1.50
		22	5/7/2019	Ohio Legislative & Budget Update	2.40
		32	5/17/2019	Ohio Auditor of State	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		72	7/25/2019	Managing the Budget Process	12.00
		90	8/21/2019	Ohio Virtual Tax Academy	3.50
		105	9/20/2019	Ohio Weights & Measures Update	0.75
		106	9/20/2019	Ohio GFOA 2019 Conference	12.00
		109	9/19/2019	Center for Public Investment Management Courses	4.00
		110	9/18/2019	Center for Public Investment Management	2.00
		111	5/14/2019	Cash 120	1.25
		112	9/19/2019	Ohio Pooled Collateral System	0.50
		115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
		116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
		131	10/25/2019	Ohio House Update - Representative Seitz	1.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
		194	2/9/2020	Cyber Security and Data Protection	1.00
		195	2/10/2020	Basics of Borrowing	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

196	2/9/2020	Grants Management	1.00
199	2/27/2020	Electronic Banking Cyber Security	0.50
200	2/28/2020	Continuing Disclosure Underwriter	1.00
201	3/1/2020	Structuring Bond Issues	0.75
202	3/1/2020	A Closer Look at the Federal Reserve	1.00
216	4/13/2020	County Auditor Roundtable Discussion	1.00
217	4/17/2020	Reforecasting Budgets in Uncertain Times	1.00
219	4/23/2020	Navigating Unemployment Ins during COVID 19	1.00
221	4/30/2020	U.S. Public Financial Markets Update	1.00
225	4/14/2020	Understanding Liabilities & Employment Regs	1.00
226	4/17/2020	Layoffs & Furloughs under Civil Service Law	1.00
227	3/31/2020	Coronavirus Latest State & Fed Updates	1.00
233	3/12/2020	What is a Deed & How Does Conveyance Work	7.00
261	9/18/2020	Drone Technology	1.00
390	1/15/2021	Senate President Huffman; Legislative Update	1.50
391	5/6/2020	Community Engagement Meeting	1.00
392	5/7/2020	Award Winning Budget	1.00
393	5/14/2020	Navigating Uncertainty	1.00
394	5/18/2020	COVID Roundtable	1.00
395	5/19/2020	Authentic Work	1.00
396	5/19/2020	Public Engagement	1.00
397	5/20/2020	Enterprise Accounting	1.00
398	5/20/2020	Ask the Expert	1.00
399	5/29/2020	Disaster Relief Funding Tools	1.00
400	5/28/2020	Our Data has Been Ransomed	1.00
401	5/31/2020	Practice of Leadership	1.00
402	5/26/2020	GFOA Virtual Conference	16.00
403	6/5/2020	ESG and Bonds	2.00
404	6/5/2020	COVID-19 Disclosure Practices	2.00
405	6/5/2020	Capital Planning	1.50
406	6/5/2020	Process Improvement	1.50
407	5/28/2020	Auditing Committees Best Practices	1.00
408	6/25/2020	457 Presto Chango	1.00
409	6/25/2020	Making Technology Work	1.00
410	6/25/2020	Policies of Capital Debt	1.50
411	6/25/2020	GASB Changes	2.00
412	6/25/2020	Retirement Jambalaya	1.50
413	6/25/2020	Financial Use Planning	2.00
414	6/27/2020	Preventing Fraud	1.00
415	6/27/2020	Public Engagement	1.00
416	6/27/2020	Financial Transparency	1.00
417	6/28/2020	Investment Strategy COVID Landscape	1.00
418	6/28/2020	Climate Change with Local Government	1.00
419	8/7/2020	**Ohio Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
420	7/8/2020	Intelligent Technology Abuse	1.00
421	7/15/2020	How COVID-19 Impacts Your Single Audit	1.00
422	8/6/2020	Cybersecurity in a COVID-19 World	1.00
423	8/5/2020	ODH Travel Advisory	1.00
424	8/10/2020	Fiduciary Reporting	1.00
425	8/11/2020	GFOA's Ethics Voice	1.00
426	1/13/2021	New Year, New HR Compliance Consideration	1.00
427	1/12/2021	Next Steps in COVID-19 Protocols & Compliance	1.00
451	2/24/2021	Harnessing the Power of Public Data	1.00
452	2/26/2021	Automated Data Synchronization To/From CAMA / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
486	2/2/2021	Deeper Dive Into GIS	1.00
487	2/16/2021	Cybersecurity in the Public Sector	1.00
500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
517	4/9/2021	Representative Stephens; Legislative Update	1.00
532	5/10/2021	House Speaker Cupp/Senate President Huffman	1.50
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
577	4/13/2021	2021 Local Gov't Officials Conference	11.75
609	5/14/2021	Transportation Improvement Districts; Legislative Update	1.00
614	9/22/2021	Ohio GFOA 34th Annual Conference	5.00
635	10/15/2021	*Star House Rehab Facility	1.00
636	7/15/2021	GFOA National Conference	4.50
637	7/16/2021	GFOA National Conference	3.00
638	7/21/2021	GFOA National Conference	4.50
639	7/26/2021	SOS - Focusing on Core Elements of PI	1.50
640	7/27/2021	Life Cycle Costing - Asset Management	1.50
641	8/2/2021	Budget Basic Function - Everyone	1.50
642	8/10/2021	Rethinking Local Economic Development	1.50
643	8/18/2021	Chefs vs. Cooks - Problem Solving PF	1.50
644	8/21/2021	Thinking Probabilistically - Risk Tool	1.50
645	8/23/2021	How COVID Forced Government to Change	1.50
646	8/23/2021	Time to Talk: When, Why & How?	1.50
647	8/24/2021	What is Trending in the Bond Market	1.50
648	10/10/2021	Cares Act - Single Audit - COVID19	1.50
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
710	1/24/2022	State & Local Recovery Funds Update	1.00
712	1/21/2022	Improve Your Federal Policies & Remain in Compliance; Legislative Update	1.50
713	2/4/2022	Current Residential Valuations in NE District; Legislative Update; AOS Keith Faber	1.50
722	1/20/2022	Information Session-Final Rule for ARPA Fiscal Recovery Fund: Broadband Infrastructure	1.50
727	2/25/2022	Your County's Social Media Presence; Legislative Update	1.00
734	3/25/2022	Picking Up the Pieces-Employee Mental Health; Legislative Update	1.00
738	4/1/2022	Western Reserve Land Conservancy; ODA Update; Legislative Update	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

739	3/18/2022	Brownfield Redevelopment at It's Finest; Legislative Update	1.00
742	3/29/2022	Best Practices with Emergencies	1.00
743	4/13/2022	2022 Local Government Officials Conference	11.00
764	4/14/2022	ARPA Fiscal Recovery Fund: Overview of Reporting Requirements/Uniform Guidance	1.00
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption- Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
781	1/12/2022	ARPA	1.00
782	4/18/2022	County Card Banks/Overview of Future Directions	1.00
783	4/18/2022	Never Get Misquoted Again	1.00
784	4/19/2022	Overview: Capital Procurement ARPA	1.00
785	4/19/2022	State & Local Project/Exp. Rep. Part 1 & 2	1.50
786	4/25/2022	ARPA Monies for Cybersecurity	1.00
787	4/28/2022	Making Sense of It - Cost with Cloud	1.00
788	2/4/2022	One Ohio Tool Kit	1.50
789	2/9/2022	Toolkit for Local Governments #2	1.00
790	5/20/2022	Social Media/Navigating a Changing Legal World	1.50
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
824	8/5/2022	Drone Use in Law Enforcement; Special Assessments; Property Transfers; Delinquent Tax	2.50
873	9/16/2022	Representative Adam Bird; Judge Byrne-Ohio 12th Dst. Court of Appeals; Legislative Update	1.00
900	10/5/2022	Ohio GFOA 35th Annual Conference (Oct 5-7)	16.60
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25
907	3/4/2022	Muskingum Watershed Conservancy District; Voucher Issues; ODNR Presentation	2.00
911	7/18/2022	Real Property Value Complaints; Board of Revision	7.00
917	10/21/2022	Neil Armstrong Airport Improvements/History; Legislative Update	1.00
919	6/14/2022	Fighting Back Against Ransomware	1.50
920	6/15/2022	SLFRF-Equity-Community Engagement	1.00
921	6/16/2022	SLFRF-Metrics and Evaluation	1.00
922	6/22/2022	Cash & Liquidity Management	1.00
923	6/22/2022	High Value Technology That Delivers	1.00
924	6/23/2022	Cyber Hygiene - Zero Trust	1.00
925	7/7/2022	Data Protection in the Cloud	1.00
926	7/12/2022	Resilience Against Cyber Breach	1.00
927	7/20/2022	Scripts - Script - Scripps	1.00
928	7/28/2022	Best Practices for Effective Incident	1.00
929	8/4/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
930	8/10/2022	SLFRF Local Fiscal Recovery ARPA	1.00
931	9/12/2022	Energy Update: Solar	1.50
932	9/22/2022	Financing Public Infra-ED Tools	1.00
933	9/26/2022	Update on Solar Energy	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

934	10/13/2022	Developing Effective Application - Cyber	1.00
935	10/18/2022	State/Local Grant Program: What - When	1.00
936	10/21/2022	Solar Energy - Chamer Development	1.00
937	11/9/2022	Fiduciary Goneranee - Dangerous	1.00
938	11/30/2022	Ohio Grant Summit (11/30 - 12/01)	6.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
1027	1/10/2023	States- Make Plans for Federal Cybersecurity	1.00
1028	1/12/2023	Ohio Economic Update	1.00
1029	2/22/2023	Investment/Financing Update 2023	1.00
1206	1/20/2023	SW District Mtg - U-Turn, Recovery Docket, Clinton County Common Pleas, Legislative Update	1.50
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>362.25</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Lorain	J. Craig Snodgrass	39	4/25/2019	Spring 2019 Seminar	4.00
		40	6/5/2019	Intermediate Accounting Seminar	13.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		82	8/8/2019	Advanced Accounting Seminar	13.00
		99	9/6/2019	*Lorain County Alcohol & Drug Services	1.00
		120	10/4/2019	Ransomware Attacks	2.00
		150	10/29/2019	CPE Courses	8.00
		151	10/30/2019	CPE Courses	8.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
		162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
		163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
		214	3/6/2020	Local Government Funds	1.00
		247	5/13/2020	Spring CPE Virtual Conference - Finance	8.10
		249	8/5/2020	Advanced Governmental Accounting	13.00
		260	9/25/2020	HB481 - Local Government Cares Act	1.00
		265	10/2/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

373	10/21/2020	Ohio Sales & Use Tax: Recent Trends/Development/Planning Opportunities	1.50
374	10/21/2020	Legislative Update	1.50
375	10/21/2020	Replacing the Annual Performance Appraisal Ritual	1.50
376	10/21/2020	Economic Update	1.80
377	10/21/2020	Governmental Accounting & Auditing Update	1.80
378	10/22/2020	The Next Wave of Cyber Attacks	1.50
379	10/22/2020	Federal & State Tax Developments	1.50
380	10/22/2020	Cryptocurrency & Digital Assets: Considerations for Accounting Professionals	1.50
381	10/22/2020	Social Security Update: Planning for Today & Tomorrow	1.80
382	10/22/2020	Individual Tax Planning Strategies	1.80
433	2/5/2021	NE District Mtg-County Dog Warden & Their Responsibilities	1.00
454	3/5/2021	Fee Exempt Conveyances / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
533	5/6/2021	**Ohio Public Records Training	3.00
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
598	8/11/2021	Advanced Governmental Accounting Seminar	13.00
616	10/1/2021	*Current Drug Trend; COVID Impact on Drug Use; Drug Dog Demo	1.00
617	10/1/2021	Active Shooter: How to React in a Crisis Situation	1.00
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
674	10/22/2021	Legislative Update-NW District Mtg	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
713	2/4/2022	Current Residential Valuations in NE District; Legislative Update; AOS Keith Faber	1.50
738	4/1/2022	Western Reserve Land Conservancy; ODA Update; Legislative Update	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
837	8/17/2022	Ohio GFOA Advanced Governmental Accounting Seminar (2-days)	13.00
854	9/9/2022	Tax Lien Foreclosures; State Forefeitures; Outreach to Tax Delinquent Property Owners	1.50
880	10/7/2022	Ashtabula County Port Authority; Legislative Update	1.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1274	2/13/2023	February Monthly Federal Tax Update	2.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>201.30</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Lucas	Anita Lopez Katie Moline	49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
		163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
		452	2/26/2021	Automated Data Synchronization To/From CAMA / Legislative Update	1.50
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
		533	5/6/2021	**Ohio Public Records Training	3.00
		563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
		564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
		565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
		566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
		567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
674	10/22/2021	Legislative Update-NW District Mtg	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
727	2/25/2022	Your County's Social Media Presence; Legislative Update	1.00
734	3/25/2022	Picking Up the Pieces-Employee Mental Health; Legislative Update	1.00
832	7/22/2022	Confessions of Fraudsters - AOS	1.50
840	8/26/2022	Energy, Utility & Local Government Policy	1.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
1192	2/24/2023	NW District Mtg - Media Training	1.00
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>77.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Madison	Jennifer S. Hunter, CPA	32	5/17/2019	Ohio Auditor of State	1.00
		43	4/23/2019	Human Resources for Public Entities	1.00
		44	6/10/2019	*Ethics	3.00
		45	6/24/2019	Protection from Ransomware & Phishing	1.00
		46	6/26/2019	Auditing/Fraud	8.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		90	8/21/2019	Ohio Virtual Tax Academy	3.50
		95	7/9/2019	Performing Under Pressure	1.00
		96	7/30/2019	Having Difficult Conversations	1.00
		97	8/12/2019	Successfully Handle Workplace Pressure	1.00
		98	8/13/2019	Tax Deferred Exchange Issues	1.00
		135	9/12/2019	Software Solutions CPE Classroom Program	4.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
171	12/30/2019	How to Settle a Client's Estate	10.00
175	1/17/2020	Proposed Solar Farms & Update from State Reps.	1.00
238	6/15/2020	*Ohio Ethics Law 20/20	1.00
248	6/11/2020	Map a Course through Crisis	1.00
264	3/27/2020	COVID 19 Overview of Tax Changes	1.00
266	10/16/2020	Montgomery County Land Bank	1.00
272	5/13/2020	Navigating Workplace Accommodations	1.00
273	5/15/2020	COVID 19 Economic Webinar Series - County Models	1.00
274	6/23/2020	Solar Leasing 101	1.25
275	6/23/2020	Human Resources	2.25
276	6/24/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide	1.50
288	9/25/2020	Subgranting of Cares Act Funding	1.00
291	8/21/2020	How Cntys use Cares Act Dollars - Ottawa & Henry	1.00
299	7/15/2020	COVID 19 Funding Impact on your Single Audit	1.00
300	7/22/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide Update HB 481	2.00
309	6/19/2020	Southwest District Meeting	1.50
369	1/8/2021	*Ethics for Ohio CPA's	3.00
370	1/13/2021	Understanding the Employment Retention Credit	1.00
390	1/15/2021	Senate President Huffman; Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
470	2/16/2021	The Secure & Cares Acts: What to Plan for Ahead	1.00
471	7/14/2020	Retirement Plan Relief Under the Cares Act	0.50
472	8/17/2020	Increase Your Leadership Effectiveness	1.00
473	9/30/2020	1st Amendment Rights of Public Employees	1.00
474	10/13/2020	Agency in Motion: DISA	1.00
475	10/15/2020	Fighting Fraud in the Unemployment System During COVID-19	1.00
476	10/20/2020	Closing the Gap: CDM Role in Telework in Government	1.00
477	10/20/2020	Reimagining Cybersecurity	1.00
478	10/29/2020	Combating the Cybersecurity Risks of Telework	1.00
479	11/4/2020	Solving Dynamic School Challenges in Real Time	1.00
480	12/2/2020	Digital Future of Assessing	1.50
481	12/15/2020	Lead Service Line Replacement Funding	1.00
482	12/23/2020	Critical Tax Coverage Dec 2020 Coronavirus Relief Bill	1.00
483	12/30/2020	Year End Tax Planning W. Dec 2020 Coronavirus Bill	1.00
500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
533	5/6/2021	**Ohio Public Records Training	3.00
555	6/24/2021	OBM Local Government Update ARPA	1.00
606	9/1/2021	Utility-Scale Solar Workshop for Ohio Public Officials	5.00
609	5/14/2021	Transportation Improvement Districts; Legislative Update	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

619	6/15/2021	Rethinking Remote Work in the National Security Environment	1.00
620	7/13/2021	Helping Your Employees Prepare for Retirement	1.00
621	7/21/2021	Cyberthreats 2021	1.00
622	7/27/2021	Corsa Training	2.00
623	8/11/2021	ARPA Funds	1.00
624	8/20/2021	Trust Taxation 101	2.00
625	8/31/2021	Government Cybersecurity: An Ounce of Prevention	1.00
626	9/21/2021	Long Term Care - A Time Bomb for Your Retirement	1.00
627	3/16/2021	Critical Tax Coverage of the American Rescue Plan	1.00
628	4/14/2021	Peeling Back the Layers of Remote Work	1.00
629	4/29/2021	Local Government Update	2.00
635	10/15/2021	*Star House Rehab Facility	1.00
667	9/28/2021	How Tech is Helping Local Government Do More With Less	1.50
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
695	10/13/2021	Facing the Threat of Ransomware	1.00
696	10/26/2021	Financial Goal Setting	1.00
697	12/14/2021	The Art of Asking Powerful Questions	1.00
712	1/21/2022	Improve Your Federal Policies & Remain in Compliance; Legislative Update	1.50
713	2/4/2022	Current Residential Valuations in NE District; Legislative Update; AOS Keith Faber	1.50
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption-Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tifs, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
841	2/3/2022	Individual Tax Update 2022	1.00
842	9/7/2022	Introduction to Long-Term Care	1.00
873	9/16/2022	Representative Adam Bird; Judge Byrne-Ohio 12th Dst. Court of Appeals; Legislative Update	1.00
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25
907	3/4/2022	Muskingum Watershed Conservancy District; Voucher Issues; ODNR Presentation	2.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
1206	1/20/2023	SW District Mtg - U-Turn, Recovery Docket, Clinton County Common Pleas, Legislative Update	1.50
1221	1/6/2023	Intentional Time Management	1.00
1222	1/26/2023	When Does a Business have NEXUS?	1.00
1223	1/31/2023	Estate & Legacy Planning	1.00
1224	2/22/2023	Is Quickbooks desktop going away?	1.00
1225	2/22/2023	Getting Back to Who You Are: Authenticity	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00

**Total Hours: 175.50**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Mahoning	Ralph T. Meacham, CPA	18	4/9/2019	Tyler Connect 2019	4.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
		65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
		162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
		163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
		251	9/16/2020	OH GFOA Virt. Annual Conference/Meeting	11.80
		262	8/21/2020	HB481 - Cares Act; HB485; Legislative	1.00
		335	7/20/2020	2020 Non-Profit Update	4.00
		336	7/21/2020	2020 Non-Profit Update, day #2	4.00
		355	9/14/2020	2020 Fraud & Corruption Awareness Seminar	9.00
		364	10/22/2020	Youngstown Government & Not-for-Profit Update	8.00
		428	12/17/2020	Maher Duessel Government Update	2.00
		429	12/18/2020	Maher Duessel Government Update-PT 2	4.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

433	2/5/2021	NE District Mtg-County Dog Warden & Their Responsibilities	1.00
454	3/5/2021	Fee Exempt Conveyances / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
495	3/10/2021	Fundamentals of Debt Issuance	1.80
516	4/2/2021	School Report Card Reform Legislation {Rep. Don Jones}; Legislative Update	1.50
521	4/14/2021	Financial Report, Audit and Internal Control Basics	1.80
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
612	9/13/2021	2021 Fraud & Corruption Awareness Seminar	8.00
616	10/1/2021	*Current Drug Trend; COVID Impact on Drug Use; Drug Dog Demo	1.00
617	10/1/2021	Active Shooter: How to React in a Crisis Situation	1.00
618	10/1/2021	COVID in Terms of Stress & Our Mental Health	1.00
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
713	2/4/2022	Current Residential Valuations in NE District; Legislative Update; AOS Keith Faber	1.50
716	4/29/2021	Story of Your Finances Better: Meeting New Demand for Data; Earn Distinction	1.20
717	5/12/2021	Accounting Principles	1.80
718	12/10/2021	Youngstown Annual Update for Accountants & Auditors	8.00
719	9/21/2021	Mahoning Valley Tax Issues	6.00
738	4/1/2022	Western Reserve Land Conservancy; ODA Update; Legislative Update	1.00
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption-Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
799	5/23/2022	2022 Fraud & Corruption Awareness Seminar	8.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
824	8/5/2022	Drone Use in Law Enforcement; Special Assessments; Property Transfers; Delinquent Tax	2.50
880	10/7/2022	Ashtabula County Port Authority; Legislative Update	1.00
883	4/24/2020	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
907	3/4/2022	Muskingum Watershed Conservancy District; Voucher Issues; ODNR Presentation	2.00
913	10/4/2022	Mahoning County Tax Issues	9.00
939	12/1/2022	Monthly Webinar Series: Tax Update	3.00
940	12/5/2022	Monthly Webinar Series: Audit Update	3.00
941	12/8/2022	Monthly Webinar Series: Consulting, Technology & Advisory	3.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
963	12/13/2022	Monthly Webinar Series: Personal Finance & Retirement Planning	3.00
1200	3/10/2023	NE District Mtg - ODT Tax Commissioner, Weights & Measures Update, GIS Update	2.00
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
			<b>Total Hours: 219.65</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Marion	Joan M. Kasotis	5	3/22/2019	AOS Update & Sheriff K-9 Unit	1.50
		17	4/26/2019	Outside Bank Accounts	1.00
		27	5/15/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
91	8/23/2019	Erie County Development Issues & Legislation	1.50
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
260	9/25/2020	HB481 - Local Government Cares Act	1.00
265	10/2/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00
266	10/16/2020	Montgomery County Land Bank	1.00
280	6/5/2020	Understanding the Federal Cares Act	1.00
290	5/22/2020	How to use FEMA Public Assistance Funding	1.00
292	8/27/2020	Environmental Regulation	0.50
303	6/3/2020	Effectvie Property Tax Oversight Responses with COVID 19	2.00
310	6/2/2020	Unleash the Leader Within	8.50
311	6/5/2020	What NFP Executives Need to Know on Finance & PPP Loan Forgiveness	1.00
314	6/5/2020	Understanding Federal Cares Act-How Cty's Can Use Fund Pymts	1.25
317	5/18/2020	Impact of History/Now COVID-19	1.00
352	8/18/2020	Diversity/Tolerance: Defining Your Terms	1.00
353	8/27/2020	NARENCO/Chestnut Solar Farms	0.75
362	10/29/2020	CORSA/FDAR Marion County Human Resources Training	2.00
370	1/13/2021	Understanding the Employment Retention Credit	1.00
446	2/8/2021	Leadership and Love Language	1.00
447	2/9/2021	Solving the Mystery of Credit Reports	1.00
450	2/23/2021	Deeper Dive Into the Universal Waste Rules	1.00
452	2/26/2021	Automated Data Synchronization To/From CAMA / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
488	3/8/2021	Leadership and Love - Pt#2	1.00
489	3/9/2021	Women and Money	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
517	4/9/2021	Representative Stephens; Legislative Update	1.00
520	4/13/2021	Building Your Budget	1.00
524	4/16/2021	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
525	4/20/2021	Opportunities & Challenges of Drinking Water and Wastewater Regionalization	1.00
529	4/23/2021	Enhanced 911 Update; Legislative Update	1.00
532	5/10/2021	House Speaker Cupp/Senate President Huffman	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

534	5/5/2021	Is White Bashing Killing Diversity?	1.00
535	5/12/2021	Tolerance vs. Acceptance	1.00
541	5/19/2021	Tolerance, Your CEO, and Your Business	1.00
542	5/25/2021	Live Q & A with Scott O'Leary, Shark Tank	0.75
543	5/26/2021	Overcoming Implicit Bias in the Age of George Floyd	1.00
550	6/14/2021	Human Trafficking Initiative	1.00
553	6/24/2021	Understanding Real Differences vs. Stereotypes and Myths	1.00
555	6/24/2021	OBM Local Government Update ARPA	1.00
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
596	7/23/2021	Legislative Update; Mary Ellen Withrow-40th Treasurer of the U.S.	1.00
604	8/27/2021	AOS Keith Faber; Legislative Update; Tri Start Career Compact	1.00
607	8/12/2021	The Human Paradox: Do We Fear Black People?	1.00
650	10/6/2021	Evil Enablers	1.00
658	10/1/2021	Tolerance vs. Acceptance Discussion	1.00
659	11/2/2021	What is Offensive?	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
707	1/12/2022	SLFRF Final Rule Non-Tribal Recipient Briefing	1.00
712	1/21/2022	Improve Your Federal Policies & Remain in Compliance; Legislative Update	1.50
734	3/25/2022	Picking Up the Pieces-Employee Mental Health; Legislative Update	1.00
779	5/26/2022	Roundtable Discussion: Best Practice; Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

908	11/3/2022	Healing the Human Brain: What to Do? Pt.1	1.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>155.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Medina	Anthony P. Capretta	24	5/10/2019	Ohio Forest Tax Law	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
		65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
		99	9/6/2019	*Lorain County Alcohol & Drug Services	1.00
		107	9/11/2019	2019 IAAO Annual Conference	17.00
		120	10/4/2019	Ransomware Attacks	2.00
		162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
		177	1/17/2020	Ohio Civil Rights Update	3.00
		178	1/20/2020	Ohio Core Law Update	3.00
		179	1/20/2020	Commercial Real Estate Transaction Flow	3.00
		180	1/21/2020	Exploring Agency Concepts & Disclosure	4.00
		181	1/20/2020	*Ohio Canons of Ethics	3.00
		182	1/21/2020	Basic Construction Review	7.00
		183	1/21/2020	Evaluating Current Standards in Fair Housing	7.00
		214	3/6/2020	Local Government Funds	1.00
		230	4/6/2020	CMA Tips Webinar	1.00
		231	5/1/2020	Navigating Mixed Messages of COVID-19	1.00
		232	5/1/2020	Assessing COVID-19 What You Need to Know	2.00
		262	8/21/2020	HB481 - Cares Act; HB485; Legislative	1.00
		265	10/2/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00
		337	7/31/2020	Tax Abatement Study: Stakeholders Meeting	1.00
		338	8/12/2020	One Home-Overview	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

339	8/12/2020	School District Roundtable on COVID-19, Financial Impacts	1.00
340	7/29/2020	Building Your Brand	1.00
341	6/17/2020	Fraud Protection & Prevention	1.00
342	6/17/2020	Adjust Your Customer Service Approach	1.00
343	6/4/2020	Economy Update	1.00
454	3/5/2021	Fee Exempt Conveyances / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
516	4/2/2021	School Report Card Reform Legislation {Rep. Don Jones}; Legislative Update	1.50
519	4/13/2021	Local Government Officials Conference	11.75
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption-Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00

**Total Hours: 136.25**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Meigs	Mary T. Byer-Hill	21	5/3/2019	Bureau of Underground Storage Tank Regs	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
79	9/8/2019	Technology for Weights & Measures Calculations	1.00
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
174	1/10/2020	Update from State Representative Stephens	1.25
215	3/13/2020	COVID 19 by Rick Hoffman	1.00
263	8/14/2020	History of the Local Government Fund: Cares Act	1.50
267	10/30/2020	Abstracts Roundtable	1.00
389	1/8/2021	Special/Delinquent Assessments/Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
517	4/9/2021	Representative Stephens; Legislative Update	1.00
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
584	7/9/2021	A Look Back at the Roles & Responsibilities of the County Auditor	1.00
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
654	10/8/2021	Legislative Update; Informational Session w/CAAO Bsn Partners	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
732	3/11/2022	ODNR K9 Program; Legislative Update	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
888	10/14/2022	Update on HB 126; Legislative Update	1.50
916	10/27/2022	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
1190	1/13/2023	SE District Mtg - Certificate of Transition, Trees to Textbook, Ohio Forest Law, Legislative Update	2.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>109.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Mercer	Randall E. Grapner	25	5/15/2019	*Ohio Ethics Law Training	1.00
		27	5/15/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
		65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
		74	7/13/2019	Covering Bases in Residential Reporting	7.00
		75	7/14/2019	USPAP Update	7.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

91	8/23/2019	Erie County Development Issues & Legislation	1.50
130	10/21/2019	Ohio Pooled Collateral System	0.75
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
205	2/28/2020	Fulton County Health Center & Legislation	1.00
257	7/15/2020	Basic Construction Review	7.00
258	7/16/2020	Defensible Appraising	7.00
260	9/25/2020	HB481 - Local Government Cares Act	1.00
301	7/16/2020	Defensible Appraising	7.00
452	2/26/2021	Automated Data Synchronization To/From CAMA / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
514	3/26/2021	Special Assessments; Creating the Tax Bill; Legislative Update	1.50
529	4/23/2021	Enhanced 911 Update; Legislative Update	1.00
532	5/10/2021	House Speaker Cupp/Senate President Huffman	1.50
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
585	6/30/2021	2020-2021 7-hour Equivalent USPAP Update Course	7.00
586	7/12/2021	Green in Residences and Appraisals	7.00
596	7/23/2021	Legislative Update; Mary Ellen Withrow-40th Treasurer of the U.S.	1.00
604	8/27/2021	AOS Keith Faber; Legislative Update; Tri Start Career Compact	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
779	5/26/2022	Roundtable Discussion: Best Practice; Legislative Update	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
832	7/22/2022	Confessions of Fraudsters - AOS	1.50
840	8/26/2022	Energy, Utility & Local Government Policy	1.00
869	9/23/2022	The 20-mil Floor & Inside Millage Shift; Legislative Update	1.00
886	8/18/2022	**Certified Public Records Training	3.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
1192	2/24/2023	NW District Mtg - Media Training	1.00
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>160.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Miami	Matthew W. Gearhardt	1	3/15/2019	Downtown Redevelopment Districts	0.50
		6	3/12/2019	*Sexual Harassment in the Workplace	1.00
		32	5/17/2019	Ohio Auditor of State	1.00
		38	6/13/2019	*Good Government in Action	1.00
		68	7/23/2019	Human Resources Loss Control & Employee Performance	2.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
		162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
		163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
		197	2/25/2020	**Sunshine Law Training	3.00
		261	9/18/2020	Drone Technology	1.00
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
		563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
		564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
608	9/17/2021	Representative Creech / Legislative Update	1.00
609	5/14/2021	Transportation Improvement Districts; Legislative Update	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
711	1/26/2022	2021 CORSA/FDAR Human Resources Training- Miami County	2.00
861	9/7/2022	How to Avoid Claims Based on Human Resource Case Studies	2.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>57.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>		
Monroe	Denise Stoneking	732	3/11/2022	ODNR K9 Program; Legislative Update	1.00		
		769	5/13/2022	20 Mill Floor & Inside Millage Shift; Legislative Update	1.00		
		802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75		
		803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25		
		804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00		
		805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00		
		806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50		
		807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00		
		808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50		
		809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00		
		810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00		
		811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00		
		812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50		
		813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00		
		814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00		
		815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00		
		831	8/12/2022	CAUV Compliance; Muskingum Watershed Conservancy District	1.50		
		845	8/18/2022	How to Avoid Claims Based on Human Resource Case Studies	2.00		
		870	9/26/2022	*Ohio Ethics Law: Can I Do That?	1.00		
		888	10/14/2022	Update on HB 126; Legislative Update	1.50		
		895	10/25/2022	**Certified Public Records Training	3.00		
		<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>25.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Montgomery	Karl L. Keith	1	3/15/2019	Downtown Redevelopment Districts	0.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

9	4/12/2019	Fair Housing-Understanding Past for Better Tomorrow	3.00
32	5/17/2019	Ohio Auditor of State	1.00
49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
106	9/20/2019	Ohio GFOA 2019 Conference	8.00
115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
154	11/19/2019	State of Housing in Black America	1.00
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
175	1/17/2020	Proposed Solar Farms & Update from State Reps.	1.00
248	6/11/2020	Map a Course through Crisis	1.00
251	9/16/2020	OH GFOA Virt. Annual Conference/Meeting	6.80
266	10/16/2020	Montgomery County Land Bank	1.00
277	9/16/2020	*Ethics in the Real World	3.00
390	1/15/2021	Senate President Huffman; Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
551	6/16/2021	A Glance at Dayton Workforce Housing	1.50
552	6/16/2021	Harassment & Sexual Harassment Prevention-Mgrs/Supvs-Session 2	1.50
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
601	8/19/2021	Racism by Design: Understanding Redlining & Its Adverse Effects	2.00
614	9/22/2021	Ohio GFOA 34th Annual Conference	11.80
635	10/15/2021	*Star House Rehab Facility	1.00
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
702	8/30/2020	86th Annual IAAO Assessment Admin. Conference	2.00
703	9/1/2021	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
704	8/29/2021	2021 IAAO Virtual Assessment Admin. Conference	5.50
712	1/21/2022	Improve Your Federal Policies & Remain in Compliance; Legislative Update	1.50
739	3/18/2022	Brownfield Redevelopment at It's Finest; Legislative Update	1.00
763	4/14/2022	Fair Housing and Your Voice	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
1206	1/20/2023	SW District Mtg - U-Turn, Recovery Docket, Clinton County Common Pleas, Legislative Update	1.50
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>130.10</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Morgan	Randy Williams	49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
		904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25
		942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
		943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
		944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
		945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
		946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
		947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
		948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
		949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
		952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

1190	1/13/2023	SE District Mtg - Certificate of Transition, Trees to Textbook, Ohio Forest Law, Legislative Update	2.00
			<b>Total Hours: 23.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Morrow	Conni McChesney	5	3/22/2019	AOS Update & Sheriff K-9 Unit	1.50
		17	4/26/2019	Outside Bank Accounts	1.00
		27	5/15/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
		65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
		73	7/26/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
		91	8/23/2019	Erie County Development Issues & Legislation	1.50
		130	10/21/2019	Ohio Pooled Collateral System	0.75
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
		162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
		163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
		219	4/23/2020	Navigating Unemployment Ins during COVID 19	1.00
		223	3/20/2020	Frequently Asked Employer Questions	2.00
		227	3/31/2020	Coronavirus Latest State & Fed Updates	1.00
		237	3/22/2020	Families First Coronavirus Response	1.50
		260	9/25/2020	HB481 - Local Government Cares Act	1.00
		276	6/24/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide	1.50
		282	8/5/2020	Impact of OH Dpt. of Health Travel Advisory	1.00
		287	9/24/2020	COVID-19 & Impact on Single Audits	1.00
		300	7/22/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide Update HB 481	2.00
		306	8/12/2020	Navigating Unemployment Insurance	1.00
		318	9/23/2020	How Counties are Investing CRF Dollars-Support Non-Profits	1.50
		319	4/13/2020	Managing Local Gov't Finances in Emergency	1.00
		320	4/14/2020	Federal COVID-19 Cares Act CC Update	1.00
		321	4/22/2020	Understanding the FFRA Update	1.00
		322	4/28/2020	Morrow County-New Normal	1.00
		323	5/6/2020	Public Assistance Grants	1.50
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
532	5/10/2021	House Speaker Cupp/Senate President Huffman	1.50
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
633	10/6/2021	Reality Differences vs. Stereotype & Myths (HRCI Prgm #563582)	1.00
634	10/6/2021	Critical Race Theory vs. Tolerance & Implied Bias (HRCI Prgm #565294)	1.00
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
734	3/25/2022	Picking Up the Pieces-Employee Mental Health; Legislative Update	1.00
759	4/22/2022	GIS-Not Just Nosey Neighbors; Time Travel with GIS	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>105.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Muskingum	Debra J. Nye	21	5/3/2019	Bureau of Underground Storage Tank Regs	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
79	9/8/2019	Technology for Weights & Measures Calculations	1.00
92	8/29/2019	*Ethics Training	2.00
115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
119	10/9/2019	Discovering Insightful Patterns in Property Data	2.00
126	10/11/2019	DTE 93 Abstract & DTE 94 Exempt Abstract	1.00
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
174	1/10/2020	Update from State Representative Stephens	1.25
215	3/13/2020	COVID 19 by Rick Hoffman	1.00
254	7/13/2020	CORSA/FDAR Human Resources Trial	1.75
267	10/30/2020	Abstracts Roundtable	1.00
275	6/23/2020	Human Resources	2.25
389	1/8/2021	Special/Delinquent Assessments/Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
654	10/8/2021	Legislative Update; Informational Session w/CAAO Bsn Partners	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
732	3/11/2022	ODNR K9 Program; Legislative Update	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

769	5/13/2022	20 Mill Floor & Inside Millage Shift; Legislative Update	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
818	6/23/2022	**Certified Public Records Training	3.00
831	8/12/2022	CAUV Compliance; Muskingum Watershed Conservancy District	1.50
888	10/14/2022	Update on HB 126; Legislative Update	1.50
899	8/2/2022	*The Ohio Ethics Law: Watching Our Step	1.00
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25
911	7/18/2022	Real Property Value Complaints; Board of Revision	7.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
964	12/14/2022	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
967	12/28/2022	Protection from Ransomware & Phishing Attacks	1.00
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>138.25</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Noble	Ruth Hayes	36	6/11/2019	*Good Government in Action	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		79	9/8/2019	Technology for Weights & Measures Calculations	1.00
		89	8/19/2019	Cow/Calf Certification	2.00
		100	9/11/2019	Records Management - Electronic Records	2.00
		103	9/13/2019	Stewards of Children	2.00
		113	9/24/2019	*Sorting Out Confusion on CBD	0.50
		115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
		116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
		125	10/15/2019	Beef and Forage School	6.00
		143	11/13/2019	Ohio Virtual Tax Academy	3.00
		144	11/13/2019	Social Media Firestorms	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

145	10/23/2019	Professional Designations Create Opportunities	1.00
172	12/9/2019	Concepts in Records Management	1.00
203	1/18/2020	Noble County Forestry Workshop	3.00
216	4/13/2020	County Auditor Roundtable Discussion	1.00
221	4/30/2020	U.S. Public Financial Markets Update	1.00
223	3/20/2020	Frequently Asked Employer Questions	2.00
226	4/17/2020	Layoffs & Furloughs under Civil Service Law	1.00
229	1/30/2020	**Public Records / Sunshine Law Training	3.00
233	3/12/2020	What is a Deed & How Does Conveyance Work	7.00
237	3/22/2020	Families First Coronavirus Response	1.00
263	8/14/2020	History of the Local Government Fund: Cares Act	1.50
267	10/30/2020	Abstracts Roundtable	1.00
389	1/8/2021	Special/Delinquent Assessments/Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
517	4/9/2021	Representative Stephens; Legislative Update	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
831	8/12/2022	CAUV Compliance; Muskingum Watershed Conservancy District	1.50
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>75.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Ottawa	Jennifer J. Widmer	5	3/22/2019	AOS Update & Sheriff K-9 Unit	1.50
		17	4/26/2019	Outside Bank Accounts	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
73	7/26/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
83	8/8/2019	Computer Security Basics	1.00
115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
185	1/28/2020	Social Media: Records Management Challenge	1.00
205	2/28/2020	Fulton County Health Center & Legislation	1.00
217	4/17/2020	Reforecasting Budgets in Uncertain Times	1.00
248	6/11/2020	Map a Course through Crisis	1.00
260	9/25/2020	HB481 - Local Government Cares Act	1.00
276	6/24/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide	1.50
295	5/2/2020	Best Practices in Program Design	1.00
305	6/1/2020	Managing Federal Funds for COVID 19	1.00
452	2/26/2021	Automated Data Synchronization To/From CAMA / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
514	3/26/2021	Special Assessments; Creating the Tax Bill; Legislative Update	1.50
515	4/5/2021	**Ohio Sunshine Laws	3.00
529	4/23/2021	Enhanced 911 Update; Legislative Update	1.00
532	5/10/2021	House Speaker Cupp/Senate President Huffman	1.50
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
596	7/23/2021	Legislative Update; Mary Ellen Withrow-40th Treasurer of the U.S.	1.00
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
674	10/22/2021	Legislative Update-NW District Mtg	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
727	2/25/2022	Your County's Social Media Presence; Legislative Update	1.00
734	3/25/2022	Picking Up the Pieces-Employee Mental Health; Legislative Update	1.00
759	4/22/2022	GIS-Not Just Nosey Neighbors; Time Travel with GIS	1.00
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption-Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
779	5/26/2022	Roundtable Discussion: Best Practice; Legislative Update	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
832	7/22/2022	Confessions of Fraudsters - AOS	1.50
840	8/26/2022	Energy, Utility & Local Government Policy	1.00
905	10/28/2022	Update on HB 377; Legislative Update	1.00
912	9/12/2022	Real Property Value Complaints; Board of Revision	7.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
1192	2/24/2023	NW District Mtg - Media Training	1.00
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>140.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Paulding	Claudia J. Fickel	5	3/22/2019	AOS Update & Sheriff K-9 Unit	1.50
		17	4/26/2019	Outside Bank Accounts	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
73	7/26/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
205	2/28/2020	Fulton County Health Center & Legislation	1.00
216	4/13/2020	County Auditor Roundtable Discussion	1.00
260	9/25/2020	HB481 - Local Government Cares Act	1.00
285	8/21/2020	How Counties are using Cares Act Dollars - Fairfield/Richland	1.00
452	2/26/2021	Automated Data Synchronization To/From CAMA / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
524	4/16/2021	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
532	5/10/2021	House Speaker Cupp/Senate President Huffman	1.50
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
604	8/27/2021	AOS Keith Faber; Legislative Update; Tri Start Career Compact	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
727	2/25/2022	Your County's Social Media Presence; Legislative Update	1.00
759	4/22/2022	GIS-Not Just Nosey Neighbors; Time Travel with GIS	1.00
779	5/26/2022	Roundtable Discussion: Best Practice; Legislative Update	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
869	9/23/2022	The 20-mil Floor & Inside Millage Shift; Legislative Update	1.00
889	10/19/2022	Software Solutions 2022 Conference - (3-days)	10.50
905	10/28/2022	Update on HB 377; Legislative Update	1.00
910	11/4/2022	*Ohio Ethics Law 2022: Just the Facts	1.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
1192	2/24/2023	NW District Mtg - Media Training	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00

**Total Hours: 114.00**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Perry	Drew Cannon Derek Householder	21	5/3/2019	Bureau of Underground Storage Tank Regs	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		204	3/3/2020	Ohio Ethics Law 2020	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

263	8/14/2020	History of the Local Government Fund: Cares Act	1.50
267	10/30/2020	Abstracts Roundtable	1.00
389	1/8/2021	Special/Delinquent Assessments/Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
517	4/9/2021	Representative Stephens; Legislative Update	1.00
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
654	10/8/2021	Legislative Update; Informational Session w/CAAO Bsn Partners	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
888	10/14/2022	Update on HB 126; Legislative Update	1.50
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
1190	1/13/2023	SE District Mtg - Certificate of Transition, Trees to Textbook, Ohio Forest Law, Legislative Update	2.00

**Total Hours: 62.25**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Pickaway	Brad Washburn	1	3/15/2019	Downtown Redevelopment Districts	0.50
		32	5/17/2019	Ohio Auditor of State	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
105	9/20/2019	Ohio Weights & Measures Update	0.75
115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
131	10/25/2019	Ohio House Update - Representative Seitz	1.00
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
261	9/18/2020	Drone Technology	1.00
265	10/2/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00
266	10/16/2020	Montgomery County Land Bank	1.00
390	1/15/2021	Senate President Huffman; Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
516	4/2/2021	School Report Card Reform Legislation {Rep. Don Jones}; Legislative Update	1.50
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
609	5/14/2021	Transportation Improvement Districts; Legislative Update	1.00
635	10/15/2021	*Star House Rehab Facility	1.00
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tifs, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
873	9/16/2022	Representative Adam Bird; Judge Byrne-Ohio 12th Dst. Court of Appeals; Legislative Update	1.00
917	10/21/2022	Neil Armstrong Airport Improvements/History; Legislative Update	1.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>112.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Pike	Davida Brown	732	3/11/2022	ODNR K9 Program; Legislative Update	1.00
		765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption-Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
		769	5/13/2022	20 Mill Floor & Inside Millage Shift; Legislative Update	1.00
		801	6/23/2022	**Cerified Public Records Training	3.00
		802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
		803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
		804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
		805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
		806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tifs, Oh My!	1.50
		808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
		809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
		810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
		811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
		812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
		813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
		814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
		815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
		831	8/12/2022	CAUV Compliance; Muskingum Watershed Conservancy District	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

888	10/14/2022	Update on HB 126; Legislative Update	1.50
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
1190	1/13/2023	SE District Mtg - Certificate of Transition, Trees to Textbook, Ohio Forest Law, Legislative Update	2.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>44.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>		
Portage	Matt Kelly	24	5/10/2019	Ohio Forest Tax Law	1.00		
		77	8/2/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50		
		86	8/15/2019	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00		
		99	9/6/2019	*Lorain County Alcohol & Drug Services	1.00		
		136	10/30/2019	*Substance Abuse & Mental Health	6.00		
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00		
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00		
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50		
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00		
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50		
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00		
		265	10/2/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00		
		433	2/5/2021	NE District Mtg-County Dog Warden & Their Responsibilities	1.00		
		454	3/5/2021	Fee Exempt Conveyances / Legislative Update	1.50		
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00		
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00		
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00		
		513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00		
		516	4/2/2021	School Report Card Reform Legislation {Rep. Don Jones}; Legislative Update	1.50		
		564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00		
		738	4/1/2022	Western Reserve Land Conservancy; ODA Update; Legislative Update	1.00		
		765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption-Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50		
		<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>40.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Preble	Lavon Wright	1	3/15/2019	Downtown Redevelopment Districts	0.50
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
105	9/20/2019	Ohio Weights & Measures Update	0.75
131	10/25/2019	Ohio House Update - Representative Seitz	1.00
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
608	9/17/2021	Representative Creech / Legislative Update	1.00
635	10/15/2021	*Star House Rehab Facility	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
712	1/21/2022	Improve Your Federal Policies & Remain in Compliance; Legislative Update	1.50
739	3/18/2022	Brownfield Redevelopment at It's Finest; Legislative Update	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
873	9/16/2022	Representative Adam Bird; Judge Byrne-Ohio 12th Dst. Court of Appeals; Legislative Update	1.00
876	9/15/2022	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
1206	1/20/2023	SW District Mtg - U-Turn, Recovery Docket, Clinton County Common Pleas, Legislative Update	1.50
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>78.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Putnam	Robert L. Benroth	5	3/22/2019	AOS Update & Sheriff K-9 Unit	1.50
		13	4/18/2019	FDIC Director College	5.50
		14	4/19/2019	**Sunshine Law Training	3.00
		73	7/26/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
		108	9/16/2019	Director & Officer Workshop	6.00
		121	10/14/2019	Education Day	5.50
		205	2/28/2020	Fulton County Health Center & Legislation	1.00
		276	6/24/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide	2.00
		300	7/22/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide Update HB 481	2.00
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
		514	3/26/2021	Special Assessments; Creating the Tax Bill; Legislative Update	1.50
		528	4/29/2021	American Rescue Plan Act Guidance/Local Government Update	1.00
		546	10/22/2020	Personnel Training	1.00
		547	8/11/2020	Financial Training	3.30
		604	8/27/2021	AOS Keith Faber; Legislative Update; Tri Start Career Compact	1.00
		672	10/5/2021	CORSA Human Resources Training-Putnam County	1.50
		673	11/1/2021	IT Education Day-Union Bank Company	4.35
		688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
		689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
		690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
		698	1/3/2022	New Ability to Pay/Board Member Basics/IRA Secure Act	2.00
		759	4/22/2022	GIS-Not Just Nosey Neighbors; Time Travel with GIS	1.00
		761	2/18/2022	Fair Lending, UDAP, UDAAP, Vendor Management, Fedline Security	2.25
		773	5/19/2022	BSA Update; De-Risking Customers; Mng Risk- Court Ordered Accts; Risk Mgmt-Power of Attorneys	2.00
		893	10/24/2022	*Ohio Ethics Law 2022: Just the Facts	1.00
		943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
		944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>65.90</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Richland	Patrick W. Dropsey	146	5/21/2019	Social Engineering Red Flags	0.50
		147	7/29/2019	Strong Passwords	0.50
		148	9/17/2019	2019 Common Threats	0.50
		149	10/9/2019	Loss Control Incentive Program	2.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		206	11/27/2019	2018 Ransomware	0.50
		207	2/24/2020	King of Passwords	0.50
		208	2/15/2020	Security Awareness Training	0.25
		209	3/3/2020	*Ohio Ethics Law	1.00
		210	3/5/2020	Protecting Private Information	0.50
		211	3/5/2020	Security Awareness	0.50
		212	3/9/2020	Common Threats Part 1	0.50
		213	3/9/2020	Common Threats Part 2	0.50
		246	5/22/2020	Social Engineering Red Flag/Security	3.00
		262	8/21/2020	HB481 - Cares Act; HB485; Legislative	1.00
		268	10/26/2020	Spot the Phish Game	0.50
		269	8/31/2020	Relationship Trust	0.50
		270	6/17/2020	Human Resources Training	2.00
		433	2/5/2021	NE District Mtg-County Dog Warden & Their Responsibilities	1.00
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
		492	11/24/2020	Internet Security When You Work From Home	0.50
		493	12/24/2020	2021 Common Threats	0.50
		494	3/1/2021	2021 KnowBe4 Security Awareness Training	0.50
		548	6/3/2021	Security Awareness Foundations	0.50
		549	6/3/2021	Phishing Foundations	0.50
		602	8/23/2021	2021 Your Role: Internet Security and You	0.50
		631	9/22/2021	CORSA Human Resources Training (Richland Cty)	2.00
		632	9/30/2021	Corporate Email Tips	0.50
		683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
		684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
		685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
		686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
		687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
		688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
		689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
		762	3/22/2022	Respecting Privileged Access	0.50
		771	5/17/2022	Ransomware Threats	0.50
		827	1/5/2022	2021 Kevin Mitnick Security Awareness Training	0.25
		828	7/6/2022	Phishing Your Inbox	0.50
		829	8/11/2022	PII and You	0.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

877	9/14/2022	How to Avoid Claims Based on Human Resource Case Studies	2.00
878	9/20/2022	Respecting Privileged Access	0.50
881	10/18/2022	2022 Common Threats	0.50
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>51.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Ross	Jeff Lehner	732	3/11/2022	ODNR K9 Program; Legislative Update	1.00
		769	5/13/2022	20 Mill Floor & Inside Millage Shift; Legislative Update	1.00
		802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
		803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
		804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
		806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
		807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
		808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
		809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
		810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
		811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
		812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
		813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
		814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
		815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
		898	6/23/2022	**Certified Public Records Training	3.00
		942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
		943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
		944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
		945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
		946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
		947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
		948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
		949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
		950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
		951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
		952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>29.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Sandusky	Jerri A. Miller	5	3/22/2019	AOS Update & Sheriff K-9 Unit	1.50
		17	4/26/2019	Outside Bank Accounts	1.00
		27	5/15/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
73	7/26/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
91	8/23/2019	Erie County Development Issues & Legislation	1.50
115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
205	2/28/2020	Fulton County Health Center & Legislation	1.00
217	4/17/2020	Reforecasting Budgets in Uncertain Times	1.00
219	4/23/2020	Navigating Unemplymnt Ins during COVID 19	1.00
226	4/17/2020	Layoffs & Furloughs under Civil Service Law	1.00
238	6/15/2020	*Ohio Ethics Law 20/20	1.00
248	6/11/2020	Map a Course through Crisis	1.00
251	9/16/2020	OH GFOA Virt. Annual Conference/Meeting	11.00
260	9/25/2020	HB481 - Local Government Cares Act	1.00
265	10/2/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00
272	5/13/2020	Navigating Workplace Accomodations	1.00
273	5/15/2020	COVID 19 Economic Webinar Series - County Models	1.00
276	6/24/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide	1.50
291	8/21/2020	How Cntys use Cares Act Dollars - Ottawa & Henry	1.00
292	8/27/2020	Environmental Regulation	1.00
299	7/15/2020	COVID 19 Funding Impact on your Single Audit	1.00
303	6/3/2020	Effectvie Property Tax Oversight Responses with COVID 19	2.00
324	7/13/2020	Charities & Challenges During the Pandemic	1.00
325	5/7/2020	Return to Work Risk Considerations	0.50
326	5/14/2020	What is Life After Coronavirus? Navigating PPP Forgiveness/Certification Guidance	1.00
327	5/18/2020	Social Media: The Records Management Challenge	1.00
346	9/22/2020	CORSA/FDAR Sandusky County Human Resources Training	2.00
347	9/23/2020	HB 481 / HB 614	1.00
348	10/9/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
507	3/25/2021	American Rescue Plan: Key Takeaways/Latest Information on Allowable Uses	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
514	3/26/2021	Special Assessments; Creating the Tax Bill; Legislative Update	1.50
519	4/13/2021	Local Government Officials Conference	11.75

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

528	4/29/2021	American Rescue Plan Act Guidance/Local Government Update	1.00
529	4/23/2021	Enhanced 911 Update; Legislative Update	1.00
530	4/9/2021	Procurement Training	1.00
532	5/10/2021	House Speaker Cupp/Senate President Huffman	1.50
533	5/6/2021	**Ohio Public Records Training	3.00
596	7/23/2021	Legislative Update; Mary Ellen Withrow-40th Treasurer of the U.S.	1.00
614	9/22/2021	Ohio GFOA 34th Annual Conference	14.20
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
652	9/21/2021	Cybersecurity & Remote Work Training (Sandusky Cty)	2.00
653	8/10/2021	OTA - Use of ARPA Funds	2.00
674	10/22/2021	Legislative Update-NW District Mtg	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
727	2/25/2022	Your County's Social Media Presence; Legislative Update	1.00
779	5/26/2022	Roundtable Discussion: Best Practice; Legislative Update	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
840	8/26/2022	Energy, Utility & Local Government Policy	1.00
869	9/23/2022	The 20-mil Floor & Inside Millage Shift; Legislative Update	1.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>166.20</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Scioto	David L. Green	49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
128	10/18/2019	Deed and Conveyance Workshop	7.00
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
271	10/21/2020	Human Resources Training	2.00
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
706	1/12/2022	Corrective Action in 2021 Workplace/Cybersecurity & Remote Work	1.50
767	5/11/2022	*Ohio Drugfree Workplace Training For-Employees & Supervisors	2.00
769	5/13/2022	20 Mill Floor & Inside Millage Shift; Legislative Update	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
970	3/8/2023	**Certified Public Records Training Part 1-3	3.00
1214	3/8/2023	**Certified Public Records Training	3.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00

**Total Hours: 101.50**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Seneca	Julie A. Adkins	17	4/26/2019	Outside Bank Accounts	1.00
		20	5/1/2019	Legal and HR Updates for 2019	2.00
		27	5/15/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	1.00
		31	5/23/2019	Security in the Cloud	1.00
		37	6/12/2019	Changing Rules of the Workplace	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
		65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
		73	7/26/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
		91	8/23/2019	Erie County Development Issues & Legislation	1.50
		106	9/20/2019	Ohio GFOA 2019 Conference	17.50
		115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
		116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

122	10/16/2019	Loss Control to Avoid Employment Claims & Social Media	2.00
127	10/23/2019	**Sunshine Law Training	3.00
129	10/24/2019	Cyber Crime Detection and Prevention	1.00
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
205	2/28/2020	Fulton County Health Center & Legislation	1.00
216	4/13/2020	County Auditor Roundtable Discussion	1.00
218	3/27/2020	Employment Law FAQ's on Family First Act	1.00
219	4/23/2020	Navigating Unemployment Ins during COVID 19	1.00
220	4/30/2020	Next Step for Employers	1.50
223	3/20/2020	Frequently Asked Employer Questions	2.00
226	4/17/2020	Layoffs & Furloughs under Civil Service Law	1.00
227	3/31/2020	Coronavirus Latest State & Fed Updates	1.00
228	4/3/2020	Employment Implications during COVID Pandemic	1.00
248	6/11/2020	Map a Course through Crisis	1.00
251	9/16/2020	OH GFOA Virt. Annual Conference/Meeting	10.80
254	7/13/2020	CORSA/FDAR Human Resources Trial	1.75
260	9/25/2020	HB481 - Local Government Cares Act	1.00
261	9/18/2020	Drone Technology	1.00
263	8/14/2020	History of the Local Government Fund: Cares Act	1.50
265	10/2/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00
266	10/16/2020	Montgomery County Land Bank	1.00
267	10/30/2020	Abstracts Roundtable	1.00
276	6/24/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide	1.50
280	6/5/2020	Understanding the Federal Cares Act	1.00
299	7/15/2020	COVID 19 Funding Impact on your Single Audit	1.00
354	10/1/2020	Auditing of Cares Act	1.00
356	10/19/2020	CORSA Defensive Driving	1.50
357	10/22/2020	Employment Law & COVID-19: Safety Compliance/HR Challenges	1.00
358	11/10/2020	Employment Practices	1.00
359	10/7/2020	COVID-19 and HR Updates	1.50
360	11/4/2020	Auditor of State-Cares Act	0.75
361	12/3/2020	Next Steps in COVID-19: Protocols & Compliance	1.00
385	1/15/2021	Federal Policy Developments & Their Impact on Public Employees in 2021	1.00
433	2/5/2021	NE District Mtg-County Dog Warden & Their Responsibilities	1.00
449	2/17/2021	Key HR & Legal Updates for 2021	1.00
452	2/26/2021	Automated Data Synchronization To/From CAMA / Legislative Update	1.50
454	3/5/2021	Fee Exempt Conveyances / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
458	3/17/2020	Coronavirus: What Employers Need to Know	1.00
459	3/17/2020	Coronavirus	1.00
460	3/23/2020	COVID-19 Update Webinar	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

461	3/30/2020	Cares Act Explained	1.00
462	4/9/2020	COVID-19 Employer Financial Guidance	1.00
463	4/13/2020	What is Life After Coronavirus? HR Compliance in Your Gov't Entity/New Guidance Legislation	1.00
464	4/13/2020	Addressing Coronavirus Practically & Legally-Pt#3: What Us Employers Need to Know	1.00
465	4/14/2020	What is Life After Coronavirus? State & Local Tax: 1st Wave Response - 2nd Wave Predictions	1.00
466	4/17/2020	COVID-19 Update: Business Impact/Employer Considerations	1.00
467	4/28/2020	Employer Transition From Stay at Home Orders	1.00
468	4/30/2020	What is Life After Coronavirus? Leading the Re-Entry Process	1.00
490	3/10/2021	County Land Banks: Overview and Future Directions	1.00
499	3/18/2021	American Rescue Plan Act of 2021	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
514	3/26/2021	Special Assessments; Creating the Tax Bill; Legislative Update	1.50
519	4/13/2021	Local Government Officials Conference	11.75
531	4/27/2021	Are You Managing Your Cybersecurity Risk Exposure?	0.75
532	5/10/2021	House Speaker Cupp/Senate President Huffman	1.50
540	5/19/2021	Cyber Risks & Best Practices	1.00
555	6/24/2021	OBM Local Government Update ARPA	1.00
557	6/24/2021	SLFRF Reporting-#1-Counties w/pop Below 250,000	1.00
558	6/24/2021	Alternative Energy Zone Tax Exemptions for Wind & Solar Projects	1.00
559	6/29/2021	Understanding Eligible Uses of Fiscal Recovery Fund: Public Health Response	1.00
560	6/29/2021	How to Hire More Employees & Keep Them Happy-Employer Resources	1.00
561	6/30/2021	DTE Public Hearing for CAUV	1.00
562	6/30/2021	ARP State & Local Fiscal Recovery Fund Update: Treasury Compliance, Reporting Requirements	1.00
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
591	8/10/2021	Seneca Cty Township Mtg w/Heidi Fought-ARP Funds	1.50
592	8/9/2021	CSLFRF - Compliance & Reporting Guidance {ARP}	1.00
596	7/23/2021	Legislative Update; Mary Ellen Withrow-40th Treasurer of the U.S.	1.00
605	8/31/2021	ARPA & Equity: Long Term Planning for Local Governments	1.00
606	9/1/2021	Utility-Scale Solar Workshop for Ohio Public Officials	5.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

614	9/22/2021	Ohio GFOA 34th Annual Conference	13.00
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
674	10/22/2021	Legislative Update-NW District Mtg	1.00
679	12/14/2021	Dehumanizing Others	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
701	1/10/2022	State & Local Fiscal Recovery Funds: Final Rule: Non-tribal Recipient Briefing	1.00
713	2/4/2022	Current Residential Valuations in NE District; Legislative Update; AOS Keith Faber	1.50
727	2/25/2022	Your County's Social Media Presence; Legislative Update	1.00
743	4/13/2022	2022 Local Government Officials Conference	10.50
759	4/22/2022	GIS-Not Just Nosey Neighbors; Time Travel with GIS	1.00
779	5/26/2022	Roundtable Discussion: Best Practice; Legislative Update	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
832	7/22/2022	Confessions of Fraudsters - AOS	1.50
868	9/12/2022	Real Property Value Complaints & Countercomplaints Thru the BOR	6.50
869	9/23/2022	The 20-mil Floor & Inside Millage Shift; Legislative Update	1.00
874	9/28/2022	How to Avoid Claims Based on Human Resource Case Studies	2.00
900	10/5/2022	Ohio GFOA 35th Annual Conference (Oct 5-7)	16.60
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25
905	10/28/2022	Update on HB 377; Legislative Update	1.00
912	9/12/2022	Real Property Value Complaints; Board of Revision	7.00
914	10/19/2022	Software Solutions - CPE Classroom Program	4.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
1192	2/24/2023	NW District Mtg - Media Training	1.00
1200	3/10/2023	NE District Mtg - ODT Tax Commissioner, Weights & Measures Update, GIS Update	2.00
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>305.15</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Shelby	Amy L. Berning	1	3/15/2019	Downtown Redevelopment Districts	0.50
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
		65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
		105	9/20/2019	Ohio Weights & Measures Update	0.75
		115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
		116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
		131	10/25/2019	Ohio House Update - Representative Seitz	1.00
		175	1/17/2020	Proposed Solar Farms & Update from State Reps.	1.00
		217	4/17/2020	Reforecasting Budgets in Uncertain Times	1.00
		261	9/18/2020	Drone Technology	1.00
		266	10/16/2020	Montgomery County Land Bank	1.00
		390	1/15/2021	Senate President Huffman; Legislative Update	1.50
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
		500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
		513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
		563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
		564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
		565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
		566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
604	8/27/2021	AOS Keith Faber; Legislative Update; Tri Start Career Compact	1.00
609	5/14/2021	Transportation Improvement Districts; Legislative Update	1.00
635	10/15/2021	*Star House Rehab Facility	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
712	1/21/2022	Improve Your Federal Policies & Remain in Compliance; Legislative Update	1.50
739	3/18/2022	Brownfield Redevelopment at It's Finest; Legislative Update	1.00
801	6/23/2022	**Cerified Public Records Training	3.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
873	9/16/2022	Representative Adam Bird; Judge Byrne-Ohio 12th Dst. Court of Appeals; Legislative Update	1.00
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25
917	10/21/2022	Neil Armstrong Airport Improvements/History; Legislative Update	1.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
1206	1/20/2023	SW District Mtg - U-Turn, Recovery Docket, Clinton County Common Pleas, Legislative Update	1.50

**Total Hours: 108.75**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Stark	Alan Harold	24	5/10/2019	Ohio Forest Tax Law	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
		77	8/2/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
		115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
		120	10/4/2019	Ransomware Attacks	2.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		214	3/6/2020	Local Government Funds	1.00
		265	10/2/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00
		433	2/5/2021	NE District Mtg-County Dog Warden & Their Responsibilities	1.00
		454	3/5/2021	Fee Exempt Conveyances / Legislative Update	1.50
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
		513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
		563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
		564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
		597	8/6/2021	Senator Hoagland; Legislative Update	1.00
		616	10/1/2021	*Current Drug Trend; COVID Impact on Drug Use; Drug Dog Demo	1.00
		617	10/1/2021	Active Shooter: How to React in a Crisis Situation	1.00
		630	9/29/2021	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
		651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
		683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
		684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
		685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
		686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
		687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
		688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
713	2/4/2022	Current Residential Valuations in NE District; Legislative Update; AOS Keith Faber	1.50
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption-Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
854	9/9/2022	Tax Lien Foreclosures; State Forefeitures; Outreach to Tax Delinquent Property Owners	1.50
907	3/4/2022	Muskingum Watershed Conservancy District; Voucher Issues; ODNR Presentation	2.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
1200	3/10/2023	NE District Mtg - ODT Tax Commissioner, Weights & Measures Update, GIS Update	2.00
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>88.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Summit	Kristen M. Scalise, CPA, CFE	23	5/9/2019	Emerging Trends in Fraud Investigation	6.00
		78	5/9/2019	County Treasurers' Spring Conference	6.00
		85	8/13/2019	Detect & Prevent Financial Statement Fraud	20.00
		102	9/17/2019	*Ethical Issues for Fraud Examiners	2.00
		250	9/29/2020	*Dealing with Problem Employees	20.00
		432	2/4/2021	*Ohio Professional Standards & Responsibilities	3.00
		444	2/8/2021	Human Resources Handbook	18.00
		445	5/11/2020	*Ohio Professional Standards & Responsibilities	3.00
		533	5/6/2021	**Ohio Public Records Training	3.00
		583	7/1/2021	The Fraud Trial	20.00
		649	6/16/2020	Finding the Truth	16.00
		797	5/23/2022	*Ethics & Independence Rules for SSARS Engagements	3.00
		798	6/9/2022	Basic Excel	20.00
		892	10/21/2022	Making Crime Pay	20.00
		1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
		1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>162.00</b>

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Trumbull	Martha Yoder	49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		164	5/3/2019	Financial Crimes & Case Studies	6.00
		165	11/14/2019	*Ohio Professional Standards & Responsibilities	3.00
		166	11/26/2019	Identity Theft & Financial Privacy	8.00
		167	12/10/2019	Individual Income Tax Returns 2019	24.00
		168	12/16/2019	New FHA Analysis	7.00
		169	12/17/2019	Appraisal of Smal Residential Income Property	7.00
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
		<b>Total Hours:</b>			

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Tuscarawas	Larry Lindberg	24	5/10/2019	Ohio Forest Tax Law	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
		65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
		77	8/2/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
		101	9/13/2019	**Certified Public Records Training	3.00
		115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
		116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
		120	10/4/2019	Ransomware Attacks	2.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
		162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
		163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
		262	8/21/2020	HB481 - Cares Act; HB485; Legislative	1.00
		265	10/2/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00
		273	5/15/2020	COVID 19 Economic Webinar Series - County Models	1.00
		276	6/24/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide	1.00
		285	8/21/2020	How Counties are using Cares Act Dollars - Fairfield/Richland	1.00
289	10/1/2020	Auditing of Cares Act Funding	1.00		

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

291	8/21/2020	How Cntys use Cares Act Dollars - Ottawa & Henry	1.00
300	7/22/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide Update HB 481	1.50
314	6/5/2020	Understanding Federal Cares Act-How Cty's Can Use Fund Pymts	1.00
319	4/13/2020	Managing Local Gov't Finances in Emergency	1.00
433	2/5/2021	NE District Mtg-County Dog Warden & Their Responsibilities	1.00
454	3/5/2021	Fee Exempt Conveyances / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
484	5/4/2020	FEMA Public Assistance Applicant's Briefing	1.50
485	8/17/2020	How to Use CARES Act Funds: Virtual Q&A - Ohio OBM	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
516	4/2/2021	School Report Card Reform Legislation {Rep. Don Jones}; Legislative Update	1.50
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
597	8/6/2021	Senator Hoagland; Legislative Update	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
713	2/4/2022	Current Residential Valuations in NE District; Legislative Update; AOS Keith Faber	1.50
738	4/1/2022	Western Reserve Land Conservancy; ODA Update; Legislative Update	1.00
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption-Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
907	3/4/2022	Muskingum Watershed Conservancy District; Voucher Issues; ODNR Presentation	2.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>130.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Union	Andrea L. Weaver	1	3/15/2019	Downtown Redevelopment Districts	0.50
		12	4/9/2019	Challenging Issues: Commercial Property Valuation	7.00
		23	5/9/2019	Emerging Trends in Fraud Investigation	16.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
		65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
		105	9/20/2019	Ohio Weights & Measures Update	0.75
		106	9/20/2019	Ohio GFOA 2019 Conference	6.00
		107	9/11/2019	2019 IAAO Annual Conference	15.25
		115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
		116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
		123	10/16/2019	Good Government in Action	1.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
173	1/8/2020	**Sunshine Law Training	3.00
216	4/13/2020	County Auditor Roundtable Discussion	1.00
217	4/17/2020	Reforecasting Budgets in Uncertain Times	1.00
218	3/27/2020	Employment Law FAQ's on Family First Act	1.00
223	3/20/2020	Frequently Asked Employer Questions	2.00
227	3/31/2020	Coronavirus Latest State & Fed Updates	1.00
251	9/16/2020	OH GFOA Virt. Annual Conference/Meeting	9.80
260	9/25/2020	HB481 - Local Government Cares Act	1.00
261	9/18/2020	Drone Technology	1.00
265	10/2/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00
266	10/16/2020	Montgomery County Land Bank	1.00
267	10/30/2020	Abstracts Roundtable	1.00
389	1/8/2021	Special/Deliquent Assessments/Legislative Update	1.50
390	1/15/2021	Senate President Huffman; Legislative Update	1.50
433	2/5/2021	NE District Mtg-County Dog Warden & Their Responsibilities	1.00
452	2/26/2021	Automated Data Synchronization To/From CAMA / Legislative Update	1.50
454	3/5/2021	Fee Exempt Conveyances / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
510	3/12/2021	*Workshop 171: Standards of Professional Practice & Ethics 2020	2.00
511	10/28/2020	*Ohio Ethics Law 2020	1.00
516	4/2/2021	School Report Card Reform Legislation {Rep. Don Jones}; Legislative Update	1.50
517	4/9/2021	Representative Stephens; Legislative Update	1.00
518	4/12/2021	2020-2021 National USPAP Update Course	7.00
532	5/10/2021	House Speaker Cupp/Senate President Huffman	1.50
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
584	7/9/2021	A Look Back at the Roles & Responsibilities of the County Auditor	1.00
604	8/27/2021	AOS Keith Faber; Legislative Update; Tri Start Career Compact	1.00
609	5/14/2021	Transportation Improvement Districts; Legislative Update	1.00
610	9/1/2021	87th Annual Conference on Assessment Administration	8.00
614	9/22/2021	Ohio GFOA 34th Annual Conference	14.40
616	10/1/2021	*Current Drug Trend; COVID Impact on Drug Use; Drug Dog Demo	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

617	10/1/2021	Active Shooter: How to React in a Crisis Situation	1.00
618	10/1/2021	COVID in Terms of Stress & Our Mental Health	1.00
635	10/15/2021	*Star House Rehab Facility	1.00
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
654	10/8/2021	Legislative Update; Informational Session w/CAAO Bsn Partners	1.00
674	10/22/2021	Legislative Update-NW District Mtg	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
712	1/21/2022	Improve Your Federal Policies & Remain in Compliance; Legislative Update	1.50
738	4/1/2022	Western Reserve Land Conservancy; ODA Update; Legislative Update	1.00
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption- Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
777	5/16/2022	ACFE 21st Annual Emerging Trends in Fraud Investigation/Protection Conference	15.25
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tifs, Oh My!	1.50
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
900	10/5/2022	Ohio GFOA 35th Annual Conference (Oct 5-7)	10.00
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25
906	8/29/2022	2022 IAAO Annual Conference (8/29-8/31)	9.50
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
1206	1/20/2023	SW District Mtg - U-Turn, Recovery Docket, Clinton County Common Pleas, Legislative Update	1.50
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00

**Total Hours: 254.45**

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Van Wert	Jami Bradford	5	3/22/2019	AOS Update & Sheriff K-9 Unit	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
73	7/26/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
130	10/21/2019	Ohio Pooled Collateral System	0.75
205	2/28/2020	Fulton County Health Center & Legislation	1.00
238	6/15/2020	*Ohio Ethics Law 20/20	1.00
433	2/5/2021	NE District Mtg-County Dog Warden & Their Responsibilities	1.00
452	2/26/2021	Automated Data Synchronization To/From CAMA / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
496	2/10/2021	Budget Basics	1.80
497	2/11/2021	*Ohio Ethics Law: Building a Culture of Integrity	1.00
500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
514	3/26/2021	Special Assessments; Creating the Tax Bill; Legislative Update	1.50
524	4/16/2021	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
529	4/23/2021	Enhanced 911 Update; Legislative Update	1.00
532	5/10/2021	House Speaker Cupp/Senate President Huffman	1.50
596	7/23/2021	Legislative Update; Mary Ellen Withrow-40th Treasurer of the U.S.	1.00
603	8/5/2021	Global Leadership Summit 2021 {2-days}	13.00
604	8/27/2021	AOS Keith Faber; Legislative Update; Tri Start Career Compact	1.00
674	10/22/2021	Legislative Update-NW District Mtg	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

714	2/24/2022	EEOC on Inequity, Harassment & Discrimination in 2022	2.00
759	4/22/2022	GIS-Not Just Nosey Neighbors; Time Travel with GIS	1.00
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption-Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
779	5/26/2022	Roundtable Discussion: Best Practice; Legislative Update	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
825	8/4/2022	Global Leadership Summit {2-days}	12.00
832	7/22/2022	Confessions of Fraudsters - AOS	1.50
840	8/26/2022	Energy, Utility & Local Government Policy	1.00
869	9/23/2022	The 20-mil Floor & Inside Millage Shift; Legislative Update	1.00
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25
905	10/28/2022	Update on HB 377; Legislative Update	1.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>131.05</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Vinton	Cindy Waugh	21	5/3/2019	Bureau of Underground Storage Tank Regs	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
126	10/11/2019	DTE 93 Abstract & DTE 94 Exempt Abstract	1.00
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
174	1/10/2020	Update from State Representative Stephens	1.25
215	3/13/2020	COVID 19 by Rick Hoffman	1.00
263	8/14/2020	History of the Local Government Fund: Cares Act	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
517	4/9/2021	Representative Stephens; Legislative Update	1.00
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
732	3/11/2022	ODNR K9 Program; Legislative Update	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
888	10/14/2022	Update on HB 126; Legislative Update	1.50
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

1190	1/13/2023	SE District Mtg - Certificate of Transition, Trees to Textbook, Ohio Forest Law, Legislative Update	2.00
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>89.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Warren	Matt Nolan	49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		105	9/20/2019	Ohio Weights & Measures Update	0.75
		131	10/25/2019	Ohio House Update - Representative Seitz	1.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
		175	1/17/2020	Proposed Solar Farms & Update from State Reps.	1.00
		185	1/28/2020	Social Media: Records Management Challenge	1.00
		186	10/23/2019	*Pretrial and Trial Ethics	1.00
		187	1/30/2020	**Sunshine Law Training	3.00
		188	11/19/2019	Ohio County Auditors' Take on Blockchain	1.00
		189	11/19/2019	Cyber Security	1.00
		192	2/14/2020	*Ohio Ethics Law 2020	1.00
		266	10/16/2020	Montgomery County Land Bank	1.00
		390	1/15/2021	Senate President Huffman; Legislative Update	1.50
		455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
		456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
		457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
		563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
		712	1/21/2022	Improve Your Federal Policies & Remain in Compliance; Legislative Update	1.50
		739	3/18/2022	Brownfield Redevelopment at It's Finest; Legislative Update	1.00
		942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
		943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
		944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
		945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
		946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
		1206	1/20/2023	SW District Mtg - U-Turn, Recovery Docket, Clinton County Common Pleas, Legislative Update	1.50
		1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>					<b>39.75</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Washington	Matthew Livengood	21	5/3/2019	Bureau of Underground Storage Tank Regs	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
79	9/8/2019	Technology for Weights & Measures Calculations	1.00
115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
126	10/11/2019	DTE 93 Abstract & DTE 94 Exempt Abstract	1.00
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
174	1/10/2020	Update from State Representative Stephens	1.25
215	3/13/2020	COVID 19 by Rick Hoffman	1.00
263	8/14/2020	History of the Local Government Fund: Cares Act	1.50
267	10/30/2020	Abstracts Roundtable	1.00
389	1/8/2021	Special/Delinquent Assessments/Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
517	4/9/2021	Representative Stephens; Legislative Update	1.00
577	4/13/2021	2021 Local Gov't Officials Conference	5.75
584	7/9/2021	A Look Back at the Roles & Responsibilities of the County Auditor	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
871	9/26/2022	*Ohio Ethics Law: Watching Our Step!	1.00
888	10/14/2022	Update on HB 126; Legislative Update	1.50
915	10/25/2022	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
1190	1/13/2023	SE District Mtg - Certificate of Transition, Trees to Textbook, Ohio Forest Law, Legislative Update	2.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>97.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Wayne	Jarra L. Underwood	24	5/10/2019	Ohio Forest Tax Law	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
		64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
		65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
		77	8/2/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
		99	9/6/2019	*Lorain County Alcohol & Drug Services	1.00
		114	9/25/2019	Workplace Civility & Avoiding Bullying	1.50
		115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
		116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
		120	10/4/2019	Ransomware Attacks	2.00
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
		162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
		163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
		214	3/6/2020	Local Government Funds	1.00
		219	4/23/2020	Navigating Unemployment Ins during COVID 19	1.00
		255	8/27/2020	Environmental Regulations	1.00
		262	8/21/2020	HB481 - Cares Act; HB485; Legislative	1.00
		276	6/24/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide	1.50
		291	8/21/2020	How Cntys use Cares Act Dollars - Ottawa & Henry	1.00
		300	7/22/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide Update HB 481	2.00
		349	10/20/2020	Fraudulent Document Training	0.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

350	9/10/2020	HR Policies & Guide to Employees Contracting COVID-19	1.00
351	9/21/2020	BMV Roundtable-Training for Deputy Registrars	1.50
361	12/3/2020	Next Steps in COVID-19: Protocols & Compliance	1.00
366	12/14/2020	BMV Roundtable-Training for Registrars	1.00
367	12/15/2020	*Ohio Ethics Law: Can I do That?	1.00
384	1/14/2021	1099-NEC & 1099 Misc./Awareness/Assistance Day	0.50
387	1/26/2021	Fraudulent Documents -2-Class	1.00
433	2/5/2021	NE District Mtg-County Dog Warden & Their Responsibilities	1.00
454	3/5/2021	Fee Exempt Conveyances / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
491	3/11/2021	BMV Roundtable	1.00
506	3/24/2021	Q-Anywhere for License Bureau	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
516	4/2/2021	School Report Card Reform Legislation {Rep. Don Jones}; Legislative Update	1.50
533	5/6/2021	**Ohio Public Records Training	3.00
537	5/13/2021	State & Local Fiscal Recovery Program	0.50
538	5/18/2021	Local Government Update: American Rescue Plan	1.00
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
616	10/1/2021	*Current Drug Trend; COVID Impact on Drug Use; Drug Dog Demo	1.00
617	10/1/2021	Active Shooter: How to React in a Crisis Situation	1.00
618	10/1/2021	COVID in Terms of Stress & Our Mental Health	1.00
715	2/3/2022	Discriminatory Harassment-Andrew Esposito	2.00
738	4/1/2022	Western Reserve Land Conservancy; ODA Update; Legislative Update	1.00
765	5/6/2022	The Real Estate Market; Public Corruption-Dimora/Russo Case, What Did We Learn; Legislative Update	2.50
795	6/7/2022	Ohio BMV Spring Roundtable Training	1.00
800	6/22/2022	Preparing Public Leaders to Effectively Lead in a Crisis	3.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tifs, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
824	8/5/2022	Drone Use in Law Enforcement; Special Assessments; Property Transfers; Delinquent Tax	2.50
854	9/9/2022	Tax Lien Foreclosures; State Forefeitures; Outreach to Tax Delinquent Property Owners	1.50
880	10/7/2022	Ashtabula County Port Authority; Legislative Update	1.00
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
1200	3/10/2023	NE District Mtg - ODT Tax Commissioner, Weights & Measures Update, GIS Update	2.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>143.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Williams	Vickie L Grimm	5	3/22/2019	AOS Update & Sheriff K-9 Unit	1.50
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
		60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
		61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
		62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
		73	7/26/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
		155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
		156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
		157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
		158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
		159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
		160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
		161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
		162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
205	2/28/2020	Fulton County Health Center & Legislation	1.00
260	9/25/2020	HB481 - Local Government Cares Act	1.00
263	8/14/2020	History of the Local Government Fund: Cares Act	1.50
433	2/5/2021	NE District Mtg-County Dog Warden & Their Responsibilities	1.00
452	2/26/2021	Automated Data Synchronization To/From CAMA / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
514	3/26/2021	Special Assessments; Creating the Tax Bill; Legislative Update	1.50
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
779	5/26/2022	Roundtable Discussion: Best Practice; Legislative Update	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tif's, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
887	9/4/2019	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
905	10/28/2022	Update on HB 377; Legislative Update	1.00
			<b>Total Hours: 75.50</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Wood	Matthew R. Oestreich	5	3/22/2019	AOS Update & Sheriff K-9 Unit	1.50
		17	4/26/2019	Outside Bank Accounts	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements \*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
73	7/26/2019	*Substance Abuse Training	1.50
91	8/23/2019	Erie County Development Issues & Legislation	1.50
115	9/26/2019	Education Workshop AM Session	2.25
116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
119	10/9/2019	Discovering Insightful Patterns in Property Data	2.00
130	10/21/2019	Ohio Pooled Collateral System	0.75
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
205	2/28/2020	Fulton County Health Center & Legislation	1.00
260	9/25/2020	HB481 - Local Government Cares Act	1.00
266	10/16/2020	Montgomery County Land Bank	1.00
452	2/26/2021	Automated Data Synchronization To/From CAMA / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
514	3/26/2021	Special Assessments; Creating the Tax Bill; Legislative Update	1.50
524	4/16/2021	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
529	4/23/2021	Enhanced 911 Update; Legislative Update	1.00
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
596	7/23/2021	Legislative Update; Mary Ellen Withrow-40th Treasurer of the U.S.	1.00
604	8/27/2021	AOS Keith Faber; Legislative Update; Tri Start Career Compact	1.00
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
674	10/22/2021	Legislative Update-NW District Mtg	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
727	2/25/2022	Your County's Social Media Presence; Legislative Update	1.00
734	3/25/2022	Picking Up the Pieces-Employee Mental Health; Legislative Update	1.00
759	4/22/2022	GIS-Not Just Nosey Neighbors; Time Travel with GIS	1.00
779	5/26/2022	Roundtable Discussion: Best Practice; Legislative Update	1.00
802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tifs, Oh My!	1.50
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
832	7/22/2022	Confessions of Fraudsters - AOS	1.50
840	8/26/2022	Energy, Utility & Local Government Policy	1.00
869	9/23/2022	The 20-mil Floor & Inside Millage Shift; Legislative Update	1.00
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25
905	10/28/2022	Update on HB 377; Legislative Update	1.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
949	11/17/2022	Cybersecurity in a Remote Work Environment	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
952	11/17/2022	Breakout Sessions	1.00
1192	2/24/2023	NW District Mtg - Media Training	1.00
1292	3/8/2023	March Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
<b>Total Hours:</b>			<b>123.00</b>

<u>County</u>	<u>Auditor</u>	<u>Course #</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Course Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Wyandot	George W. Kitzler	17	4/26/2019	Outside Bank Accounts	1.00
		27	5/15/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	1.00
		49	6/18/2019	Creative PR Tips for County Auditors	0.75
		50	6/18/2019	*Ohio Ethics Laws	1.00
		51	6/18/2019	Personnel Issues	1.50
		52	6/19/2019	Implementation of Display of Fuel Tax Notices	0.50
		53	6/19/2019	Preparing Financial Statements & Reporting	1.00
		54	6/19/2019	Legal Update, Public Purpose, Best Practices	1.00
		55	6/19/2019	Understanding Audit Reports, Internal Controls	1.00
		56	6/19/2019	Single Audit Update	1.00
		57	6/19/2019	Payroll, Fraud, Direct Deposit, Etc.	1.00
		58	6/20/2019	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

59	6/20/2019	Valuing Real Property	1.25
60	6/20/2019	Homestead Exemption	0.75
61	6/20/2019	CAUV	0.75
62	6/20/2019	Budget Commission	1.00
63	6/20/2019	Legislative Update	1.00
64	6/21/2019	IRS Problems	1.50
65	6/21/2019	Everything You Want to Know About Being a County Auditor	1.50
91	8/23/2019	Erie County Development Issues & Legislation	1.50
106	9/20/2019	Ohio GFOA 2019 Conference	14.00
107	9/11/2019	2019 IAAO Annual Conference	14.00
116	9/26/2019	Education Workshop PM Session	3.00
130	10/21/2019	Ohio Pooled Collateral System	0.75
155	11/20/2019	Keynote Speakers AOS & ODT	1.00
156	11/20/2019	OH S Ct Government Conflict Resolution	1.00
157	11/20/2019	Secretary of State Frank LaRose	0.50
158	11/20/2019	County Auditors' Roundtable Discussions	3.00
159	11/21/2019	Solve Employee Problems Before they Start	1.50
160	11/21/2019	Valuation of Pipelines & Commodity	2.00
161	11/21/2019	Crisis Management	1.50
162	11/22/2019	Cybersecurity Training	1.25
163	11/22/2019	OPERS Update	1.25
205	2/28/2020	Fulton County Health Center & Legislation	1.00
216	4/13/2020	County Auditor Roundtable Discussion	1.00
217	4/17/2020	Reforecasting Budgets in Uncertain Times	1.00
221	4/30/2020	U.S. Public Financial Markets Update	1.00
226	4/17/2020	Layoffs & Furloughs under Civil Service Law	1.00
260	9/25/2020	HB481 - Local Government Cares Act	1.00
265	10/2/2020	IRS Fringe Benefits	1.00
266	10/16/2020	Montgomery County Land Bank	1.00
276	6/24/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide	1.50
280	6/5/2020	Understanding the Federal Cares Act	1.00
282	8/5/2020	Impact of OH Dpt. of Health Travel Advisory	1.00
294	6/16/2020	Accelerate IT Modernization with Strategic Contract Transition	1.00
296	6/10/2020	Billing and Payments in 2020	1.00
298	6/29/2020	Changing Role of Technology in the Intelligence Community	1.00
300	7/22/2020	COVID Relief Fund Local Assist Guide Update HB 481	1.50
302	6/11/2020	Defensive Driving Basics	1.00
304	6/18/2020	Importance of Cybersecurity during COVID-19	1.00
307	5/27/2020	Reopening Counties Virtual Town Hall	1.50
313	4/13/2020	*Behavioral Health Training	1.00
314	6/5/2020	Understanding Federal Cares Act-How Cty's Can Use Fund Pymts	1.00
330	7/16/2020	Managing Contaminated Sites in Your Community	1.00
331	7/28/2020	Combating the Cybersecurity Risks of Telework	1.00
332	8/4/2020	Ensuring Security for Virtual & Physical Networks	1.00
333	8/6/2020	Election Security: Protecting the Foundation of Democracy	1.00
334	8/13/2020	Digital Resilience: Proactive Data Protection in Government	1.00
368	12/17/2020	**Sunshine Laws Training	3.00
389	1/8/2021	Special/Delinquent Assessments/Legislative Update	1.50
452	2/26/2021	Automated Data Synchronization To/From CAMA / Legislative Update	1.50

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*



## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

454	3/5/2021	Fee Exempt Conveyances / Legislative Update	1.50
455	11/18/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #1	4.00
456	11/19/2020	*Alcohol & Drug Abuse Training - 2020 Virtual Winter Conference	1.00
457	11/19/2020	2020 Virtual Winter Conference - Day #2	3.00
500	3/19/2021	Hon. Bob Hackett; Legislative Update	1.00
513	3/31/2021	CAUV Training	2.00
514	3/26/2021	Special Assessments; Creating the Tax Bill; Legislative Update	1.50
517	4/9/2021	Representative Stephens; Legislative Update	1.00
521	4/14/2021	Financial Report, Audit and Internal Control Basics	1.80
529	4/23/2021	Enhanced 911 Update; Legislative Update	1.00
532	5/10/2021	House Speaker Cupp/Senate President Huffman	1.50
536	5/12/2021	Accounting Principles	1.50
563	6/9/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
564	6/9/2021	ARPA Funds	2.00
565	6/10/2021	Alternative Energy: Solar/Wind	1.00
566	6/10/2021	Commercial Valuation, COVID and SB 57	1.00
567	6/10/2021	Updates in Real Estate	1.00
568	6/10/2021	Conveyance Issues/LLC's/Trusts	1.00
569	6/10/2021	Carryover / Rates	1.00
570	6/10/2021	School Funding	1.00
571	6/11/2021	Ohio Public Defender Software	1.00
572	6/11/2021	Ohio Auditor of State's Office - Update	1.00
573	6/11/2021	Hot Topic HR Issues	1.00
594	7/29/2021	Corrective Action & Employee Claims-Discrimination, Harassment, Retaliation	1.00
595	7/29/2021	Cybersecurity & Remote Work	1.00
596	7/23/2021	Legislative Update; Mary Ellen Withrow-40th Treasurer of the U.S.	1.00
614	9/22/2021	Ohio GFOA 34th Annual Conference	15.40
651	10/20/2021	ARPA Funds Update-Legislative Day	2.00
674	10/22/2021	Legislative Update-NW District Mtg	1.00
680	12/14/2021	Building Advanced Teams in Gov't Takes Teamwork, Tools & Talent	1.00
683	11/17/2021	Legislative Update	1.00
684	11/17/2021	ARPA Fund Audits Update	0.50
685	11/17/2021	The Benefits of Cloud Computing	1.00
686	11/17/2021	Cybersecurity	1.50
687	11/18/2021	Hiring Good Employees	1.00
688	11/18/2021	Social Media & Crisis Communications	1.50
689	11/18/2021	Division of Tax Equalization Update	1.00
690	11/18/2021	Breakout Discussion (County Issues)	1.75
691	11/19/2021	Green Circle Growers & Legislative Strategy Response	1.00
692	11/19/2021	Conveyance	1.50
727	2/25/2022	Your County's Social Media Presence; Legislative Update	1.00
729	3/9/2022	2022 Ohio Safety Congress & Expo	7.50
734	3/25/2022	Picking Up the Pieces-Employee Mental Health; Legislative Update	1.00
743	4/13/2022	2022 Local Government Officials Conference	10.50
759	4/22/2022	GIS-Not Just Nosey Neighbors; Time Travel with GIS	1.00
779	5/26/2022	Roundtable Discussion: Best Practice; Legislative Update	1.00

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*

## *Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report*

802	6/8/2022	Forestry Update	0.75
803	6/8/2022	House Bill 126 Update	0.25
804	6/8/2022	ARPA Update	1.00
805	6/8/2022	BTA Best Practices	1.00
806	6/8/2022	Exemptions, Abatements & Tifs, Oh My!	1.50
807	6/8/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
808	6/9/2022	Communicating Your Job/Responsibilities	1.50
809	6/9/2022	Goals for the Future - Social Media: Getting Your Message Out	1.00
810	6/9/2022	Job Market Hiring & Retaining	1.00
811	6/9/2022	Innovation - Becoming More Efficient	1.00
812	6/9/2022	Breakout Group Session	1.50
813	6/10/2022	The Reappraisal Process	1.00
814	6/10/2022	Providing a Great Customer Service Experience	1.00
815	6/10/2022	New Auditor Q & A Panel Discussion	1.00
832	7/22/2022	Confessions of Fraudsters - AOS	1.50
840	8/26/2022	Energy, Utility & Local Government Policy	1.00
869	9/23/2022	The 20-mil Floor & Inside Millage Shift; Legislative Update	1.00
900	10/5/2022	Ohio GFOA 35th Annual Conference (Oct 5-7)	16.60
901	10/17/2022	COAGA 2022 Professional Development Training (Oct 17, 18)	12.00
904	10/26/2022	CAUV Training Day	4.25
905	10/28/2022	Update on HB 377; Legislative Update	1.00
942	11/16/2022	Keynote: Power of Fun at Work	1.00
943	11/16/2022	A Case Study in Fraud	1.25
944	11/16/2022	Electronic Filing of Abstracts	0.75
945	11/16/2022	Roles & Duties of TIRC; Proposed Changes in HB 123	1.00
946	11/16/2022	Effective Lobbying	0.75
947	11/17/2022	Transition Out of Office Requirements	1.00
948	11/17/2022	BOR's After HB 126	1.00
950	11/17/2022	Personnel Issues in a Post Pandemic World	1.00
951	11/17/2022	OPERS Update	1.50
953	11/18/2022	Legislative Update	1.00
954	11/18/2022	Panel: Retiring Auditors Parting Advice	1.50
1272	1/5/2023	January Executive/Legislative Committee	1.00
1273	2/9/2023	February Executive/Legislative Committee Meeting	1.00

**Total Hours: 253.55**

*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements\*\* Denotes courses that qualify for the Public Records requirements*