

Purpose: Testing OCS Chapters 7-7 and 7-21

Please note for Chapter 7-7 testing, if the County Auditor has a designee that attended the training, the County Auditor's Association has no ability to capture that information. Auditors should obtain documentation for designees from the County Auditor.

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|---------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| Auy | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | | | <i>Auy Total</i> | <u>1.5</u> |
| Adams | David Gifford | 167 | 4/22/2008 | Reducing Liability Risk for County Auditors | 1.5 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 205 | 7/18/2008 | Personal Property Tax & Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Benefits | 0.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 249 | 1/16/2009 | Gearing Up for an Active BOR Season | 1.5 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 260 | 3/20/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies, Estimate Rev | 1 |
| | | 27 | 7/20/2007 | Remission of penalties & new Homestead change | 1.25 |
| | | 277 | 5/15/2009 | Report from Ohio Commission on Local Govt Re | 1 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 295 | 6/11/2009 | CAAO Collaboration & Technology Issues | 0.5 |
| | | 301 | 7/17/2009 | State Budget and Other Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 329 | 9/18/2009 | Sales Verification, Stats & State Oversight | 0.75 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 362 | 1/15/2010 | Roundtable: AOS appraisals, BTA, tax rates | 1 |
| | | 375 | 3/19/2010 | Update to Fiscal Opportunities in ARRA | 1 |
| | | 391 | 5/21/2010 | Round Table Discussion on Board of Revision | 1 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 409 | 7/16/2010 | CAAO Legislative Prioirties for 2011-2012 | 1.5 |
| | | 421 | 9/17/2010 | ODT web site, sales tax; CCAO SB 232 tax exem | 2 |
| | | 426 | 10/15/2010 | Butler County Web Portal | 0.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|--------------|--------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 6 | 3/16/2007 | Real Property Abstract Preparation | 1.75 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 80 | 10/19/2007 | Ohio Manufactured Homes Commission | 1 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Adams Total</i> | 140 |
| Allen | Rhonda Eddy | | | | |
| | | 154 | 3/28/2008 | PERS Employer Reporting | 1 |
| | | 161 | 4/25/2008 | Equalization, Exempt & Conveyance Forms | 1 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 167 | 4/22/2008 | Reducing Liability Risk for County Auditors | 1.5 |
| | | 178 | 5/30/2008 | Special Assessments | 1.5 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 208 | 7/25/2008 | Abstracts that are Due in October | 1 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 216 | 9/16/2008 | Preparing&Executing Real Prop Settlement on M | 1 |
| | | 217 | 9/16/2008 | Collection Tips | 1 |
| | | 218 | 9/16/2008 | Reval and Triennial Years | 1 |
| | | 219 | 9/16/2008 | Proactive Approach to Abstract | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 221 | 9/16/2008 | CAUV Beginning to End | 1 |
| | | 225 | 9/26/2008 | CAUV A Closer Look at the Formula | 1 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 229 | 10/24/2008 | Personal Property Tax and Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 250 | 1/23/2009 | BOR Legal Updates and Refresher | 1.25 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 262 | 3/27/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 270 | 11/6/2008 | Ohio Financial Accountability Certification Prog | 20 |
| | | 276 | 5/12/2009 | Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | 279 | 5/29/2009 | Update from State Legsss & IT on a Tight Budg | 1.75 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|---|--------------|
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 317 | 7/24/2009 | Courage in Tough Times & State Budget Update | 1 |
| | | 325 | 8/28/2009 | Implmenting Mandatory Cost Saving Program fo | 3 |
| | | 333 | 9/25/2009 | Henry Cty Transportation Initiaitive & Cty Budg | 1 |
| | | 380 | 3/26/2010 | ARRA Requirements | 1 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 422 | 9/24/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities | 1 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|----------------|--------------------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 440 | 1/28/2011 | Getting Ready for BOR Season | 1 |
| | | | | <i>Allen Total</i> | 127.5 |
| Ashland | Philip H. Leibolt | | | | |
| | | 12 | 4/13/2007 | BCII Financial Investigation & Real Estate Roun | 1.5 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 167 | 4/22/2008 | Reducing Liability Risk for County Auditors | 1.5 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 245 | 10/16/2008 | Healthcare Fraud & Civil Rights | 1.5 |
| | | 246 | 10/30/2008 | Cyber Crime, Public Corruption, Polygraph | 2.75 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|---|--------------|
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptrnshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|------------------|----------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 64 | 6/13/2007 | Manufactured Homes/Real Property Conveyance | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Ashland Total</i> | 101 |
| Ashtabula | Roger Corlett | | | | |
| | | 101 | 10/29/2007 | *USPAP | 7.5 |
| | | 102 | 10/30/2007 | *USPAP | 7.5 |
| | | 122 | 10/3/2007 | Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | *Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | *Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 167 | 4/22/2008 | Reducing Liability Risk for County Auditors | 1.5 |
| | | 169 | 5/2/2008 | Auditor of State Local Govt. Services | 1 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 202 | 7/9/2008 | Dog License Registration Information | 0.75 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 213 | 9/10/2008 | Quality Management & Improvement in Govern | 1 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 230 | 10/31/2008 | Record Retention and Dealing with E-Mails | 1.5 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 248 | 12/15/2008 | Assessment Administration | 30 |
| | | 251 | 2/6/2009 | Weights & Measures Update; Report from MWC | 1 |
| | | 252 | 2/4/2009 | Legislative Meeting | 1 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 257 | 3/6/2009 | Legislative Updates | 1 |
| | | 263 | 4/3/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 273 | 5/1/2009 | Accounting for Federal Stimulus Money | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 295 | 6/11/2009 | CAAO Collaboration & Technology Issues | 0.5 |
| | | 327 | 9/11/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1.25 |
| | | 331 | 10/2/2009 | Real Estate Assessment Fund - Your Life Boat | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 361 | 1/15/2010 | A. G.'s Office - Formal Opinion Process | 1 |
| | | 365 | 2/5/2010 | Empowering and Strengthening Ohio's People | 1 |
| | | 366 | 3/5/2010 | I Look About | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|---|--------------|
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of the Press | 1 |
| | | 368 | 3/10/2010 | Auditor's Web Site as a Communications Tool | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 371 | 3/10/2010 | Communicating on the Stump | 0.75 |
| | | 384 | 4/9/2010 | GIS Workshop Morning Session | 3.25 |
| | | 385 | 4/9/2010 | GIS Workshop Afternoon Session | 2 |
| | | 387 | 5/7/2010 | Dog License Software, Misc Dog Presentations | 1 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 408 | 7/9/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.5 |
| | | 410 | 8/6/2010 | Photography as Alternative to Reappraisal Requir | 0.75 |
| | | 411 | 8/6/2010 | Health Insurance and Retirement | 0.5 |
| | | 423 | 9/24/2010 | How Does Grape Production Qualify for CAUV? | 2 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|------------------------|--------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 438 | 1/7/2011 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 445 | 3/4/2011 | Weights & Measures Training Program | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 64 | 6/13/2007 | Manufactured Homes/Real Property Conveyance | 1 |
| | | 66 | 6/13/2007 | Tax Incentive Review Councils | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| Ashtabula Total | | | | | 205.5 |

Athens **Jill A. Thompson**

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 101 | 10/29/2007 | *USPAP | 7.5 |
| | | 102 | 10/30/2007 | *USPAP | 7.5 |
| | | 12 | 4/13/2007 | BCII Financial Investigation & Real Estate Roun | 1.5 |
| | | 127 | 1/11/2008 | Update from State Legislators | 0.75 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | *Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | *Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 155 | 4/11/2008 | Emergency Management, E-911 & GIS | 1 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 180 | 5/29/2008 | GIS Mapping & CAUV | 5 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | *Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 201 | 5/9/2008 | Safety Day | 8 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 25 | 5/11/2007 | Budget and Finance | 1.25 |
| | | 252 | 2/4/2009 | Legislative Meeting | 1 |
| | | 253 | 2/13/2009 | Conversion Levy, Other Levies, Rate Setting | 1 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 259 | 3/13/2009 | Board of Revision - Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 274 | 5/8/2009 | Appraisal Approaches & Sales Verification | 1.5 |
| | | 28 | 7/13/2007 | Details on new state budget | 1.25 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 319 | 7/21/2009 | Hiring Smart | 2 |
| | | 32 | 5/21/2007 | HB-694 Training Seminar | 5 |
| | | 320 | 7/31/2009 | Ohio One-Day Tax Conference | 7.5 |
| | | 324 | 8/12/2009 | AoS Compliance Manual & State Legislators | 2 |
| | | 328 | 9/14/2009 | Implementing County Cost Svgs Program | 3 |
| | | 332 | 10/14/2009 | Internal Acctng Control Manual & OH Mnftcd H | 1.5 |
| | | 34 | 5/4/2007 | Safety Day | 4.5 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 363 | 1/22/2010 | Organizational/Legislative Discussion | 1.25 |
| | | 388 | 5/14/2010 | Tangible Personal Property & Other Reimburse | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|---|--------------|
| | | 389 | 5/14/2010 | Levies that Can Grow with Time | 0.75 |
| | | 390 | 5/14/2010 | CAUV: A Look Back & A Look Ahead | 1.25 |
| | | 394 | 6/3/2010 | Stay Ahead of the Story-Media Relations | 1.5 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 408 | 7/9/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.5 |
| | | 409 | 7/16/2010 | CAAO Legislative Prioirties for 2011-2012 | 1.5 |
| | | 412 | 8/13/2010 | County UAN Update and Discussion | 0.75 |
| | | 413 | 8/13/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.25 |
| | | 415 | 8/24/2010 | * Ethics, Public Practice & Professionalism | 2 |
| | | 424 | 10/8/2010 | Tax Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 425 | 10/8/2010 | REA: Past, Present & Future | 0.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|---|--------------|
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 439 | 1/11/2011 | County Auditors and School Treasurers Worksh | 3.25 |
| | | 442 | 2/11/2011 | Use of Sales Ratios in Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 443 | 2/11/2011 | Unclassified Positions & Appointing Deputies | 0.5 |
| | | 446 | 3/11/2011 | Theory/Use of Sales Rations-Residential Reappra | 2 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 69 | 8/10/2007 | Round Table Discussion | 1 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 78 | 9/14/2007 | Special Assess. & New Man. Homes Installation | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-----------------|----------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 79 | 10/12/2007 | CAUV and Forest Land | 1 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Athens Total</i> | 211.5 |
| Auglaize | Janet Schuler | | | | |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 167 | 4/22/2008 | Reducing Liability Risk for County Auditors | 1.5 |
| | | 168 | 4/9/2008 | Introductory Governmental Accounting | 16 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 171 | 5/7/2008 | Intermediate Governmental Accounting | 16 |
| | | 173 | 3/21/2008 | IAAO Course 402 Tax Policy | 30 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisal | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 204 | 7/16/2008 | Fundamentals of Assessment Ratio Studies | 18 |
| | | 205 | 7/18/2008 | Personal Property Tax & Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks: Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Benefits | 0.5 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 250 | 1/23/2009 | BOR Legal Updates and Refresher | 1.25 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 260 | 3/20/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies, Estimate Rev | 1 |
| | | 27 | 7/20/2007 | Remission of penalties & new Homestead change | 1.25 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 295 | 6/11/2009 | CAAO Collaboration & Technology Issues | 0.5 |
| | | 301 | 7/17/2009 | State Budget and Other Updates | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 329 | 9/18/2009 | Sales Verification, Stats & State Oversight | 0.75 |
| | | 336 | 10/16/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 362 | 1/15/2010 | Roundtable: AOS appraisals, BTA, tax rates | 1 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of he Press | 1 |
| | | 368 | 3/10/2010 | Auditor's Web Site as a Communications Tool | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 371 | 3/10/2010 | Communicating on the Stump | 0.75 |
| | | 386 | 4/23/2010 | Board of Revision Today and Tomorrow | 1.25 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|---|--------------|
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 409 | 7/16/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 444 | 2/18/2011 | Changes in OPERS | 1 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 6 | 3/16/2007 | Real Property Abstract Preparation | 1.75 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-----------------------|------------------------|----------|------------|---|---------------|
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| <i>Auglaize Total</i> | | | | | 234.75 |
| Belmont | Andrew L. Sutak | | | | |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|--------------|-------------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | CAUV Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 441 | 3/31/2010 | Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Belmont Total</i> | 35.25 |
| Brown | Doug Green | | | | |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 16 | 4/20/2007 | Brown County GIS Project | 0.75 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 167 | 4/22/2008 | Reducing Liability Risk for County Auditors | 1.5 |
| | | 173 | 3/21/2008 | IAAO Course 402 Tax Policy | 30 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 205 | 7/18/2008 | Personal Property Tax & Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 249 | 1/16/2009 | Gearing Up for an Active BOR Season | 1.5 |
| | | 250 | 1/23/2009 | BOR Legal Updates and Refresher | 1.25 |
| | | 253 | 2/13/2009 | Conversion Levy, Other Levies, Rate Setting | 1 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 257 | 3/6/2009 | Legislative Updates | 1 |
| | | 259 | 3/13/2009 | Board of Revision - Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 260 | 3/20/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies, Estimate Rev | 1 |
| | | 262 | 3/27/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 27 | 7/20/2007 | Remission of penalties & new Homestead change | 1.25 |
| | | 275 | 5/11/2009 | Managing Fiscal Resources & Making Decisions | 5.25 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|--------------------|---------------------|-----------------|-------------|---|---------------------|
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 295 | 6/11/2009 | CAAO Collaboration & Technology Issues | 0.5 |
| | | 297 | 6/25/2009 | ARRA Training | 2.5 |
| | | 301 | 7/17/2009 | State Budget and Other Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 336 | 10/16/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 375 | 3/19/2010 | Update to Fiscal Opportunities in ARRA | 1 |
| | | 391 | 5/21/2010 | Round Table Discussion on Board of Revision | 1 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 4 | 3/15/2007 | County Construction & Finance Seminar | 6.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|---|--------------|
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 409 | 7/16/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 6 | 3/16/2007 | Real Property Abstract Preparation | 1.75 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 66 | 6/13/2007 | Tax Incentive Review Councils | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|---------------|-----------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 80 | 10/19/2007 | Ohio Manufactured Homes Commission | 1 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Brown Total</i> | 184.5 |
| Butler | Roger Reynolds | | | | |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisal | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 205 | 7/18/2008 | Personal Property Tax & Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 249 | 1/16/2009 | Gearing Up for an Active BOR Season | 1.5 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 277 | 5/15/2009 | Report from Ohio Commission on Local Govt Re | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 295 | 6/11/2009 | CAAO Collaboration & Technology Issues | 0.5 |
| | | 329 | 9/18/2009 | Sales Verification, Stats & State Oversight | 0.75 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|----------------|--------------------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 362 | 1/15/2010 | Roundtable: AOS appraisals, BTA, tax rates | 1 |
| | | 375 | 3/19/2010 | Update to Fiscal Opportunities in ARRA | 1 |
| | | 391 | 5/21/2010 | Round Table Discussion on Board of Revision | 1 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | | | Butler Total | 68.75 |
| Carroll | E. Leroy VanHorne | | | | |
| | | 12 | 4/13/2007 | BCII Financial Investigation & Real Estate Roun | 1.5 |
| | | 125 | 12/13/2007 | Multi County Auditors' Meeting | 1 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 130 | 1/18/2008 | Foreclosure Crisis Meeting | 2.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 169 | 5/2/2008 | Auditor of State Local Govt. Services | 1 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 202 | 7/9/2008 | Dog License Registration Information | 0.75 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 213 | 9/10/2008 | Quality Management & Improvement in Govern | 1 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 230 | 10/31/2008 | Record Retention and Dealing with E-Mails | 1.5 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 251 | 2/6/2009 | Weights & Measures Update; Report from MWC | 1 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 257 | 3/6/2009 | Legislative Updates | 1 |
| | | 263 | 4/3/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 272 | 4/24/2009 | Domestic Violence Conference | 6 |
| | | 273 | 5/1/2009 | Accounting for Federal Stimulus Money | 1 |
| | | 275 | 5/11/2009 | Managing Fiscal Resources & Making Decisions | 5.25 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 300 | 7/8/2009 | OGRIP Implementation of HB420,Retirement O | 1 |
| | | 323 | 8/7/2009 | Continuity of Operations & Disaster Recovery | 1 |
| | | 327 | 9/11/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1.25 |
| | | 331 | 10/2/2009 | Real Estate Assessment Fund - Your Life Boat | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 361 | 1/15/2010 | A. G.'s Office - Formal Opinion Process | 1 |
| | | 365 | 2/5/2010 | Empowering and Strengthening Ohio's People | 1 |
| | | 366 | 3/5/2010 | I Look About | 1 |
| | | 384 | 4/9/2010 | GIS Workshop Morning Session | 3.25 |
| | | 385 | 4/9/2010 | GIS Workshop Afternoon Session | 2 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 408 | 7/9/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.5 |
| | | 410 | 8/6/2010 | Photography as Alternative to Reappraisal Requir | 0.75 |
| | | 411 | 8/6/2010 | Health Insurance and Retirement | 0.5 |
| | | 423 | 9/24/2010 | How Does Grape Production Qualify for CAUV? | 2 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 438 | 1/7/2011 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 445 | 3/4/2011 | Weights & Measures Training Program | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|----------------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 8 | 3/28/2007 | * Drug Free Workplace | 2 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| <i>Carroll Total</i> | | | | | 170.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|------------------|--------------------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| Champaign | Karen Bailey | | | | |
| | | 324 | 8/12/2009 | AoS Compliance Manual & State Legislators | 2 |
| | | 329 | 9/18/2009 | Sales Verification, Stats & State Oversight | 0.75 |
| | | 340 | 10/31/2009 | Income Approach to Value | 23 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 362 | 1/15/2010 | Roundtable: AOS appraisals, BTA, tax rates | 1 |
| | | 375 | 3/19/2010 | Update to Fiscal Opportunities in ARRA | 1 |
| | | 421 | 9/17/2010 | ODT web site, sales tax; CCAO SB 232 tax exem | 2 |
| | | 426 | 10/15/2010 | Butler County Web Portal | 0.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 444 | 2/18/2011 | Changes in OPERS | 1 |
| | | | | Champaign Total | 45.5 |
| Clark | George A. Soddors | | | | |
| | | 126 | 1/7/2008 | Economic Business and Social Issues | 30 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|---|--------------|
| | | 16 | 4/20/2007 | Brown County GIS Project | 0.75 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 200 | 6/5/2008 | Economic, Business & Social Issues | 32.5 |
| | | 214 | 8/10/2008 | Survey of Economics for MBA's | 28 |
| | | 249 | 1/16/2009 | Gearing Up for an Active BOR Season | 1.5 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 6 | 3/16/2007 | Real Property Abstract Preparation | 1.75 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-----------------|------------------------|--------------------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 77 | 9/29/2007 | Intro to Economic Reasoning | 10.8 |
| | | <i>Clark Total</i> | | | 130.75 |
| Clermont | Linda L. Fraley | | | | |
| | | 103 | 3/14/2007 | Catalyst May/June 2006 | 2 |
| | | 104 | 3/14/2007 | Catalyst Jan/Feb 2007 | 2 |
| | | 105 | 3/22/2007 | Catalyst March/April 2007 | 2 |
| | | 106 | 5/23/2007 | Sox in the Not for Profit World | 1 |
| | | 107 | 5/23/2008 | Building & Realizing Enterprise Value of Busine | 2 |
| | | 108 | 5/24/2007 | Hidden Jewels of the Internet | 2 |
| | | 109 | 5/24/2007 | Adding Value to the CPA Role | 2 |
| | | 110 | 5/24/2007 | Entity Choice | 2 |
| | | 111 | 5/24/2007 | CAT Updates & Statistics | 2 |
| | | 112 | 5/24/2007 | IRA's Payable to Trust | 2 |
| | | 113 | 6/1/2007 | Catalyst May/June 2007 | 2 |
| | | 114 | 6/10/2007 | Budgeting, Managing Wages, Salaries, Overtime | 2 |
| | | 115 | 6/10/2007 | General Sesion | 2 |
| | | 116 | 6/11/2007 | Future of Budget Technology | 2 |
| | | 117 | 6/12/2007 | Keynote Address | 1 |
| | | 118 | 9/6/2007 | Single Audit & Government Standards | 8 |
| | | 119 | 9/17/2007 | Choice of Entity for Life's Milestones | 8 |
| | | 120 | 10/11/2007 | Fall Professional Issues Update | 4 |
| | | 121 | 11/8/2007 | Annual Governmental GAAP Update | 4 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 305 | 4/21/2009 | Accounting Software Demonstrations | 15 |
| | | 306 | 5/7/2009 | Accounting Software Demonstrations | 16 |
| | | 307 | 9/23/2008 | * Ethics | 3 |
| | | 308 | 8/27/2008 | Combined IPA Conference | 8 |
| | | 309 | 8/22/2008 | Hot Topics in Estate Planning | 4 |
| | | 310 | 5/29/2008 | The art of the Steal | 8 |
| | | 311 | 5/29/2008 | Catalyst July/Aug/Sep/Oct 2007 | 4 |
| | | 312 | 6/25/2008 | Catalyst Nov/Dec 2007, Jan-Apr 2008 | 6 |
| | | 313 | 7/23/2008 | Catalyst July/Aug 2008 | 2 |
| | | 314 | 8/22/2008 | Catalyst May/June 2008 | 2 |
| | | 315 | 4/24/2009 | Catalyst Sept/Oct2008, Jan, Feb, Mar, Apr 2009 | 6 |
| | | 316 | 9/24/2008 | Ohio Society of CPAs Accounting Show | 8 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|----------------|---------------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 80 | 10/19/2007 | Ohio Manufactured Homes Commission | 1 |
| | | | | <i>Clermont Total</i> | 172 |
| Clinton | Wanda E. Armstrong | | | | |
| | | 128 | 1/18/2008 | Update from State Legislators | 1 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 152 | 3/21/2008 | 10 Mill Certificates | 1 |
| | | 16 | 4/20/2007 | Brown County GIS Project | 0.75 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 174 | 5/16/2008 | Auditor of State LGS & Software Development | 1 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 205 | 7/18/2008 | Personal Property Tax & Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 249 | 1/16/2009 | Gearing Up for an Active BOR Season | 1.5 |
| | | 260 | 3/20/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies, Estimate Rev | 1 |
| | | 277 | 5/15/2009 | Report from Ohio Commission on Local Govt Re | 1 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 301 | 7/17/2009 | State Budget and Other Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 329 | 9/18/2009 | Sales Verification, Stats & State Oversight | 0.75 |
| | | 336 | 10/16/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of he Press | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 371 | 3/10/2010 | Communicating on the Stump | 0.75 |
| | | 375 | 3/19/2010 | Update to Fiscal Opportunities in ARRA | 1 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 421 | 9/17/2010 | ODT web site, sales tax; CCAO SB 232 tax exem | 2 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 6 | 3/16/2007 | Real Property Abstract Preparation | 1.75 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 62 | 6/13/2007 | Board of Revision Issues & Procedures | 1 |
| | | 66 | 6/13/2007 | Tax Incentive Review Councils | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------------|-----------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 80 | 10/19/2007 | Ohio Manufactured Homes Commission | 1 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Clinton Total</i> | 118.5 |
| Columbiana | Nancy Milliken | | | | |
| | | 125 | 12/13/2007 | Multi County Auditors' Meeting | 1 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 169 | 5/2/2008 | Auditor of State Local Govt. Services | 1 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 202 | 7/9/2008 | Dog License Registration Information | 0.75 |
| | | 213 | 9/10/2008 | Quality Management & Improvement in Govern | 1 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 251 | 2/6/2009 | Weights & Measures Update; Report from MWC | 1 |
| | | 252 | 2/4/2009 | Legislative Meeting | 1 |
| | | 273 | 5/1/2009 | Accounting for Federal Stimulus Money | 1 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 300 | 7/8/2009 | OGRIP Implementation of HB420, Retirement O | 1 |
| | | 323 | 8/7/2009 | Continuity of Operations & Disaster Recovery | 1 |
| | | 327 | 9/11/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1.25 |
| | | 331 | 10/2/2009 | Real Estate Assessment Fund - Your Life Boat | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 361 | 1/15/2010 | A. G.'s Office - Formal Opinion Process | 1 |
| | | 366 | 3/5/2010 | I Look About | 1 |
| | | 410 | 8/6/2010 | Photography as Alternative to Reappraisal Requir | 0.75 |
| | | 411 | 8/6/2010 | Health Insurance and Retirement | 0.5 |
| | | 438 | 1/7/2011 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 445 | 3/4/2011 | Weights & Measures Training Program | 0.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------------------|----------------------|----------|------------|---|---------------|
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 62 | 6/13/2007 | Board of Revision Issues & Procedures | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 68 | 8/3/2007 | Current Events in Personnel Management | 2.5 |
| | | 71 | 9/7/2007 | IT & GIS Development | 1 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 82 | 10/25/2007 | Team Building for Optimum Success | 1 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| <i>Columbiana Total</i> | | | | | 101.75 |
| Coshocton | Sandra Corder | | | | |
| | | 10 | 3/30/2007 | * Social Work Values and Ethics | 5.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| | | 12 | 4/13/2007 | BCII Financial Investigation & Real Estate Roun | 1.5 |
| | | 156 | 4/9/2008 | Introductory Governmental Accounting Seminar | 16 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 170 | 5/6/2008 | Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 202 | 7/9/2008 | Dog License Registration Information | 0.75 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 213 | 9/10/2008 | Quality Management & Improvement in Govern | 1 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 251 | 2/6/2009 | Weights & Measures Update; Report from MWC | 1 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 263 | 4/3/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 321 | 7/31/2009 | ARRA Training | 2 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 361 | 1/15/2010 | A. G.'s Office - Formal Opinion Process | 1 |
| | | 384 | 4/9/2010 | GIS Workshop Morning Session | 3.25 |
| | | 385 | 4/9/2010 | GIS Workshop Afternoon Session | 2 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 423 | 9/24/2010 | How Does Grape Production Qualify for CAUV? | 2 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 438 | 1/7/2011 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-----------------|-------------------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 66 | 6/13/2007 | Tax Incentive Review Councils | 1 |
| | | 68 | 8/3/2007 | Current Events in Personnel Management | 2.5 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | | | <i>Coshocton Total</i> | 140 |
| Crawford | Robin Hildebrand | | | | |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 161 | 4/25/2008 | Equalization, Exempt & Conveyance Forms | 1 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 225 | 9/26/2008 | CAUV A Closer Look at the Formula | 1 |
| | | 250 | 1/23/2009 | BOR Legal Updates and Refresher | 1.25 |
| | | 26 | 7/27/2007 | BOR: Challenges of Valuing Lakeside Propertie | 1.25 |
| | | 262 | 3/27/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of he Press | 1 |
| | | 368 | 3/10/2010 | Auditor's Web Site as a Communications Tool | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-----------------|--------------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 64 | 6/13/2007 | Manufactured Homes/Real Property Conveyance | 1 |
| | | 66 | 6/13/2007 | Tax Incentive Review Councils | 1 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 83 | 10/26/2007 | Update from State Legislators | 1 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Crawford Total</i> | 57 |
| Cuyahoga | Frank Russo | | | | |
| | | 38 | 3/22/2007 | Financing | 3 |
| | | 39 | 3/23/2007 | Real Estate Escrow & Title Services | 3 |
| | | 40 | 3/29/2007 | Contract Problems | 3 |
| | | 41 | 3/30/2007 | Core Law-Legal Update CL | 3 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|--------------|-------------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| | | 42 | 4/5/2007 | Civil Rights CR | 3 |
| | | 43 | 4/12/2007 | * Canons of Ethics CE | 3 |
| | | 44 | 4/13/2007 | Objections | 3 |
| | | 45 | 4/19/2007 | Securing Listings | 3 |
| | | 46 | 4/20/2007 | Selling Buyers | 3 |
| | | 47 | 4/26/2007 | Valuating Real Property | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Cuyahoga Total</i> | 30 |
| Darke | Carol Ginn | | | | |
| | | 128 | 1/18/2008 | Update from State Legislators | 1 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 152 | 3/21/2008 | 10 Mill Certificates | 1 |
| | | 16 | 4/20/2007 | Brown County GIS Project | 0.75 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 167 | 4/22/2008 | Reducing Liability Risk for County Auditors | 1.5 |
| | | 171 | 5/7/2008 | Intermediate Governmental Accounting | 12.8 |
| | | 175 | 5/14/2008 | Emerging Trends in Fraud Investigation | 9.25 |
| | | 204 | 7/16/2008 | Fundamentals of Assessment Ratio Studies | 18 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 212 | 6/27/2008 | Fundamentals of Real Property Appraisal | 30 |
| | | 216 | 9/16/2008 | Preparing&Executing Real Prop Settlement on M | 1 |
| | | 221 | 9/16/2008 | CAUV Beginning to End | 1 |
| | | 222 | 9/16/2008 | Crystal Reports | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 223 | 9/16/2008 | SQL Tools and Tips | 1 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 260 | 3/20/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies, Estimate Rev | 1 |
| | | 27 | 7/20/2007 | Remission of penalties & new Homestead change | 1.25 |
| | | 277 | 5/15/2009 | Report from Ohio Commission on Local Govt Re | 1 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 301 | 7/17/2009 | State Budget and Other Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 329 | 9/18/2009 | Sales Verification, Stats & State Oversight | 0.75 |
| | | 336 | 10/16/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 362 | 1/15/2010 | Roundtable: AOS appraisals, BTA, tax rates | 1 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of the Press | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 371 | 3/10/2010 | Communicating on the Stump | 0.75 |
| | | 375 | 3/19/2010 | Update to Fiscal Opportunities in ARRA | 1 |
| | | 409 | 7/16/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.5 |
| | | 414 | 8/5/2010 | Advanced GAAP Seminar | 16 |
| | | 416 | 8/25/2010 | Taxability of Certain Fringe Benefits | 0.75 |
| | | 421 | 9/17/2010 | ODT web site, sales tax; CCAO SB 232 tax exem | 2 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 444 | 2/18/2011 | Changes in OPERS | 1 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 6 | 3/16/2007 | Real Property Abstract Preparation | 1.75 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 64 | 6/13/2007 | Manufactured Homes/Real Property Conveyance | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 80 | 10/19/2007 | Ohio Manufactured Homes Commission | 1 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-----------------|---------------------------|----------|------------|--|---------------|
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Darke Total</i> | 210.25 |
| Defiance | Marlene J. Goodwin | | | | |
| | | 1 | 3/13/2007 | IRS Tax Law | 2 |
| | | 101 | 10/29/2007 | *USPAP | 7.5 |
| | | 102 | 10/30/2007 | *USPAP | 7.5 |
| | | 129 | 1/25/2008 | Budget Commission Responsibilities | 1 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | *Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 139 | 2/22/2008 | Auditor of State's LGS & Software Development | 2 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | *Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisal | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks: Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Benefits | 0.5 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 229 | 10/24/2008 | Personal Property Tax and Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 252 | 2/4/2009 | Legislative Meeting | 1 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 262 | 3/27/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 279 | 5/29/2009 | Update from State Legss & IT on a Tight Budg | 1.75 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 317 | 7/24/2009 | Courage in Tough Times & State Budget Update | 1 |
| | | 325 | 8/28/2009 | Implmenting Mandatory Cost Saving Program fo | 3 |
| | | 333 | 9/25/2009 | Henry Cty Transportation Initiaitive & Cty Budg | 1 |
| | | 340 | 10/31/2009 | Income Approach to Value | 30 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture - | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 364 | 1/22/2010 | Going Paperless - Benefits of Technology | 1.5 |
| | | 427 | 10/22/2010 | Future of CAUV Sol Values; Do We Need to Ch | 1.5 |
| | | 440 | 1/28/2011 | Getting Ready for BOR Season | 1 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 62 | 6/13/2007 | Board of Revision Issues & Procedures | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 83 | 10/26/2007 | Update from State Legislators | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-----------------|----------------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 9 | 3/30/2007 | Legislative Review and Update | 1.75 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Defiance Total</i> | 174 |
| Delaware | George Kaitsa | | | | |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 274 | 5/8/2009 | Appraisal Approaches & Sales Verification | 1.5 |
| | | 324 | 8/12/2009 | AoS Compliance Manual & State Legislators | 2 |
| | | 332 | 10/14/2009 | Internal Acctng Control Manual & OH Mnftcd H | 1.5 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 355 | 11/19/2009 | Weights & Measures Training | 4 |
| | | 363 | 1/22/2010 | Organizational/Legislative Discussion | 1.25 |
| | | 372 | 3/12/2010 | Media and the County Auditor | 0.75 |
| | | 373 | 3/12/2010 | TIF and TIRC in Delaware County | 1 |
| | | 374 | 3/12/2010 | Board of Revision Today and Tomorrow | 1 |
| | | 383 | 4/8/2010 | Local Government Officials' Conference | 10.5 |
| | | 388 | 5/14/2010 | Tangible Personal Property & Other Reimburseem | 0.75 |
| | | 389 | 5/14/2010 | Levies that Can Grow with Time | 0.75 |
| | | 390 | 5/14/2010 | CAUV: A Look Back & A Look Ahead | 1.25 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 412 | 8/13/2010 | County UAN Update and Discussion | 0.75 |
| | | 413 | 8/13/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.25 |
| | | 424 | 10/8/2010 | Tax Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 425 | 10/8/2010 | REA: Past, Present & Future | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|-----------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 442 | 2/11/2011 | Use of Sales Ratios in Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 443 | 2/11/2011 | Unclassified Positions & Appointing Deputies | 0.5 |
| | | 446 | 3/11/2011 | Theory/Use of Sales Rations-Residential Reappra | 2 |
| | | | | <i>Delaware Total</i> | 69.5 |
| Erie | Tom Paul | | | | |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 154 | 3/28/2008 | PERS Employer Reporting | 1 |
| | | 161 | 4/25/2008 | Equalization, Exempt & Conveyance Forms | 1 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 167 | 4/22/2008 | Reducing Liability Risk for County Auditors | 1.5 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisal | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 204 | 7/16/2008 | Fundamentals of Assessment Ratio Studies | 18 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 262 | 3/27/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 295 | 6/11/2009 | CAAO Collaboration & Technology Issues | 0.5 |
| | | 325 | 8/28/2009 | Implmenting Mandatory Cost Saving Program fo | 3 |
| | | 339 | 10/29/2009 | Understanding a Survey | 2 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 364 | 1/22/2010 | Going Paperless - Benefits of Technology | 1.5 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|---------------|
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 9 | 3/30/2007 | Legislative Review and Update | 1.75 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| <i>Erie Total</i> | | | | | 129.25 |

Fairfield Jon Slater

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|----------------|-------------------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| | | 424 | 10/8/2010 | Tax Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 425 | 10/8/2010 | REA: Past, Present & Future | 0.5 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 442 | 2/11/2011 | Use of Sales Ratios in Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 443 | 2/11/2011 | Unclassified Positions & Appointing Deputies | 0.5 |
| | | 446 | 3/11/2011 | Theory/Use of Sales Rations-Residential Reappra | 2 |
| | | | | <i>Fairfield Total</i> | 14.25 |
| Fayette | Michael D. Smith | | | | |
| | | 128 | 1/18/2008 | Update from State Legislators | 1 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 16 | 4/20/2007 | Brown County GIS Project | 0.75 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 174 | 5/16/2008 | Auditor of State LGS & Software Development | 1 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 205 | 7/18/2008 | Personal Property Tax & Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 271 | 4/16/2009 | Fundamentals of Real Property Appiasal | 8 |
| | | 301 | 7/17/2009 | State Budget and Other Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 329 | 9/18/2009 | Sales Verification, Stats & State Oversight | 0.75 |
| | | 336 | 10/16/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 362 | 1/15/2010 | Roundtable: AOS appraisals, BTA, tax rates | 1 |
| | | 375 | 3/19/2010 | Update to Fiscal Opportunities in ARRA | 1 |
| | | 391 | 5/21/2010 | Round Table Discussion on Board of Revision | 1 |
| | | 421 | 9/17/2010 | ODT web site, sales tax; CCAO SB 232 tax exem | 2 |
| | | 426 | 10/15/2010 | Butler County Web Portal | 0.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 444 | 2/18/2011 | Changes in OPERS | 1 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-----------------|-----------------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 64 | 6/13/2007 | Manufactured Homes/Real Property Conveyance | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Fayette Total</i> | 99.25 |
| Franklin | Clarence E. Mingo II | | | | |
| | | 332 | 10/14/2009 | Internal Acctng Control Manual & OH Mnfctd H | 1.5 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 363 | 1/22/2010 | Organizational/Legislative Discussion | 1.25 |
| | | 372 | 3/12/2010 | Media and the County Auditor | 0.75 |
| | | 373 | 3/12/2010 | TIF and TIRC in Delaware County | 1 |
| | | 374 | 3/12/2010 | Board of Revision Today and Tomorrow | 1 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|---------------|----------------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 446 | 3/11/2011 | Theory/Use of Sales Rations-Residential Reappra | 2 |
| | | | | <i>Franklin Total</i> | 26 |
| Fulton | Brett J. Kolb | | | | |
| | | 364 | 1/22/2010 | Going Paperless - Benefits of Technology | 1.5 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of he Press | 1 |
| | | 368 | 3/10/2010 | Auditor's Web Site as a Communications Tool | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 371 | 3/10/2010 | Communicating on the Stump | 0.75 |
| | | 380 | 3/26/2010 | ARRA Requirements | 1 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|---------------|----------------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 427 | 10/22/2010 | Future of CAUV Sol Values; Do We Need to Ch | 1.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 440 | 1/28/2011 | Getting Ready for BOR Season | 1 |
| | | | | <i>Fulton Total</i> | 30.75 |
| Gallia | Larry M. Betz | | | | |
| | | 12 | 4/13/2007 | BCII Financial Investigation & Real Estate Roun | 1.5 |
| | | 127 | 1/11/2008 | Update from State Legislators | 0.75 |
| | | 149 | 3/14/2008 | Auditor of State County Software Project | 1.5 |
| | | 155 | 4/11/2008 | Emergency Management, E-911 & GIS | 1 |
| | | 172 | 5/9/2008 | Special Assessments | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 203 | 7/11/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 210 | 8/8/2008 | OPERS Employer Outreach & Deferred Comp O | 1.25 |
| | | 215 | 9/19/2008 | Sales Tax Distribution & Winding Down PPT | 1.25 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Benefits | 0.5 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 25 | 5/11/2007 | Budget and Finance | 1.25 |
| | | 253 | 2/13/2009 | Conversion Levy, Other Levies, Rate Setting | 1 |
| | | 259 | 3/13/2009 | Board of Revision - Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 28 | 7/13/2007 | Details on new state budget | 1.25 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 295 | 6/11/2009 | CAAO Collaboration & Technology Issues | 0.5 |
| | | 324 | 8/12/2009 | AoS Compliance Manual & State Legislators | 2 |
| | | 326 | 9/9/2009 | Updates on Legislation and Other Items | 1.5 |
| | | 332 | 10/14/2009 | Internal Acctng Control Manual & OH Mnfctd H | 1.5 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 363 | 1/22/2010 | Organizational/Legislative Discussion | 1.25 |
| | | 388 | 5/14/2010 | Tangible Personal Property & Other Reimburseem | 0.75 |
| | | 389 | 5/14/2010 | Levies that Can Grow with Time | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|---|--------------|
| | | 390 | 5/14/2010 | CAUV: A Look Back & A Look Ahead | 1.25 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 412 | 8/13/2010 | County UAN Update and Discussion | 0.75 |
| | | 413 | 8/13/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.25 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 442 | 2/11/2011 | Use of Sales Ratios in Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 443 | 2/11/2011 | Unclassified Positions & Appointing Deputies | 0.5 |
| | | 446 | 3/11/2011 | Theory/Use of Sales Rations-Residential Reappra | 2 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|---------------|--------------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 69 | 8/10/2007 | Round Table Discussion | 1 |
| | | 78 | 9/14/2007 | Special Assess. & New Man. Homes Installation | 1.5 |
| | | 79 | 10/12/2007 | CAUV and Forest Land | 1 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Gallia Total</i> | 124.5 |
| Geauga | Frank Gliha | | | | |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 263 | 4/3/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 271 | 4/16/2009 | Fundamentals of Real Property Appraisal | 30 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retention & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 300 | 7/8/2009 | OGRIP Implementation of HB420, Retirement O | 1 |
| | | 327 | 9/11/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1.25 |
| | | 331 | 10/2/2009 | Real Estate Assessment Fund - Your Life Boat | 1 |
| | | 340 | 10/31/2009 | Income Approach to Value | 30 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of the Press | 1 |
| | | 368 | 3/10/2010 | Auditor's Web Site as a Communications Tool | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 371 | 3/10/2010 | Communicating on the Stump | 0.75 |
| | | 378 | 10/15/2009 | Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | 387 | 5/7/2010 | Dog License Software, Misc Dog Presentations | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 408 | 7/9/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.5 |
| | | 410 | 8/6/2010 | Photography as Alternative to Reappraisal Requir | 0.75 |
| | | 411 | 8/6/2010 | Health Insurance and Retirement | 0.5 |
| | | 423 | 9/24/2010 | How Does Grape Production Qualify for CAUV? | 2 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 437 | 12/17/2010 | Certified Public Records and Open Meetings | 3 |
| | | 438 | 1/7/2011 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 445 | 3/4/2011 | Weights & Measures Training Program | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|---------------------|--------------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| <i>Geauga Total</i> | | | | | 128.75 |
| Greene | Luwanna A. Delaney | | | | |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 152 | 3/21/2008 | 10 Mill Certificates | 1 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 174 | 5/16/2008 | Auditor of State LGS & Software Development | 1 |
| | | 179 | 6/6/2008 | IAS User's Conference | 6 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 180 | 5/29/2008 | GIS Mapping & CAUV | 6 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 205 | 7/18/2008 | Personal Property Tax & Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 249 | 1/16/2009 | Gearing Up for an Active BOR Season | 1.5 |
| | | 252 | 2/4/2009 | Legislative Meeting | 1 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 260 | 3/20/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies, Estimate Rev | 1 |
| | | 27 | 7/20/2007 | Remission of penalties & new Homestead change | 1.25 |
| | | 277 | 5/15/2009 | Report from Ohio Commission on Local Govt Re | 1 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 295 | 6/11/2009 | CAAO Collaboration & Technology Issues | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 301 | 7/17/2009 | State Budget and Other Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 329 | 9/18/2009 | Sales Verification, Stats & State Oversight | 0.75 |
| | | 336 | 10/16/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 362 | 1/15/2010 | Roundtable: AOS appraisals, BTA, tax rates | 1 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of the Press | 1 |
| | | 368 | 3/10/2010 | Auditor's Web Site as a Communications Tool | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 371 | 3/10/2010 | Communicating on the Stump | 0.75 |
| | | 375 | 3/19/2010 | Update to Fiscal Opportunities in ARRA | 1 |
| | | 391 | 5/21/2010 | Round Table Discussion on Board of Revision | 1 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 409 | 7/16/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.5 |
| | | 426 | 10/15/2010 | Butler County Web Portal | 0.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 444 | 2/18/2011 | Changes in OPERS | 1 |
| | | 6 | 3/16/2007 | Real Property Abstract Preparation | 1.75 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 80 | 10/19/2007 | Ohio Manufactured Homes Commission | 1 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|---------------------|----------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| <i>Greene Total</i> | | | | | 133.75 |
| Guernsey | Anthony Brown | | | | |
| | | 12 | 4/13/2007 | BCII Financial Investigation & Real Estate Roun | 1.5 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 149 | 3/14/2008 | Auditor of State County Software Project | 1.5 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 172 | 5/9/2008 | Special Assessments | 1 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 205 | 7/18/2008 | Personal Property Tax & Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 215 | 9/19/2008 | Sales Tax Distribution & Winding Down PPT | 1.25 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 230 | 10/31/2008 | Record Retention and Dealing with E-Mails | 1.5 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 252 | 2/4/2009 | Legislative Meeting | 1 |
| | | 253 | 2/13/2009 | Conversion Levy, Other Levies, Rate Setting | 1 |
| | | 271 | 4/16/2009 | Fundamentals of Real Property Appraisal | 30 |
| | | 274 | 5/8/2009 | Appraisal Approaches & Sales Verification | 1.5 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 326 | 9/9/2009 | Updates on Legislation and Other Items | 1.5 |
| | | 336 | 10/16/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1 |
| | | 340 | 10/31/2009 | Income Approach to Value | 30 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 442 | 2/11/2011 | Use of Sales Ratios in Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 443 | 2/11/2011 | Unclassified Positions & Appointing Deputies | 0.5 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-----------------|---------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 66 | 6/13/2007 | Tax Incentive Review Councils | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 69 | 8/10/2007 | Round Table Discussion | 1 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 79 | 10/12/2007 | CAUV and Forest Land | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Guernsey Total</i> | 168 |
| Hamilton | Dusty Rhodes | | | | |
| | | 123 | 10/5/2007 | Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | *Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 137 | 1/24/2008 | Core Law Legal Update | 3 |
| | | 138 | 2/14/2008 | Appealing Property Tax Valuations | 3 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | *Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 152 | 3/21/2008 | 10 Mill Certificates | 1 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 27 | 7/20/2007 | Remission of penalties & new Homestead change | 1.25 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|----------------|------------------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 368 | 3/10/2010 | Auditor's Web Site as a Communications Tool | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Hamilton Total</i> | 30 |
| Hancock | Charity A. Rauschenbe | | | | |
| | | 129 | 1/25/2008 | Budget Commission Responsibilities | 1 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 131 | 2/1/2008 | Fundamentals of Real Property Appraisal | 30 |
| | | 139 | 2/22/2008 | Auditor of State's LGS & Software Development | 2 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 161 | 4/25/2008 | Equalization, Exempt & Conveyance Forms | 1 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 178 | 5/30/2008 | Special Assessments | 1.5 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Biential Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisal | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 204 | 7/16/2008 | Fundamentals of Assessment Ratio Studies | 18 |
| | | 208 | 7/25/2008 | Abstracts that are Due in October | 1 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 211 | 8/22/2008 | Project Planning and Strategy | 1 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Benefits | 0.5 |
| | | 229 | 10/24/2008 | Personal Property Tax and Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 250 | 1/23/2009 | BOR Legal Updates and Refresher | 1.25 |
| | | 252 | 2/4/2009 | Legislative Meeting | 1 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 26 | 7/27/2007 | BOR: Challenges of Valuing Lakeside Propertie | 1.25 |
| | | 262 | 3/27/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 29 | 6/1/2007 | Budget Proposal on Expansion of Homestead Ex | 1 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 317 | 7/24/2009 | Courage in Tough Times & State Budget Update | 1 |
| | | 325 | 8/28/2009 | Implementing Mandatory Cost Saving Program fo | 3 |
| | | 333 | 9/25/2009 | Henry Cty Transportation Initiaitive & Cty Budg | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 364 | 1/22/2010 | Going Paperless - Benefits of Technology | 1.5 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of the Press | 1 |
| | | 368 | 3/10/2010 | Auditor's Web Site as a Communications Tool | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 371 | 3/10/2010 | Communicating on the Stump | 0.75 |
| | | 380 | 3/26/2010 | ARRA Requirements | 1 |
| | | 386 | 4/23/2010 | Board of Revision Today and Tomorrow | 1.25 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 422 | 9/24/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities | 1 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptrshp | 1 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|---------------|-------------------------|----------|------------|--|---------------|
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 440 | 1/28/2011 | Getting Ready for BOR Season | 1 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 64 | 6/13/2007 | Manufactured Homes/Real Property Conveyance | 1 |
| | | 66 | 6/13/2007 | Tax Incentive Review Councils | 1 |
| | | 83 | 10/26/2007 | Update from State Legislators | 1 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 9 | 3/30/2007 | Legislative Review and Update | 1.75 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Hancock Total</i> | 183.75 |
| Hardin | Michael T. Bacon | | | | |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 153 | 3/21/2008 | CORSA Overview & Sexual Harrasment Trainin | 4 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-----------------|-------------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 208 | 7/25/2008 | Abstracts that are Due in October | 1 |
| | | 262 | 3/27/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 301 | 7/17/2009 | State Budget and Other Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 440 | 1/28/2011 | Getting Ready for BOR Season | 1 |
| | | 68 | 8/3/2007 | Current Events in Personnel Management | 2.5 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Proecess | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Hardin Total</i> | 35.25 |
| Harrison | Patrick J. Moore | | | | |
| | | 12 | 4/13/2007 | BCII Financial Investigation & Real Estate Roun | 1.5 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 169 | 5/2/2008 | Auditor of State Local Govt. Services | 1 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks: Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 215 | 9/19/2008 | Sales Tax Distribution & Winding Down PPT | 1.25 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Benefits | 0.5 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 230 | 10/31/2008 | Record Retention and Dealing with E-Mails | 1.5 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 251 | 2/6/2009 | Weights & Measures Update; Report from MWC | 1 |
| | | 252 | 2/4/2009 | Legislative Meeting | 1 |
| | | 263 | 4/3/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 295 | 6/11/2009 | CAAO Collaboration & Technology Issues | 0.5 |
| | | 300 | 7/8/2009 | OGRIP Implementation of HB420, Retirement O | 1 |
| | | 327 | 9/11/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1.25 |
| | | 331 | 10/2/2009 | Real Estate Assessment Fund - Your Life Boat | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 361 | 1/15/2010 | A. G.'s Office - Formal Opinion Process | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|---|--------------|
| | | 365 | 2/5/2010 | Empowering and Strengthening Ohio's People | 1 |
| | | 366 | 3/5/2010 | I Look About | 1 |
| | | 387 | 5/7/2010 | Dog License Software, Misc Dog Presentations | 1 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 408 | 7/9/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 438 | 1/7/2011 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|--------------|------------------|----------|------------|--|---------------|
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 71 | 9/7/2007 | IT & GIS Development | 1 |
| | | 82 | 10/25/2007 | Team Building for Optimum Success | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Harrison Total</i> | 111.75 |
| Henry | Kevin Nye | | | | |
| | | 129 | 1/25/2008 | Budget Commission Responsibilities | 1 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | *Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 139 | 2/22/2008 | Auditor of State's LGS & Software Development | 2 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | *Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 154 | 3/28/2008 | PERS Employer Reporting | 1 |
| | | 161 | 4/25/2008 | Equalization, Exempt & Conveyance Forms | 1 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 178 | 5/30/2008 | Special Assessments | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisal | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 211 | 8/22/2008 | Project Planning and Strategy | 1 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Benefits | 0.5 |
| | | 225 | 9/26/2008 | CAUV A Closer Look at the Formula | 1 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 229 | 10/24/2008 | Personal Property Tax and Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 250 | 1/23/2009 | BOR Legal Updates and Refresher | 1.25 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 262 | 3/27/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 271 | 4/16/2009 | Fundamentals of Real Property Appraisal | 30 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 29 | 6/1/2007 | Budget Proposal on Expansion of Homestead Ex | 1 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 317 | 7/24/2009 | Courage in Tough Times & State Budget Update | 1 |
| | | 325 | 8/28/2009 | Implmenting Mandatory Cost Saving Program fo | 1.75 |
| | | 333 | 9/25/2009 | Henry Cty Transportation Initiaitive & Cty Budg | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 364 | 1/22/2010 | Going Paperless - Benefits of Technology | 1.5 |
| | | 386 | 4/23/2010 | Board of Revision Today and Tomorrow | 1.25 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 422 | 9/24/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities | 1 |
| | | 427 | 10/22/2010 | Future of CAUV Sol Values; Do We Need to Ch | 1.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 440 | 1/28/2011 | Getting Ready for BOR Season | 1 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|--------------------|--------------------|----------|------------|--|---------------|
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 83 | 10/26/2007 | Update from State Legislators | 1 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 9 | 3/30/2007 | Legislative Review and Update | 1.75 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| <i>Henry Total</i> | | | | | 168.25 |
| Highland | Bill Fawley | | | | |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|---|--------------|
| | | 152 | 3/21/2008 | 10 Mill Certificates | 1 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 167 | 4/22/2008 | Reducing Liability Risk for County Auditors | 1.5 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 174 | 5/16/2008 | Auditor of State LGS & Software Development | 1 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bullectin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 205 | 7/18/2008 | Personal Property Tax & Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 277 | 5/15/2009 | Report from Ohio Commission on Local Govt Re | 1 |
| | | 301 | 7/17/2009 | State Budget and Other Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 329 | 9/18/2009 | Sales Verification, Stats & State Oversight | 0.75 |
| | | 336 | 10/16/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 362 | 1/15/2010 | Roundtable: AOS appraisals, BTA, tax rates | 1 |
| | | 375 | 3/19/2010 | Update to Fiscal Opportunities in ARRA | 1 |
| | | 391 | 5/21/2010 | Round Table Discussion on Board of Revision | 1 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 409 | 7/16/2010 | CAAO Legislative Prioirties for 2011-2012 | 1.5 |
| | | 421 | 9/17/2010 | ODT web site, sales tax; CCAO SB 232 tax exem | 2 |
| | | 426 | 10/15/2010 | Butler County Web Portal | 0.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 6 | 3/16/2007 | Real Property Abstract Preparation | 1.75 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 62 | 6/13/2007 | Board of Revision Issues & Procedures | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 80 | 10/19/2007 | Ohio Manufactured Homes Commission | 1 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|----------------|--------------------------|----------|------------|--|---------------|
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Highland Total</i> | 125.75 |
| Hocking | Kenneth R. Wilson | | | | |
| | | 12 | 4/13/2007 | BCII Financial Investigation & Real Estate Roun | 1.5 |
| | | 127 | 1/11/2008 | Update from State Legislators | 0.75 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 149 | 3/14/2008 | Auditor of State County Software Project | 1.5 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 151 | 3/18/2008 | OJFSDA Fiscal Semainar | 5.5 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 167 | 4/22/2008 | Reducing Liability Risk for County Auditors | 1.5 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 172 | 5/9/2008 | Special Assessments | 1 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 210 | 8/8/2008 | OPERS Employer Outreach & Deferred Comp O | 1.25 |
| | | 215 | 9/19/2008 | Sales Tax Distribution & Winding Down PPT | 1.25 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 25 | 5/11/2007 | Budget and Finance | 1.25 |
| | | 253 | 2/13/2009 | Conversion Levy, Other Levies, Rate Setting | 1 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 259 | 3/13/2009 | Board of Revision - Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 271 | 4/16/2009 | Fundamentals of Real Property Appraisal | 30 |
| | | 274 | 5/8/2009 | Appraisal Approaches & Sales Verification | 1.5 |
| | | 275 | 5/11/2009 | Managing Fiscal Resources & Making Decisions | 5 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 295 | 6/11/2009 | CAAO Collaboration & Technology Issues | 0.5 |
| | | 297 | 6/25/2009 | ARRA Training | 2.5 |
| | | 324 | 8/12/2009 | AoS Compliance Manual & State Legislators | 2 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 328 | 9/14/2009 | Implementing County Cost Svgs Program | 3 |
| | | 332 | 10/14/2009 | Internal Acctng Control Manual & OH Mnfc'd H | 1.5 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 363 | 1/22/2010 | Organizational/Legislative Discussion | 1.25 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of the Press | 1 |
| | | 368 | 3/10/2010 | Auditor's Web Site as a Communications Tool | 1 |
| | | 372 | 3/12/2010 | Media and the County Auditor | 0.75 |
| | | 373 | 3/12/2010 | TIF and TIRC in Delaware County | 1 |
| | | 374 | 3/12/2010 | Board of Revision Today and Tomorrow | 1 |
| | | 388 | 5/14/2010 | Tangible Personal Property & Other Reimbursements | 0.75 |
| | | 389 | 5/14/2010 | Levies that Can Grow with Time | 0.75 |
| | | 390 | 5/14/2010 | CAUV: A Look Back & A Look Ahead | 1.25 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | CAUV Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|---|--------------|
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 412 | 8/13/2010 | County UAN Update and Discussion | 0.75 |
| | | 413 | 8/13/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.25 |
| | | 424 | 10/8/2010 | Tax Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 425 | 10/8/2010 | REA: Past, Present & Future | 0.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 439 | 1/11/2011 | County Auditors and School Treasurers Worksh | 3.25 |
| | | 442 | 2/11/2011 | Use of Sales Ratios in Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 443 | 2/11/2011 | Unclassified Positions & Appointing Deputies | 0.5 |
| | | 446 | 3/11/2011 | Theory/Use of Sales Rations-Residential Reappra | 2 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|----------------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 69 | 8/10/2007 | Round Table Discussion | 1 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 78 | 9/14/2007 | Special Assess. & New Man. Homes Installation | 1.5 |
| | | 79 | 10/12/2007 | CAUV and Forest Land | 1 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| <i>Hocking Total</i> | | | | | 219 |

Holmes Jackie McKee

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 167 | 4/22/2008 | Reducing Liability Risk for County Auditors | 0.75 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 206 | 7/25/2008 | Certified public Records Training | 3 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|--------------------|---------------------|-----------------|-------------|---|---------------------|
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 230 | 10/31/2008 | Record Retention and Dealing with E-Mails | 1.5 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 323 | 8/7/2009 | Continuity of Operations & Disaster Recovery | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 352 | 11/19/2009 | Summit on Local Government Sustainability | 5.5 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of the Press | 1 |
| | | 368 | 3/10/2010 | Auditor's Web Site as a Communications Tool | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 371 | 3/10/2010 | Communicating on the Stump | 0.75 |
| | | 384 | 4/9/2010 | GIS Workshop Morning Session | 3.25 |
| | | 385 | 4/9/2010 | GIS Workshop Afternoon Session | 2 |
| | | 387 | 5/7/2010 | Dog License Software, Misc Dog Presentations | 1 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 445 | 3/4/2011 | Weights & Measures Training Program | 0.5 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|--------------|---------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Holmes Total</i> | 135.5 |
| Huron | Roland Tkach | | | | |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 131 | 2/1/2008 | Fundamentals of Real Property Appraisal | 30 |
| | | 139 | 2/22/2008 | Auditor of State's LGS & Software Development | 2 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 154 | 3/28/2008 | PERS Employer Reporting | 1 |
| | | 161 | 4/25/2008 | Equalization, Exempt & Conveyance Forms | 1 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 167 | 4/22/2008 | Reducing Liability Risk for County Auditors | 1.5 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisal | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 208 | 7/25/2008 | Abstracts that are Due in October | 1 |
| | | 211 | 8/22/2008 | Project Planning and Strategy | 1 |
| | | 225 | 9/26/2008 | CAUV A Closer Look at the Formula | 1 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 26 | 7/27/2007 | BOR: Challenges of Valuing Lakeside Propertie | 1.25 |
| | | 262 | 3/27/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 279 | 5/29/2009 | Update from State Legss & IT on a Tight Budg | 1.75 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 317 | 7/24/2009 | Courage in Tough Times & State Budget Update | 1 |
| | | 325 | 8/28/2009 | Implmenting Mandatory Cost Saving Program fo | 3 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Revicw of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 364 | 1/22/2010 | Going Paperless - Benefits of Technology | 1.5 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of he Press | 1 |
| | | 368 | 3/10/2010 | Auditor's Web Site as a Communications Tool | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|---|--------------|
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 371 | 3/10/2010 | Communicating on the Stump | 0.75 |
| | | 380 | 3/26/2010 | ARRA Requirements | 1 |
| | | 386 | 4/23/2010 | Board of Revision Today and Tomorrow | 1.25 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptrnshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resourees | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 64 | 6/13/2007 | Manufactured Homes/Real Property Conveyance | 1 |
| | | 66 | 6/13/2007 | Tax Incentive Review Councils | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 83 | 10/26/2007 | Update from State Legislators | 1 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 9 | 3/30/2007 | Legislative Review and Update | 1.75 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|----------------|----------------------|----------|------------|--|---------------|
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Huron Total</i> | 186.75 |
| Jackson | Clyde Holdren | | | | |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 149 | 3/14/2008 | Auditor of State County Software Project | 1.5 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 210 | 8/8/2008 | OPERS Employer Outreach & Deferred Comp O | 1.25 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 253 | 2/13/2009 | Conversion Levy, Other Levies, Rate Setting | 1 |
| | | 274 | 5/8/2009 | Appraisal Approaches & Sales Verification | 1.5 |
| | | 28 | 7/13/2007 | Details on new state budget | 1.25 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 363 | 1/22/2010 | Organizational/Legislative Discussion | 1.25 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|---|--------------|
| | | 372 | 3/12/2010 | Media and the County Auditor | 0.75 |
| | | 373 | 3/12/2010 | TIF and TIRC in Delaware County | 1 |
| | | 374 | 3/12/2010 | Board of Revision Today and Tomorrow | 1 |
| | | 388 | 5/14/2010 | Tangible Personal Property & Other Reimburseem | 0.75 |
| | | 389 | 5/14/2010 | Levies that Can Grow with Time | 0.75 |
| | | 390 | 5/14/2010 | CAUV: A Look Back & A Look Ahead | 1.25 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 424 | 10/8/2010 | Tax Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 425 | 10/8/2010 | REA: Past, Present & Future | 0.5 |
| | | 439 | 1/11/2011 | County Auditors and School Treasurers Worksh | 3.25 |
| | | 442 | 2/11/2011 | Use of Sales Ratios in Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 443 | 2/11/2011 | Unclassified Positions & Appointing Deputies | 0.5 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Eneumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|----------------------|----------------------------|----------|------------|---|---------------|
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 62 | 6/13/2007 | Board of Revision Issues & Procedures | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 78 | 9/14/2007 | Special Assess. & New Man. Homes Installation | 1.5 |
| | | 79 | 10/12/2007 | CAUV and Forest Land | 1 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| <i>Jackson Total</i> | | | | | 117.25 |
| Jefferson | Patrick J. Marshall | | | | |
| | | 124 | 5/22/2007 | Emerging Trends in Fraud Investigation & Preve | 16 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 175 | 5/14/2008 | Emerging Trends in Fraud Investigation | 16 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 213 | 9/10/2008 | Quality Management & Improvement in Govern | 1 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 300 | 7/8/2009 | OGRIP Implementation of HB420, Retirement O | 1 |
| | | 323 | 8/7/2009 | Continuity of Operatins & Disaster Recovery | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 327 | 9/11/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1.25 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 419 | 5/18/2010 | Emerging Trends in Fraud Investigation | 15 |
| | | 423 | 9/24/2010 | How Does Grape Production Qualify for CAUV? | 2 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|----------------------|----------|------------|---|---------------|
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Jefferson Total</i> | 129.75 |
| Knox | Jonette Curry | | | | |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 263 | 4/3/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 300 | 7/8/2009 | OGRIP Implementation of HB420, Retirement O | 1 |
| | | 323 | 8/7/2009 | Continuity of Operations & Disaster Recovery | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 353 | 3/30/2009 | Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | 361 | 1/15/2010 | A. G.'s Office - Formal Opinion Proecess | 1 |
| | | 365 | 2/5/2010 | Empowering and Strengthening Ohio's People | 1 |
| | | 384 | 4/9/2010 | GIS Workshop Morning Session | 3.25 |
| | | 385 | 4/9/2010 | GIS Workshop Afternoon Session | 2 |
| | | 387 | 5/7/2010 | Dog License Software, Misc Dog Presentations | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|---------------------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 438 | 1/7/2011 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 445 | 3/4/2011 | Weights & Measures Training Program | 0.5 |
| | | | | <i>Knox Total</i> | 65.75 |
| Lake | Edward H. Zupancic | | | | |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremtnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 263 | 4/3/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 273 | 5/1/2009 | Accounting for Federal Stimulus Money | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|---|--------------|
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-----------------|---------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 445 | 3/4/2011 | Weights & Measures Training Program | 0.5 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 62 | 6/13/2007 | Board of Revision Issues & Procedures | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Lake Total</i> | 88 |
| Lawrence | Ray T. Dutey | | | | |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|---|--------------|
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisal | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 446 | 3/11/2011 | Theory/Use of Sales Rations-Residential Reappraisal | 2 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbranc.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|----------------|-------------------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 78 | 9/14/2007 | Special Assess. & New Man. Homes Installation | 1.5 |
| | | | | <i>Lawrence Total</i> | 43.5 |
| Licking | Michael Smith | | | | |
| | | 442 | 2/11/2011 | Use of Sales Ratios in Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 443 | 2/11/2011 | Unclassified Positions & Appointing Deputies | 0.5 |
| | | | | <i>Licking Total</i> | 1.5 |
| Logan | Michael E. Yoder | | | | |
| | | 128 | 1/18/2008 | Update from State Legislators | 1 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 152 | 3/21/2008 | 10 Mill Certificates | 1 |
| | | 16 | 4/20/2007 | Brown County GIS Project | 0.75 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremtnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisal | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 205 | 7/18/2008 | Personal Property Tax & Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Benefits | 0.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 252 | 2/4/2009 | Legislative Meeting | 1 |
| | | 260 | 3/20/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies, Estimate Rev | 1 |
| | | 262 | 3/27/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 277 | 5/15/2009 | Report from Ohio Commission on Local Govt Re | 1 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 295 | 6/11/2009 | CAAO Collaboration & Technology Issues | 0.5 |
| | | 301 | 7/17/2009 | State Budget and Other Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 336 | 10/16/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 362 | 1/15/2010 | Roundtable: AOS appraisals, BTA, tax rates | 1 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of the Press | 1 |
| | | 368 | 3/10/2010 | Auditor's Web Site as a Communications Tool | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 371 | 3/10/2010 | Communicating on the Stump | 0.75 |
| | | 375 | 3/19/2010 | Update to Fiscal Opportunities in ARRA | 1 |
| | | 421 | 9/17/2010 | ODT web site, sales tax; CCAO SB 232 tax exem | 2 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 6 | 3/16/2007 | Real Property Abstract Preparation | 1.75 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 62 | 6/13/2007 | Board of Revision Issues & Procedures | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 75 | 9/19/2007 | Residential Rental Regis. Requirement | 0.5 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|---------------|------------------------|--------------------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | <i>Logan Total</i> | | | 134.5 |
| Lorain | Mark R. Stewart | | | | |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 158 | 4/18/2008 | Forecasting Revenue | 7 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 199 | 10/15/2007 | Ohio Public Records & Open Meetings Laws | 3 |
| | | 213 | 9/10/2008 | Quality Management & Improvement in Govern | 1 |
| | | 224 | 9/17/2008 | NE Ohio Residential Market Update | 2 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 263 | 4/3/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 280 | 3/13/2009 | * National USPAP Update Course | 7 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|--------------|--------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 5 | 3/16/2007 | National USPAP Update Course | 7 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | | | <i>Lorain Total</i> | 61 |
| Lucas | Anita Lopez | | | | |
| | | 131 | 2/1/2008 | Fundamentals of Real Property Appraisal | 30 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisal | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 232 | 10/3/2007 | Ohio Sunshine Laws | 3 |
| | | 233 | 10/3/2007 | Employment Law Update | 3.25 |
| | | 234 | 12/12/2007 | * Professionalism, Ethics, Sub Abuse | 2.5 |
| | | 235 | 12/6/2007 | Title Insurance Seminar | 3 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 26 | 7/27/2007 | BOR: Challenges of Valuing Lakeside Propertie | 1.25 |
| | | 277 | 5/15/2009 | Report from Ohio Commission on Local Govt Re | 1 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 29 | 6/1/2007 | Budget Proposal on Expansion of Homestead Ex | 1 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 364 | 1/22/2010 | Going Paperless - Benefits of Technology | 1.5 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremtnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|--------------------|-----------------------|----------|------------|---|---------------|
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 75 | 9/19/2007 | Residential Rental Regis. Requirement | 0.5 |
| | | 83 | 10/26/2007 | Update from State Legislators | 1 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| <i>Lucas Total</i> | | | | | 134.25 |
| Madison | Jim Williamson | | | | |
| | | 101 | 10/29/2007 | * USPAP | 7.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 102 | 10/30/2007 | * USPAP | 7.5 |
| | | 128 | 1/18/2008 | Update from State Legislators | 1 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 150 | 2/28/2008 | 2008 GIS/CAMA Technologies Education Sessio | 10 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 174 | 5/16/2008 | Auditor of State LGS & Software Development | 1 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 205 | 7/18/2008 | Personal Property Tax & Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 249 | 1/16/2009 | Gearing Up for an Active BOR Season | 1.5 |
| | | 252 | 2/4/2009 | Legislative Meeting | 1 |
| | | 260 | 3/20/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies, Estimate Rev | 1 |
| | | 277 | 5/15/2009 | Report from Ohio Commission on Local Govt Re | 1 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 295 | 6/11/2009 | CAAO Collaboration & Technology Issues | 0.5 |
| | | 301 | 7/17/2009 | State Budget and Other Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 336 | 10/16/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of he Press | 1 |
| | | 368 | 3/10/2010 | Auditor's Web Site as a Communications Tool | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 371 | 3/10/2010 | Communicating on the Stump | 0.75 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 409 | 7/16/2010 | CAAO Legislative Prioirties for 2011-2012 | 1.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 444 | 2/18/2011 | Changes in OPERS | 1 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-----------------|--------------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Madison Total</i> | 154 |
| Mahoning | Michael Sciortino | | | | |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 159 | 3/28/2008 | Local Government Officials' Conference | 5 |
| | | 169 | 5/2/2008 | Auditor of State Local Govt. Services | 1 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisal | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 202 | 7/9/2008 | Dog License Registration Information | 0.75 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 216 | 9/16/2008 | Preparing&Executing Real Prop Settlement on M | 1 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Benefits | 0.5 |
| | | 221 | 9/16/2008 | CAUV Beginning to End | 1 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 230 | 10/31/2008 | Record Retention and Dealing with E-Mails | 1.5 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 24 | 4/12/2007 | Ohio Weights & Measures Assoc Conference | 3 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 251 | 2/6/2009 | Weights & Measures Update; Report from MWC | 1 |
| | | 252 | 2/4/2009 | Legislative Meeting | 1 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 257 | 3/6/2009 | Legislative Updates | 1 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 295 | 6/11/2009 | CAAO Collaboration & Technology Issues | 0.5 |
| | | 300 | 7/8/2009 | OGRIP Implementation of HB420,Retirement O | 1 |
| | | 327 | 9/11/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1.25 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 361 | 1/15/2010 | A. G.'s Office - Formal Opinion Process | 1 |
| | | 365 | 2/5/2010 | Empowering and Strengthening Ohio's People | 1 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|---------------|---------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 408 | 7/9/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.5 |
| | | 438 | 1/7/2011 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 71 | 9/7/2007 | IT & GIS Development | 1 |
| | | 82 | 10/25/2007 | Team Building for Optimum Success | 1 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | | | <i>Mahoning Total</i> | 100.5 |
| Marion | Joan Kasotis | | | | |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | *Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | *Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 156 | 4/9/2008 | Introductory Governmental Accounting Seminar | 16 |
| | | 161 | 4/25/2008 | Equalization, Exempt & Conveyance Forms | 1 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 208 | 7/25/2008 | Abstracts that are Due in October | 1 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 211 | 8/22/2008 | Project Planning and Strategy | 1 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 225 | 9/26/2008 | CAUV A Closer Look at the Formula | 1 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 229 | 10/24/2008 | Personal Property Tax and Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 250 | 1/23/2009 | BOR Legal Updates and Refresher | 1.25 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 262 | 3/27/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 266 | 9/19/2008 | Certified Public Records training | 3 |
| | | 269 | 9/10/2008 | Ohio GFOA Fall Conference | 16 |
| | | 279 | 5/29/2009 | Update from State Legss & IT on a Tight Budg | 1.75 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 29 | 6/1/2007 | Budget Proposal on Expansion of Homestead Ex | 1 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 31 | 6/29/2007 | Civil Service Law & Public Records | 5 |
| | | 317 | 7/24/2009 | Courage in Tough Times & State Budget Update | 1 |
| | | 32 | 5/21/2007 | HB-694 Training Seminar | 5 |
| | | 33 | 5/23/2007 | Ohio Land Records Conference | 7.5 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 352 | 11/19/2009 | Summit on Local Government Sustainability | 5.5 |
| | | 364 | 1/22/2010 | Going Paperless - Benefits of Technology | 1.5 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of the Press | 1 |
| | | 368 | 3/10/2010 | Auditor's Web Site as a Communications Tool | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 371 | 3/10/2010 | Communicating on the Stump | 0.75 |
| | | 380 | 3/26/2010 | ARRA Requirements | 1 |
| | | 386 | 4/23/2010 | Board of Revision Today and Tomorrow | 1.25 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 422 | 9/24/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities | 1 |
| | | 427 | 10/22/2010 | Future of CAUV Sol Values; Do We Need to Ch | 1.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|---------------|--------------------------|----------|------------|---|---------------|
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 66 | 6/13/2007 | Tax Incentive Review Councils | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 83 | 10/26/2007 | Update from State Legislators | 1 |
| | | 9 | 3/30/2007 | Legislative Review and Update | 1.75 |
| | | | | <i>Marion Total</i> | 164.25 |
| Medina | Michael E. Kovack | | | | |
| | | 12 | 4/13/2007 | BCII Financial Investigation & Real Estate Roun | 1.5 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | *Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 132 | 3/29/2007 | *General Military Training Drugs, Alcohol & Tob | 1 |
| | | 133 | 3/29/2007 | *General Military Training Sexual Assault Prevent | 1 |
| | | 134 | 3/29/2007 | General Military Training Personnal Financial M | 1 |
| | | 135 | 3/29/2007 | Gernal Military Training Operational Risk Mngt | 1 |
| | | 136 | 2/12/2008 | DoD information Assurance Awareness | 1 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | *Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 140 | 1/17/2008 | Ohio Forest Tax Law/CAUV Seminar | 2.5 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 155 | 4/11/2008 | Emergency Management, E-911 & GIS | 1 |
| | | 160 | 4/18/2008 | Lean Six Sigma | 3 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremtnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 247 | 4/9/2008 | Comptroller Training Symposium | 7.75 |
| | | 251 | 2/6/2009 | Weights & Measures Update; Report from MWC | 1 |
| | | 252 | 2/4/2009 | Legislative Meeting | 1 |
| | | 257 | 3/6/2009 | Legislative Updates | 1 |
| | | 273 | 5/1/2009 | Accounting for Federal Stimulus Money | 1 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 356 | 7/17/2009 | Save our Homes | 5 |
| | | 357 | 9/10/2009 | Leadership Retreat | 12 |
| | | 358 | 10/14/2009 | History Day | 6 |
| | | 359 | 10/28/2009 | Regional Day | 4 |
| | | 360 | 10/29/2009 | Government Day | 0 |
| | | 365 | 2/5/2010 | Empowering and Strengthening Ohio's People | 1 |
| | | 366 | 3/5/2010 | I Look About | 1 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of he Press | 1 |
| | | 368 | 3/10/2010 | Auditor's Web Site as a Communications Tool | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 371 | 3/10/2010 | Communicating on the Stump | 0.75 |
| | | 381 | 2/10/2010 | Education Day | 1.75 |
| | | 382 | 3/17/2010 | Agriculture Day | 5.5 |
| | | 384 | 4/9/2010 | GIS Workshop Morning Session | 3.25 |
| | | 385 | 4/9/2010 | GIS Workshop Afternoon Session | 2 |
| | | 387 | 5/7/2010 | Dog License Software, Misc Dog Presentations | 1 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 408 | 7/9/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.5 |
| | | 410 | 8/6/2010 | Photography as Alternative to Reappraisal Requir | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|--------------|------------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| | | 411 | 8/6/2010 | Health Insurance and Retirement | 0.5 |
| | | 423 | 9/24/2010 | How Does Grape Production Qualify for CAUV? | 2 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 438 | 1/7/2011 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 445 | 3/4/2011 | Weights & Measures Training Program | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | | | <i>Medina Total</i> | 131 |
| Meigs | Mary Hill | | | | |
| | | 127 | 1/11/2008 | Update from State Legislators | 0.75 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 149 | 3/14/2008 | Auditor of State County Software Project | 1.5 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 172 | 5/9/2008 | Special Assessments | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 203 | 7/11/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 215 | 9/19/2008 | Sales Tax Distribution & Winding Down PPT | 1.25 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 25 | 5/11/2007 | Budget and Finance | 1.25 |
| | | 253 | 2/13/2009 | Conversion Levy, Other Levies, Rate Setting | 1 |
| | | 259 | 3/13/2009 | Board of Revision - Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 274 | 5/8/2009 | Appraisal Approaches & Sales Verification | 1.5 |
| | | 28 | 7/13/2007 | Details on new state budget | 1.25 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 3 | 3/14/2007 | Catalyst Self Assessment Jan'Feb 2007 | 2 |
| | | 324 | 8/12/2009 | AoS Compliance Manual & State Legislators | 2 |
| | | 326 | 9/9/2009 | Updates on Legislation and Other Items | 1.5 |
| | | 332 | 10/14/2009 | Internal Acctng Control Manual & OH Mnfctd H | 1.5 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 363 | 1/22/2010 | Organizational/Legislative Discussion | 1.25 |
| | | 372 | 3/12/2010 | Media and the County Auditor | 0.75 |
| | | 373 | 3/12/2010 | TIF and TIRC in Delaware County | 1 |
| | | 374 | 3/12/2010 | Board of Revision Today and Tomorrow | 1 |
| | | 388 | 5/14/2010 | Tangible Personal Property & Other Reimbursem | 0.75 |
| | | 389 | 5/14/2010 | Levies that Can Grow with Time | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|---|--------------|
| | | 390 | 5/14/2010 | CAUV: A Look Back & A Look Ahead | 1.25 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 412 | 8/13/2010 | County UAN Update and Discussion | 0.75 |
| | | 413 | 8/13/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.25 |
| | | 424 | 10/8/2010 | Tax Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Excm | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 439 | 1/11/2011 | County Auditors and School Treasurers Worksh | 3.25 |
| | | 442 | 2/11/2011 | Use of Sales Ratios in Reappraisals | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 64 | 6/13/2007 | Manufactured Homes/Real Property Conveyance | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 69 | 8/10/2007 | Round Table Discussion | 1 |
| | | 78 | 9/14/2007 | Special Assess. & New Man. Homes Installation | 1.5 |
| | | 79 | 10/12/2007 | CAUV and Forest Land | 1 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|---------------|------------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Meigs Total</i> | 143.75 |
| Mercer | Mark R. Giesige | | | | |
| | | 129 | 1/25/2008 | Budget Commission Responsibilities | 1 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | *Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 139 | 2/22/2008 | Auditor of State's LGS & Software Development | 2 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | *Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 161 | 4/25/2008 | Equalization, Exempt & Conveyance Forms | 1 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | *Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | *Ethics | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisal | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 252 | 2/4/2009 | Legislative Meeting | 1 |
| | | 278 | 5/14/2009 | Planned Giving | 24 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 29 | 6/1/2007 | Budget Proposal on Expansion of Homestead Ex | 1 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 295 | 6/11/2009 | CAAO Collaboration & Technology Issues | 0.5 |
| | | 317 | 7/24/2009 | Courage in Tough Times & State Budget Update | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 386 | 4/23/2010 | Board of Revision Today and Tomorrow | 1.25 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|--------------|----------------------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 440 | 1/28/2011 | Getting Ready for BOR Season | 1 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Mare Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 9 | 3/30/2007 | Legislative Review and Update | 1.75 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | | | <i>Mercer Total</i> | 96 |
| Miami | Matthew W. Gearhard | | | | |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Diffieult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 329 | 9/18/2009 | Sales Verification, Stats & State Oversight | 0.75 |
| | | 336 | 10/16/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|--------------------|---------------------|-----------------|-------------|---|---------------------|
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 354 | 11/28/2007 | Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | 375 | 3/19/2010 | Update to Fiscal Opportunities in ARRA | 1 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 409 | 7/16/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.5 |
| | | 426 | 10/15/2010 | Butler County Web Portal | 0.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|---------------|---------------------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | | | <i>Miami Total</i> | 51.25 |
| Monroe | Pandora J. Neuhart | | | | |
| | | 155 | 4/11/2008 | Emergency Management, E-911 & GIS | 1 |
| | | 172 | 5/9/2008 | Special Assessments | 1 |
| | | 203 | 7/11/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 215 | 9/19/2008 | Sales Tax Distribution & Winding Down PPT | 1.25 |
| | | 25 | 5/11/2007 | Budget and Finance | 1.25 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Recapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 388 | 5/14/2010 | Tangible Personal Property & Other Reimburse | 0.75 |
| | | 389 | 5/14/2010 | Levies that Can Grow with Time | 0.75 |
| | | 390 | 5/14/2010 | CAUV: A Look Back & A Look Ahead | 1.25 |
| | | 392 | 4/24/2010 | * Saving Lives-Understanding Depression and Sui | 7 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 393 | 6/4/2010 | * Ohio Ethics | 2 |
| | | 424 | 10/8/2010 | Tax Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 425 | 10/8/2010 | REA: Past, Present & Future | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 62 | 6/13/2007 | Board of Revision Issues & Procedures | 1 |
| | | 64 | 6/13/2007 | Manufactured Homes/Real Property Conveyance | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------------|-------------------|---------------------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | <i>Monroe Total</i> | | | 64.25 |
| Montgomery | Karl Keith | | | | |
| | | 128 | 1/18/2008 | Update from State Legislators | 1 |
| | | 152 | 3/21/2008 | 10 Mill Certificates | 1 |
| | | 157 | 4/18/2008 | Fundamentals of Real Property Appraisal | 30 |
| | | 16 | 4/20/2007 | Brown County GIS Project | 0.75 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 167 | 4/22/2008 | Reducing Liability Risk for County Auditors | 1.5 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 177 | 5/27/2008 | Montgomery Cty Farm Bureau Seminar | 1 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 249 | 1/16/2009 | Gearing Up for an Active BOR Season | 1.5 |
| | | 252 | 2/4/2009 | Legislative Meeting | 1 |
| | | 253 | 2/13/2009 | Conversion Levy, Other Levies, Rate Setting | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 258 | 3/12/2009 | OASBO School Finance Seminar | 3 |
| | | 260 | 3/20/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies, Estimate Rev | 1 |
| | | 27 | 7/20/2007 | Remission of penalties & new Homestead change | 1.25 |
| | | 277 | 5/15/2009 | Report from Ohio Commission on Local Govt Re | 1 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 301 | 7/17/2009 | State Budget and Other Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 329 | 9/18/2009 | Sales Verification, Stats & State Oversight | 0.75 |
| | | 336 | 10/16/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 362 | 1/15/2010 | Roundtable: AOS appraisals, BTA, tax rates | 1 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of he Press | 1 |
| | | 368 | 3/10/2010 | Auditor's Web Site as a Communications Tool | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 409 | 7/16/2010 | CAAO Legislative Prioirties for 2011-2012 | 1.5 |
| | | 426 | 10/15/2010 | Butler County Web Portal | 0.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 66 | 6/13/2007 | Tax Incentive Review Councils | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|---------------|-------------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Montgomery Total</i> | 154.5 |
| Morgan | Gary D. Woodward | | | | |
| | | 127 | 1/11/2008 | Update from State Legislators | 0.75 |
| | | 155 | 4/11/2008 | Emergency Management, E-911 & GIS | 1 |
| | | 172 | 5/9/2008 | Special Assessments | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisal | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 203 | 7/11/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 25 | 5/11/2007 | Budget and Finance | 1.25 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 253 | 2/13/2009 | Conversion Levy, Other Levies, Rate Setting | 1 |
| | | 274 | 5/8/2009 | Appraisal Approaches & Sales Verification | 1.5 |
| | | 28 | 7/13/2007 | Details on new state budget | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 3 | 3/14/2007 | Catalyst Self Assessment Jan'Feb 2007 | 2 |
| | | 332 | 10/14/2009 | Internal Acctng Control Manual & OH Mnfcctd H | 1.5 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 363 | 1/22/2010 | Organizational/Legislative Discussion | 1.25 |
| | | 372 | 3/12/2010 | Media and the County Auditor | 0.75 |
| | | 373 | 3/12/2010 | TIF and TIRC in Delaware County | 1 |
| | | 388 | 5/14/2010 | Tangible Personal Property & Other Reimburse | 0.75 |
| | | 389 | 5/14/2010 | Levies that Can Grow with Time | 0.75 |
| | | 390 | 5/14/2010 | CAUV: A Look Back & A Look Ahead | 1.25 |
| | | 412 | 8/13/2010 | County UAN Update and Discussion | 0.75 |
| | | 413 | 8/13/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.25 |
| | | 424 | 10/8/2010 | Tax Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 439 | 1/11/2011 | County Auditors and School Treasurers Worksh | 3.25 |
| | | 442 | 2/11/2011 | Use of Sales Ratios in Reappraisals | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|---------------|------------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 446 | 3/11/2011 | Theory/Use of Sales Rations-Residential Reappra | 2 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 69 | 8/10/2007 | Round Table Discussion | 1 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Morgan Total</i> | 74 |
| Morrow | Mary M. Holtrey | | | | |
| | | 129 | 1/25/2008 | Budget Commission Responsibilities | 1 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 154 | 3/28/2008 | PERS Employer Reporting | 1 |
| | | 161 | 4/25/2008 | Equalization, Exempt & Conveyance Forms | 1 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 178 | 5/30/2008 | Special Assessments | 1.5 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisal | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 208 | 7/25/2008 | Abstracts that are Due in October | 1 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 211 | 8/22/2008 | Project Planning and Strategy | 1 |
| | | 225 | 9/26/2008 | CAUV A Closer Look at the Formula | 1 |
| | | 229 | 10/24/2008 | Personal Property Tax and Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 262 | 3/27/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 271 | 4/16/2009 | Fundamentals of Real Property Appiasal | 12 |
| | | 279 | 5/29/2009 | Update from State Legsss & IT on a Tight Budg | 1.75 |
| | | 317 | 7/24/2009 | Courage in Tough Times & State Budget Update | 1 |
| | | 325 | 8/28/2009 | Implmenting Mandatory Cost Saving Program fo | 3 |
| | | 333 | 9/25/2009 | Henry Cty Transportation Initiaitive & Cty Budg | 1 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of he Press | 1 |
| | | 368 | 3/10/2010 | Auditor's Web Site as a Communications Tool | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Finaneial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 386 | 4/23/2010 | Board of Revision Today and Tomorrow | 1.25 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|---------------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 422 | 9/24/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities | 1 |
| | | 440 | 1/28/2011 | Getting Ready for BOR Season | 1 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 83 | 10/26/2007 | Update from State Legislators | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| <i>Morrow Total</i> | | | | | 110 |

Muskingum Debra J. Nye

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|--------------|------------------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| | | 412 | 8/13/2010 | County UAN Update and Discussion | 0.75 |
| | | 413 | 8/13/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.25 |
| | | 424 | 10/8/2010 | Tax Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 425 | 10/8/2010 | REA: Past, Present & Future | 0.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 439 | 1/11/2011 | County Auditors and School Treasurers Worksh | 3.25 |
| | | 442 | 2/11/2011 | Use of Sales Ratios in Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 443 | 2/11/2011 | Unclassified Positions & Appointing Deputies | 0.5 |
| | | | | <i>Muskingum Total</i> | 18.5 |
| Noble | Alice L. Warner | | | | |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | *Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 155 | 4/11/2008 | Emergency Management, E-911 & GIS | 1 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 172 | 5/9/2008 | Special Assessments | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 215 | 9/19/2008 | Sales Tax Distribution & Winding Down PPT | 1.25 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 25 | 5/11/2007 | Budget and Finance | 1.25 |
| | | 297 | 6/25/2009 | ARRA Training | 2.5 |
| | | 326 | 9/9/2009 | Updates on Legislation and Other Items | 1.5 |
| | | 388 | 5/14/2010 | Tangible Personal Property & Other Reimburseem | 0.75 |
| | | 389 | 5/14/2010 | Levies that Can Grow with Time | 0.75 |
| | | 390 | 5/14/2010 | CAUV: A Look Back & A Look Ahead | 1.25 |
| | | 424 | 10/8/2010 | Tax Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 425 | 10/8/2010 | REA: Past, Present & Future | 0.5 |
| | | 69 | 8/10/2007 | Round Table Discussion | 1 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|--------------------|--------------------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| <i>Noble Total</i> | | | | | 45.25 |
| Ottawa | Jo Ellen R. Regal | | | | |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 139 | 2/22/2008 | Auditor of State's LGS & Software Development | 2 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 154 | 3/28/2008 | PERS Employer Reporting | 1 |
| | | 161 | 4/25/2008 | Equalization, Exempt & Conveyance Forms | 1 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 178 | 5/30/2008 | Special Assessments | 1.5 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 203 | 7/11/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 208 | 7/25/2008 | Abstracts that are Due in October | 1 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 225 | 9/26/2008 | CAUV A Closer Look at the Formula | 1 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 229 | 10/24/2008 | Personal Property Tax and Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 250 | 1/23/2009 | BOR Legal Updates and Refresher | 1.25 |
| | | 252 | 2/4/2009 | Legislative Meeting | 1 |
| | | 26 | 7/27/2007 | BOR: Challenges of Valuing Lakeside Propertie | 1.25 |
| | | 262 | 3/27/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 279 | 5/29/2009 | Update from State Legss & IT on a Tight Budg | 1.75 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 325 | 8/28/2009 | Implmenting Mandatory Cost Saving Program fo | 3 |
| | | 333 | 9/25/2009 | Henry Cty Transportation Initiaitive & Cty Budg | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 364 | 1/22/2010 | Going Paperless - Benefits of Technology | 1.5 |
| | | 380 | 3/26/2010 | ARRA Requirements | 1 |
| | | 386 | 4/23/2010 | Board of Revision Today and Tomorrow | 1.25 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|---|--------------|
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 422 | 9/24/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities | 1 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 440 | 1/28/2011 | Getting Ready for BOR Season | 1 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-----------------|-------------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 62 | 6/13/2007 | Board of Revision Issues & Procedures | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 66 | 6/13/2007 | Tax Incentive Review Councils | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Ottawa Total</i> | 144.5 |
| Paulding | Susan K. Simpson | | | | |
| | | 129 | 1/25/2008 | Budget Commission Responsibilities | 1 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | *Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 139 | 2/22/2008 | Auditor of State's LGS & Software Development | 2 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | *Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 154 | 3/28/2008 | PERS Employer Reporting | 1 |
| | | 161 | 4/25/2008 | Equalization, Exempt & Conveyance Forms | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|--------------------|---------------------|-----------------|-------------|--|---------------------|
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 167 | 4/22/2008 | Reducing Liability Risk for County Auditors | 1.5 |
| | | 173 | 3/21/2008 | IAAO Course 402 Tax Policy | 30 |
| | | 178 | 5/30/2008 | Special Assessments | 1.5 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 208 | 7/25/2008 | Abstracts that are Due in October | 1 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 229 | 10/24/2008 | Personal Property Tax and Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 250 | 1/23/2009 | BOR Legal Updates and Refresher | 1.25 |
| | | 262 | 3/27/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 317 | 7/24/2009 | Courage in Tough Times & State Budget Update | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of he Press | 1 |
| | | 368 | 3/10/2010 | Auditor's Web Site as a Communications Tool | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 371 | 3/10/2010 | Communicating on the Stump | 0.75 |
| | | 427 | 10/22/2010 | Future of CAUV Sol Values; Do We Need to Ch | 1.5 |
| | | 440 | 1/28/2011 | Getting Ready for BOR Season | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 62 | 6/13/2007 | Board of Revision Issues & Procedures | 1 |
| | | 64 | 6/13/2007 | Manufactured Homes/Real Property Conveyance | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 66 | 6/13/2007 | Tax Incentive Review Councils | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 9 | 3/30/2007 | Legislative Review and Update | 1.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|--------------|-------------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Paulding Total</i> | 136.5 |
| Perry | Teresa Stevenson | | | | |
| | | 12 | 4/13/2007 | BCH Financial Investigation & Real Estate Roun | 1.5 |
| | | 127 | 1/11/2008 | Update from State Legislators | 0.75 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 149 | 3/14/2008 | Auditor of State County Software Project | 1.5 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 167 | 4/22/2008 | Reducing Liability Risk for County Auditors | 1.5 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 172 | 5/9/2008 | Special Assessments | 1 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 203 | 7/11/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 210 | 8/8/2008 | OPERS Employer Outreach & Deferred Comp O | 1.25 |
| | | 215 | 9/10/2008 | Sales Tax Distribution & Winding Down PPT | 1.25 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 248 | 12/15/2008 | Assessment Administration | 30 |
| | | 25 | 5/11/2007 | Budget and Finance | 1.25 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 259 | 3/13/2009 | Board of Revision - Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 271 | 4/16/2009 | Fundamentals of Real Property Appraisal | 30 |
| | | 274 | 5/8/2009 | Appraisal Approaches & Sales Verification | 1.5 |
| | | 28 | 7/13/2007 | Details on new state budget | 1.25 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reappraisal | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retention & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 295 | 6/11/2009 | CAAO Collaboration & Technology Issues | 0.5 |
| | | 324 | 8/12/2009 | AoS Compliance Manual & State Legislators | 2 |
| | | 326 | 9/9/2009 | Updates on Legislation and Other Items | 1.5 |
| | | 328 | 9/14/2009 | Implementing County Cost Svgs Program | 3 |
| | | 332 | 10/14/2009 | Internal Acctng Control Manual & OH Mnfctd H | 1.5 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 363 | 1/22/2010 | Organizational/Legislative Discussion | 1.25 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of the Press | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 371 | 3/10/2010 | Communicating on the Stump | 0.75 |
| | | 372 | 3/12/2010 | Media and the County Auditor | 0.75 |
| | | 373 | 3/12/2010 | TIF and TIRC in Delaware County | 1 |
| | | 374 | 3/12/2010 | Board of Revision Today and Tomorrow | 1 |
| | | 376 | 1/19/2010 | Microsoft Excel | 6 |
| | | 377 | 1/20/2010 | Advanced Microsoft Excel | 6 |
| | | 384 | 4/9/2010 | GIS Workshop Morning Session | 3.25 |
| | | 385 | 4/9/2010 | GIS Workshop Afternoon Session | 2 |
| | | 388 | 5/14/2010 | Tangible Personal Property & Other Reimbursements | 0.75 |
| | | 389 | 5/14/2010 | Levies that Can Grow with Time | 0.75 |
| | | 390 | 5/14/2010 | CAUV: A Look Back & A Look Ahead | 1.25 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|---|--------------|
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 412 | 8/13/2010 | County UAN Update and Discussion | 0.75 |
| | | 413 | 8/13/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.25 |
| | | 424 | 10/8/2010 | Tax Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 425 | 10/8/2010 | REA: Past, Present & Future | 0.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 442 | 2/11/2011 | Use of Sales Ratios in Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 443 | 2/11/2011 | Unclassified Positions & Appointing Deputies | 0.5 |
| | | 446 | 3/11/2011 | Theory/Use of Sales Rations-Residential Reappra | 2 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|--------------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 79 | 10/12/2007 | CAUV and Forest Land | 1 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| <i>Perry Total</i> | | | | | 246.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| Pickaway | Melissa Betz | | | | |
| | | 128 | 1/18/2008 | Update from State Legislators | 1 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 155 | 4/11/2008 | Emergency Management, E-911 & GIS | 1 |
| | | 16 | 4/20/2007 | Brown County GIS Project | 0.75 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 167 | 4/22/2008 | Reducing Liability Risk for County Auditors | 1.5 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 174 | 5/16/2008 | Auditor of State LGS & Software Development | 1 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Biental Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 205 | 7/18/2008 | Personal Property Tax & Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 249 | 1/16/2009 | Gearing Up for an Active BOR Season | 1.5 |
| | | 252 | 2/4/2009 | Legislative Meeting | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 260 | 3/20/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies, Estimate Rev | 1 |
| | | 27 | 7/20/2007 | Remission of penalties & new Homestead change | 1.25 |
| | | 277 | 5/15/2009 | Report from Ohio Commission on Local Govt Re | 1 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Rccords | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 295 | 6/11/2009 | CAAO Collaboration & Technology Issues | 0.5 |
| | | 301 | 7/17/2009 | State Budget and Other Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 329 | 9/18/2009 | Sales Verification, Stats & State Oversight | 0.75 |
| | | 336 | 10/16/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 362 | 1/15/2010 | Roundtable: AOS appraisals, BTA, tax rates | 1 |
| | | 375 | 3/19/2010 | Update to Fiscal Opportunities in ARRA | 1 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | CAUV Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 421 | 9/17/2010 | ODT web site, sales tax; CCAO SB 232 tax exem | 2 |
| | | 426 | 10/15/2010 | Butler County Web Portal | 0.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Enrgy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 439 | 1/11/2011 | County Auditors and School Treasurers Worksh | 3.25 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 6 | 3/16/2007 | Real Property Abstract Preparation | 1.75 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 62 | 6/13/2007 | Board of Revision Issues & Procedures | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 66 | 6/13/2007 | Tax Incentive Review Councils | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 80 | 10/19/2007 | Ohio Manufactured Homes Commission | 1 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|-----------------------|----------|------------|--|---------------|
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Pickaway Total</i> | 162.75 |
| Pike | Ted L. Wheeler | | | | |
| | | 149 | 3/14/2008 | Auditor of State County Software Project | 1.5 |
| | | 155 | 4/11/2008 | Emergency Management, E-911 & GIS | 1 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisal | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 253 | 2/13/2009 | Conversion Levy, Other Levies, Rate Setting | 1 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 274 | 5/8/2009 | Appraisal Approaches & Sales Verification | 1.5 |
| | | 28 | 7/13/2007 | Details on new state budget | 1.25 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 295 | 6/11/2009 | CAAO Collaboration & Technology Issues | 0.5 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 363 | 1/22/2010 | Organizational/Legislative Discussion | 1.25 |
| | | 372 | 3/12/2010 | Media and the County Auditor | 0.75 |
| | | 373 | 3/12/2010 | TIF and TIRC in Delaware County | 1 |
| | | 374 | 3/12/2010 | Board of Revision Today and Tomorrow | 1 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 446 | 3/11/2011 | Theory/Use of Sales Rations-Residential Reappr | 2 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 78 | 9/14/2007 | Special Assess. & New Man. Homes Installation | 1.5 |
| | | 79 | 10/12/2007 | CAUV and Forest Land | 1 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Mare Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|----------------|-----------------------|-------------------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | <i>Pike Total</i> | | | 114.25 |
| Portage | Janet Esposito | | | | |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 202 | 7/9/2008 | Dog License Registration Information | 0.75 |
| | | 207 | 7/20/2008 | Ohio Public Finance Officers Training | 12 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 268 | 11/16/2007 | Ohio Public Records and Open Meetings | 3 |
| | | 273 | 5/1/2009 | Accounting for Federal Stimulus Money | 1 |
| | | 299 | 6/19/2009 | Ohio Public Finance Officers Training | 12 |
| | | 300 | 7/8/2009 | OGRIP Implementation of HB420, Retirement O | 1 |
| | | 37 | 6/22/2007 | OH Public Finance Officers CPFA Program | 12 |
| | | 445 | 3/4/2011 | Weights & Measures Training Program | 0.5 |
| | | 68 | 8/3/2007 | Current Events in Personnel Management | 2.5 |
| | | 71 | 9/7/2007 | IT & GIS Development | 1 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|---------------|----------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | | | <i>Portage Total</i> | 65.75 |
| Preble | Mindy Robbins | | | | |
| | | 128 | 1/18/2008 | Update from State Legislators | 1 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 152 | 3/21/2008 | 10 Mill Certificates | 1 |
| | | 16 | 4/20/2007 | Brown County GIS Project | 0.75 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 167 | 4/22/2008 | Reducing Liability Risk for County Auditors | 1.5 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 174 | 5/16/2008 | Auditor of State LGS & Software Development | 1 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 249 | 1/16/2009 | Gearing Up for an Active BOR Season | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 260 | 3/20/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies, Estimate Rev | 1 |
| | | 27 | 7/20/2007 | Remission of penalties & new Homestead change | 1.25 |
| | | 277 | 5/15/2009 | Report from Ohio Commission on Local Govt Re | 1 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiseal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 295 | 6/11/2009 | CAAO Collaboration & Technology Issues | 0.5 |
| | | 301 | 7/17/2009 | State Budget and Other Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 329 | 9/18/2009 | Sales Verification, Stats & State Oversight | 0.75 |
| | | 336 | 10/16/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 362 | 1/15/2010 | Roundtable: AOS appraisals, BTA, tax rates | 1 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of the Press | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 371 | 3/10/2010 | Communicating on the Stump | 0.75 |
| | | 375 | 3/19/2010 | Update to Fiscal Opportunities in ARRA | 1 |
| | | 391 | 5/21/2010 | Round Table Discussion on Board of Revision | 1 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 409 | 7/16/2010 | CAAO Legislative Prioirties for 2011-2012 | 1.5 |
| | | 421 | 9/17/2010 | ODT web site, sales tax; CCAO SB 232 tax exem | 2 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptrnshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 444 | 2/18/2011 | Changes in OPERS | 1 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 64 | 6/13/2007 | Manufactured Homes/Real Property Conveyance | 1 |
| | | 66 | 6/13/2007 | Tax Incentive Review Councils | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|---------------|-----------------------|----------|------------|--|---------------|
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | Preble Total | 158.25 |
| Putnam | Robert Benroth | | | | |
| | | 1 | 3/13/2007 | IRS Tax Law | 2 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 139 | 2/22/2008 | Auditor of State's LGS & Software Development | 2 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bicial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 229 | 10/24/2008 | Personal Property Tax and Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 26 | 7/27/2007 | BOR: Challenges of Valuing Lakeside Propertie | 1.25 |
| | | 262 | 3/27/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 296 | 6/19/2009 | Accounting Issues | 17 |
| | | 30 | 5/24/2007 | How to Manage Problem Employees | 5 |
| | | 303 | 7/7/2009 | * Ethics Educational Training | 3 |
| | | 304 | 7/21/2009 | Red Flags in Board Reports | 1.5 |
| | | 317 | 7/24/2009 | Courage in Tough Times & State Budget Update | 1 |
| | | 334 | 10/12/2009 | Union Bank Company Education Day | 7 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 380 | 3/26/2010 | ARRA Requirements | 1 |
| | | 422 | 9/24/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities | 1 |
| | | 427 | 10/22/2010 | Future of CAUV Sol Values; Do We Need to Ch | 1.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 440 | 1/28/2011 | Getting Ready for BOR Season | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 83 | 10/26/2007 | Update from State Legislators | 1 |
| | | 9 | 3/30/2007 | Legislative Review and Update | 1.75 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Diseussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | 95 | 6/8/2007 | Accounting Issues | 19 |
| | | 96 | 7/30/2007 | Bank Directors Seminar | 5 |
| | | 97 | 10/5/2007 | * Ethics Education | 2 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|---------------------|---------------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| <i>Putnam Total</i> | | | | | 129.5 |
| Richland | Patrick W. Dropsey | | | | |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisal | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbranc.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-----------------------|-----------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| <i>Richland Total</i> | | | | | 27.75 |
| Ross | Stephen A. Neal | | | | |
| | | 149 | 3/14/2008 | Auditor of State County Software Project | 1.5 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 28 | 7/13/2007 | Details on new state budget | 1.25 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 295 | 6/11/2009 | CAAO Collaboration & Technology Issues | 0.5 |
| | | 328 | 9/14/2009 | Implementing County Cost Svgs Program | 3 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of he Press | 1 |
| | | 368 | 3/10/2010 | Auditor's Web Site as a Communications Tool | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 371 | 3/10/2010 | Communicating on the Stump | 0.75 |
| | | 379 | 12/11/2007 | Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practiecs | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 412 | 8/13/2010 | County UAN Update and Discussion | 0.75 |
| | | 413 | 8/13/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.25 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptrshp | 1 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Acets Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-----------------|---------------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | | | <i>Ross Total</i> | 73.25 |
| Sandusky | William L. Farrell | | | | |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 139 | 2/22/2008 | Auditor of State's LGS & Software Development | 2 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 154 | 3/28/2008 | PERS Employer Reporting | 1 |
| | | 161 | 4/25/2008 | Equalization, Exempt & Conveyance Forms | 1 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| | | 167 | 4/22/2008 | Reducing Liability Risk for County Auditors | 1.5 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 178 | 5/30/2008 | Special Assessments | 1.5 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 208 | 7/25/2008 | Abstracts that are Due in October | 1 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 211 | 8/22/2008 | Project Planning and Strategy | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 216 | 9/16/2008 | Preparing&Executing Real Prop Settlement on M | 1 |
| | | 219 | 9/16/2008 | Proactive Approach to Abstract | 1 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 220 | 9/16/2008 | BOR Fundamentals | 1 |
| | | 221 | 9/16/2008 | CAUV Beginning to End | 1 |
| | | 225 | 9/26/2008 | CAUV A Closer Look at the Formula | 1 |
| | | 229 | 10/24/2008 | Personal Property Tax and Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 250 | 1/23/2009 | BOR Legal Updates and Refresher | 1.25 |
| | | 252 | 2/4/2009 | Legislative Meeting | 1 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 262 | 3/27/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 279 | 5/29/2009 | Update from State Legsss & IT on a Tight Budg | 1.75 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|--------------------|---------------------|-----------------|-------------|---|---------------------|
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 29 | 6/1/2007 | Budget Proposal on Expansion of Homestead Ex | 1 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 325 | 8/28/2009 | Implmenting Mandatory Cost Saving Program fo | 3 |
| | | 333 | 9/25/2009 | Henry Cty Transportation Initiaitive & Cty Budg | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 364 | 1/22/2010 | Going Paperless - Benefits of Teehnology | 1.5 |
| | | 380 | 3/26/2010 | ARRA Requirements | 1 |
| | | 386 | 4/23/2010 | Board of Revision Today and Tomorrow | 1.25 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 422 | 9/24/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities | 1 |
| | | 427 | 10/22/2010 | Future of CAUV Sol Values; Do We Need to Ch | 1.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 440 | 1/28/2011 | Getting Ready for BOR Season | 1 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|---------------|-----------------------|----------|------------|--|---------------|
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 62 | 6/13/2007 | Board of Revision Issues & Procedures | 1 |
| | | 64 | 6/13/2007 | Manufactured Homes/Real Property Conveyance | 1 |
| | | 66 | 6/13/2007 | Tax Incentive Review Councils | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 83 | 10/26/2007 | Update from State Legislators | 1 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Mare Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 9 | 3/30/2007 | Legislative Review and Update | 1.75 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | Sandusky Total | 162.25 |
| Scioto | David L. Green | | | | |
| | | 12 | 4/13/2007 | BCII Financial Investigation & Real Estate Roun | 1.5 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 149 | 3/14/2008 | Auditor of State County Software Project | 1.5 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Aecounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 252 | 2/4/2009 | Legislative Meeting | 1 |
| | | 28 | 7/13/2007 | Details on new state budget | 1.25 |
| | | 318 | 7/31/2009 | ARRA Training | 2 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities-w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 35 | 5/10/2007 | Drug-free Workplace Supervisor Training | 3 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptrshp | 1 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 64 | 6/13/2007 | Manufactured Homes/Real Property Conveyance | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|---------------|---------------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 66 | 6/13/2007 | Tax Incentive Review Councils | 1 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 78 | 9/14/2007 | Special Assess. & New Man. Homes Installation | 1.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Scioto Total</i> | 83 |
| Seneca | Julie Adkins | | | | |
| | | 225 | 9/26/2008 | CAUV A Closer Look at the Formula | 1 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 229 | 10/24/2008 | Personal Property Tax and Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 231 | 10/30/2008 | Ohio Public Records & Open Meeting Laws | 3 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 250 | 1/23/2009 | BOR Legal Updates and Refresher | 1.25 |
| | | 254 | 2/17/2009 | Workers' Compensation Workshop | 3 |
| | | 261 | 3/18/2009 | Introductory Governmental Accounting Seminar | 16 |
| | | 271 | 4/16/2009 | Fundamentals of Real Property Appraisal | 30 |
| | | 275 | 5/11/2009 | Managing Fiscal Resources & Making Decisions | 5 |
| | | 279 | 5/29/2009 | Update from State Legss & IT on a Tight Budg | 1.75 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 298 | 6/30/2009 | Preliminary Damage Assessment Workshop | 2 |
| | | 302 | 7/20/2009 | Keeping it all on Track & Moving | 3 |
| | | 317 | 7/24/2009 | Courage in Tough Times & State Budget Update | 1 |
| | | 325 | 8/28/2009 | Implmenting Mandatory Cost Saving Program fo | 3 |
| | | 333 | 9/25/2009 | Henry Cty Transportation Initiaitive & Cty Budg | 1 |
| | | 337 | 10/20/2009 | Legal Update and 2009 Changes | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 364 | 1/22/2010 | Going Paperless - Benefits of Technology | 1.5 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of the Press | 1 |
| | | 368 | 3/10/2010 | Auditor's Web Site as a Communications Tool | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 371 | 3/10/2010 | Communicating on the Stump | 0.75 |
| | | 380 | 3/26/2010 | ARRA Requirements | 1 |
| | | 386 | 4/23/2010 | Board of Revision Today and Tomorrow | 1.25 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|---------------|
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 417 | 8/30/2010 | SB 232 Taxation of Alternative Energy Projects | 1 |
| | | 422 | 9/24/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities | 1 |
| | | 427 | 10/22/2010 | Future of CAUV Sol Values; Do We Need to Ch | 1.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptrnshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 440 | 1/28/2011 | Getting Ready for BOR Season | 1 |
| | | | | <i>Seneca Total</i> | 153.25 |

| | | | | | |
|---------------|--------------------|-----|-----------|--|------|
| Shelby | Dennis York | | | | |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 152 | 3/21/2008 | 10 Mill Certificates | 1 |
| | | 16 | 4/20/2007 | Brown County GIS Project | 0.75 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 167 | 4/22/2008 | Reducing Liability Risk for County Auditors | 1.5 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 174 | 5/16/2008 | Auditor of State LGS & Software Development | 1 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 205 | 7/18/2008 | Personal Property Tax & Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 249 | 1/16/2009 | Gearing Up for an Active BOR Season | 1.5 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 262 | 3/27/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 27 | 7/20/2007 | Remission of penalties & new Homestead change | 1.25 |
| | | 277 | 5/15/2009 | Report from Ohio Commission on Local Govt Re | 1 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiseal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 295 | 6/11/2009 | CAAO Collaboration & Technology Issues | 0.5 |
| | | 301 | 7/17/2009 | State Budget and Other Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 336 | 10/16/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 362 | 1/15/2010 | Roundtable: AOS appraisals, BTA, tax rates | 1 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of the Press | 1 |
| | | 368 | 3/10/2010 | Auditor's Web Site as a Communications Tool | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 371 | 3/10/2010 | Communicating on the Stump | 0.75 |
| | | 375 | 3/19/2010 | Update to Fiscal Opportunities in ARRA | 1 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 409 | 7/16/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.5 |
| | | 421 | 9/17/2010 | ODT web site, sales tax; CCAO SB 232 tax exem | 2 |
| | | 426 | 10/15/2010 | Butler County Web Portal | 0.5 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc. | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 444 | 2/18/2011 | Changes in OPERS | 1 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 6 | 3/16/2007 | Real Property Abstract Preparation | 1.75 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|--------------|------------------|----------|------------|--|---------------|
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | Shelby Total | 154.25 |
| Stark | Kim Perez | | | | |
| | | 12 | 4/13/2007 | BCII Financial Investigation & Real Estate Roun | 1.5 |
| | | 125 | 12/13/2007 | Multi County Auditors' Meeting | 1 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 167 | 4/22/2008 | Reducing Liability Risk for County Auditors | 1.5 |
| | | 169 | 5/2/2008 | Auditor of State Local Govt. Services | 1 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisal | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 202 | 7/9/2008 | Dog License Registration Information | 0.75 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Polieies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 230 | 10/31/2008 | Record Retention and Dealing with E-Mails | 1.5 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 251 | 2/6/2009 | Weights & Measures Update; Report from MWC | 1 |
| | | 252 | 2/4/2009 | Legislative Meeting | 1 |
| | | 263 | 4/3/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 273 | 5/1/2009 | Accounting for Federal Stimulus Money | 1 |
| | | 275 | | | |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Diffieult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 295 | 6/11/2009 | CAAO Collaboration & Technology Issues | 0.5 |
| | | 300 | 7/8/2009 | OGRIP Implementation of HB420,Retirement O | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 327 | 9/11/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1.25 |
| | | 331 | 10/2/2009 | Real Estate Assessment Fund - Your Life Boat | 1 |
| | | 335 | 10/16/2009 | Public Treasurers' Education | 6.75 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 361 | 1/15/2010 | A. G.'s Office - Formal Opinion Process | 1 |
| | | 365 | 2/5/2010 | Empowering and Strengthening Ohio's People | 1 |
| | | 366 | 3/5/2010 | I Look About | 1 |
| | | 387 | 5/7/2010 | Dog License Software, Misc Dog Presentations | 1 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 408 | 7/9/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.5 |
| | | 410 | 8/6/2010 | Photography as Alternative to Reappraisal Requir | 0.75 |
| | | 411 | 8/6/2010 | Health Insurance and Retirement | 0.5 |
| | | 423 | 9/24/2010 | How Does Grape Production Qualify for CAUV? | 2 |
| | | 438 | 1/7/2011 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 445 | 3/4/2011 | Weights & Measures Training Program | 0.5 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|--------------------|----------------------|----------|------------|--|---------------|
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 62 | 6/13/2007 | Board of Revision Issues & Procedures | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 68 | 8/3/2007 | Current Events in Personnel Management | 2.5 |
| | | 71 | 9/7/2007 | IT & GIS Development | 1 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 75 | 9/19/2007 | Residential Rental Regis. Requirement | 0.5 |
| | | 82 | 10/25/2007 | Team Building for Optimum Success | 1 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| Stark Total | | | | | 124.75 |
| Summit | John Donofrio | | | | |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|---------------------|------------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 230 | 10/31/2008 | Record Retention and Dealing with E-Mails | 1.5 |
| | | 408 | 7/9/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.5 |
| | | 438 | 1/7/2011 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| <i>Summit Total</i> | | | | | 13.25 |
| Trumbull | Adrian Bivianno | | | | |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 213 | 9/10/2008 | Quality Management & Improvement in Govern | 1 |
| | | 230 | 10/31/2008 | Record Retention and Dealing with E-Mails | 1.5 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 257 | 3/6/2009 | Legislative Updates | 1 |
| | | 338 | 5/30/2009 | Accounting Classes Taught | 120 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 384 | 4/9/2010 | GIS Workshop Morning Session | 3.25 |
| | | 385 | 4/9/2010 | GIS Workshop Afternoon Session | 2 |
| | | 408 | 7/9/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.5 |
| | | 423 | 9/24/2010 | How Does Grape Production Qualify for CAUV? | 2 |
| | | 438 | 1/7/2011 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------------|-----------------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 64 | 6/13/2007 | Manufactured Homes/Real Property Conveyance | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Trumbull Total</i> | 187 |
| Tuscarawas | Larry Lindberg | | | | |
| | | 384 | 4/9/2010 | GIS Workshop Morning Session | 3.25 |
| | | 385 | 4/9/2010 | GIS Workshop Afternoon Session | 2 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|--------------|-----------------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 408 | 7/9/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.5 |
| | | 410 | 8/6/2010 | Photography as Alternative to Reappraisal Requir | 0.75 |
| | | 411 | 8/6/2010 | Health Insurance and Retirement | 0.5 |
| | | 418 | 9/2/2010 | * Ethics Education Session | 2 |
| | | 419 | 5/18/2010 | Emerging Trends in Fraud Investigation | 15 |
| | | | | <i>Tuscarawas Total</i> | 38 |
| Union | Mary H. Snider | | | | |
| | | 11 | 4/9/2007 | Open Government Laws & Recent Changes | 4 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 16 | 4/20/2007 | Brown County GIS Project | 0.75 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 174 | 5/16/2008 | Auditor of State LGS & Software Development | 1 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bicial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 205 | 7/18/2008 | Personal Property Tax & Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 260 | 3/20/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies, Estimate Rev | 1 |
| | | 301 | 7/17/2009 | State Budget and Other Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 329 | 9/18/2009 | Sales Verification, Stats & State Oversight | 0.75 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 362 | 1/15/2010 | Roundtable: AOS appraisals, BTA, tax rates | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|---|--------------|
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 6 | 3/16/2007 | Real Property Abstract Preparation | 1.75 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-----------------|--------------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 66 | 6/13/2007 | Tax Incentive Review Councils | 1 |
| | | 7 | 3/23/2007 | Ohio Civil Service Reform - HB 187 | 4.5 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Union Total</i> | 97.5 |
| Van Wert | Nancy Dixon | | | | |
| | | 1 | 3/13/2007 | IRS Tax Law | 2 |
| | | 129 | 1/25/2008 | Budget Commission Responsibilities | 1 |
| | | 139 | 2/22/2008 | Auditor of State's LGS & Software Development | 2 |
| | | 148 | 3/3/2008 | *D.A.R.E. Program | 1.25 |
| | | 154 | 3/28/2008 | PERS Employer Reporting | 1 |
| | | 161 | 4/25/2008 | Equalization, Exempt & Conveyance Forms | 1 |
| | | 178 | 5/30/2008 | Special Assessments | 1.5 |
| | | 211 | 8/22/2008 | Project Planning and Strategy | 1 |
| | | 225 | 9/26/2008 | CAUV A Closer Look at the Formula | 1 |
| | | 229 | 10/24/2008 | Personal Property Tax and Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|---------------|---------------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 250 | 1/23/2009 | BOR Legal Updates and Refresher | 1.25 |
| | | 317 | 7/24/2009 | Courage in Tough Times & State Budget Update | 1 |
| | | 325 | 8/28/2009 | Implmenting Mandatory Cost Saving Program fo | 3 |
| | | 333 | 9/25/2009 | Henry Cty Transportation Initiaitive & Cty Budg | 1 |
| | | 386 | 4/23/2010 | Board of Revision Today and Tomorrow | 1.25 |
| | | 427 | 10/22/2010 | Future of CAUV Sol Values; Do We Need to Ch | 1.5 |
| | | 440 | 1/28/2011 | Getting Ready for BOR Season | 1 |
| | | 70 | 6/6/2007 | American Heart Assc. Training Course | 3 |
| | | 9 | 3/30/2007 | Legislative Review and Update | 1.75 |
| | | 98 | 10/18/2007 | HB 9 Certified Training | 3 |
| | | 99 | 10/19/2007 | * Ethics and Public Records | 2 |
| | | | | <i>Van Wert Total</i> | 33 |
| Vinton | Cindy Owings | | | | |
| | | 155 | 4/11/2008 | Emergency Management, E-911 & GIS | 1 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 210 | 8/8/2008 | OPERS Employer Outreach & Deferred Comp O | 1.25 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 253 | 2/13/2009 | Conversion Levy, Other Levies, Rate Setting | 1 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|---------------|--------------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 79 | 10/12/2007 | CAUV and Forest Land | 1 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Vinton Total</i> | 97.5 |
| Warren | Nick Nelson | | | | |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 174 | 5/16/2008 | Auditor of State LGS & Software Development | 1 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 249 | 1/16/2009 | Gearing Up for an Active BOR Season | 1.5 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 277 | 5/15/2009 | Report from Ohio Commission on Local Govt Re | 1 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 295 | 6/11/2009 | CAAO Collaboration & Technology Issues | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 329 | 9/18/2009 | Sales Verification, Stats & State Oversight | 0.75 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 375 | 3/19/2010 | Update to Fiscal Opportunities in ARRA | 1 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------------|-----------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Warren Total</i> | 71 |
| Washington | Bill McFarland | | | | |
| | | 127 | 1/11/2008 | Update from State Legislators | 0.75 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 155 | 4/11/2008 | Emergency Management, E-911 & GIS | 1 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 172 | 5/9/2008 | Special Assessments | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 203 | 7/11/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 210 | 8/8/2008 | OPERS Employer Outreach & Deferred Comp O | 1.25 |
| | | 215 | 9/10/2008 | Sales Tax Distribution & Winding Down PPT | 1.25 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 25 | 5/11/2007 | Budget and Finance | 1.25 |
| | | 252 | 2/4/2009 | Legislative Meeting | 1 |
| | | 253 | 2/13/2009 | Conversion Levy, Other Levies, Rate Setting | 1 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 259 | 3/13/2009 | Board of Revision - Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 274 | 5/8/2009 | Appraisal Approaches & Sales Verification | 1.5 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 297 | 6/25/2009 | ARRA Training | 2.5 |
| | | 324 | 8/12/2009 | AoS Compliance Manual & State Legislators | 2 |
| | | 326 | 9/9/2009 | Updates on Legislation and Other Items | 1.5 |
| | | 328 | 9/14/2009 | Implementing County Cost Svgs Program | 3 |
| | | 330 | 10/2/2009 | ARRA Training | 2 |
| | | 332 | 10/14/2009 | Internal Acctng Control Manual & OH Mnfetd H | 1.5 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 352 | 11/19/2009 | Summit on Local Government Sustainability | 5.5 |
| | | 363 | 1/22/2010 | Organizational/Legislative Discussion | 1.25 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of he Press | 1 |
| | | 368 | 3/10/2010 | Auditor's Web Site as a Communications Tool | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 371 | 3/10/2010 | Communicating on the Stump | 0.75 |
| | | 372 | 3/12/2010 | Media and the County Auditor | 0.75 |
| | | 373 | 3/12/2010 | TIF and TIRC in Delaware County | 1 |
| | | 374 | 3/12/2010 | Board of Revision Today and Tomorrow | 1 |
| | | 388 | 5/14/2010 | Tangible Personal Property & Other Reimburse | 0.75 |
| | | 389 | 5/14/2010 | Levies that Can Grow with Time | 0.75 |
| | | 390 | 5/14/2010 | CAUV: A Look Back & A Look Ahead | 1.25 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 412 | 8/13/2010 | County UAN Update and Discussion | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|---|--------------|
| | | 413 | 8/13/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.25 |
| | | 424 | 10/8/2010 | Tax Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 425 | 10/8/2010 | REA: Past, Present & Future | 0.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 439 | 1/11/2011 | County Auditors and School Treasurers Worksh | 3.25 |
| | | 442 | 2/11/2011 | Use of Sales Ratios in Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 443 | 2/11/2011 | Unclassified Positions & Appointing Deputies | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|--------------|---------------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 62 | 6/13/2007 | Board of Revision Issues & Procedures | 1 |
| | | 64 | 6/13/2007 | Manufactured Homes/Real Property Conveyance | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 69 | 8/10/2007 | Round Table Discussion | 1 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 78 | 9/14/2007 | Special Assess. & New Man. Homes Installation | 1.5 |
| | | 79 | 10/12/2007 | CAUV and Forest Land | 1 |
| | | 81 | 10/17/2007 | Unemployment Compensation Seminar | 2 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Washington Total</i> | 180.5 |
| Wayne | Jarra L. Underwood | | | | |
| | | 12 | 4/13/2007 | BCII Financial Investigation & Real Estate Roun | 1.5 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|--|--------------|
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 181 | 6/9/2008 | Sexual Harassment | 1 |
| | | 182 | 6/9/2008 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 183 | 6/9/2008 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 202 | 7/9/2008 | Dog License Registration Information | 0.75 |
| | | 206 | 7/25/2008 | Certified public Records Training | 3 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 216 | 9/16/2008 | Preparing&Executing Real Prop Settlement on M | 1 |
| | | 218 | 9/16/2008 | Reval and Triennial Years | 1 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 220 | 9/16/2008 | BOR Fundamentals | 1 |
| | | 221 | 9/16/2008 | CAUV Beginning to End | 1 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 24 | 4/12/2007 | Ohio Weights & Measures Assoc Conference | 11.3 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 251 | 2/6/2009 | Weights & Measures Update; Report from MWC | 1 |
| | | 252 | 2/4/2009 | Legislative Meeting | 1 |
| | | 273 | 5/1/2009 | Accounting for Federal Stimulus Money | 1 |
| | | 281 | 5/14/2009 | Hot Buttons 2009 | 5 |
| | | 282 | 5/27/2009 | American Recovery & Reinvestment Act | 2 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 295 | 6/11/2009 | CAAO Collaboration & Technology Issues | 0.5 |
| | | 30 | 5/24/2007 | How to Manage Problem Employees | 5 |
| | | 327 | 9/11/2009 | Update from Ohio PERS | 1.25 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 361 | 1/15/2010 | A. G.'s Office - Formal Opinion Process | 1 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of he Press | 1 |
| | | 368 | 3/10/2010 | Auditor's Web Site as a Communications Tool | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 371 | 3/10/2010 | Communicating on the Stump | 0.75 |
| | | 384 | 4/9/2010 | GIS Workshop Morning Session | 3.25 |
| | | 385 | 4/9/2010 | GIS Workshop Afternoon Session | 2 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|-----------|---|--------------|
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 408 | 7/9/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities for 2011-2012 | 1.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 438 | 1/7/2011 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |
| | | 445 | 3/4/2011 | Weights & Measures Training Program | 0.5 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Acets Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 63 | 6/13/2007 | CAUV | 1 |
| | | 65 | 6/13/2007 | Valuing Real Property | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 68 | 8/3/2007 | Current Events in Personnel Management | 2.5 |
| | | 72 | 9/11/2007 | OWMA Quarterly Mtg | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 82 | 10/25/2007 | Team Building for Optimum Sucecess | 1 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-----------------|-----------------------|--------------------|------------|--|---------------|
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | <i>Wayne Total</i> | | | 181.75 |
| Williams | Deborah Nester | | | | |
| | | 1 | 3/13/2007 | IRS Tax Law | 2 |
| | | 100 | 11/20/2007 | HB 9 Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | 129 | 1/25/2008 | Budget Commission Responsibilities | 1 |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 131 | 2/1/2008 | Fundamentals of Real Property Appraisal | 30 |
| | | 139 | 2/22/2008 | Auditor of State's LGS & Software Development | 2 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 154 | 3/28/2008 | PERS Employer Reporting | 1 |
| | | 161 | 4/25/2008 | Equalization, Exempt & Conveyance Forms | 1 |
| | | 162 | 4/22/2008 | The Internal Audit Function; Protecting Yourself | 1 |
| | | 163 | 4/22/2008 | Planning & Technical Issues in Cty Audits | 1 |
| | | 164 | 4/22/2008 | Types of Debt & Debt Issuance Procedures | 1 |
| | | 165 | 4/22/2008 | Prospects for the Economy & Financial Mkts | 0.5 |
| | | 166 | 4/22/2008 | Auditor of State Compliance Supplement | 1 |
| | | 167 | 4/22/2008 | Reducing Liability Risk for County Auditors | 1.5 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 171 | 5/7/2008 | Intermediate Governmental Accounting | 16 |
| | | 178 | 5/30/2008 | Special Assessments | 1.5 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 184 | 6/9/2008 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 185 | 6/9/2008 | Explanation of Technical Bulletin - Aud of State | 1 |
| | | 186 | 6/10/2008 | Statutory & Admin. Requirements for Reappraisa | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 187 | 6/10/2008 | Bids, Proposals, RFP's Which is Best | 1 |
| | | 188 | 6/10/2008 | Standards of mass Appraisal | 0.75 |
| | | 189 | 6/10/2008 | Appraisal Contract Provisions | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 190 | 6/10/2008 | Tentative and Final Abstracts | 1 |
| | | 191 | 6/11/2008 | In House & Out Sourcing Reappraisals | 1 |
| | | 192 | 6/11/2008 | Data Analysis and Quality Control | 1 |
| | | 193 | 6/11/2008 | Approaches to Value | 0.75 |
| | | 194 | 6/11/2008 | Auditor's Appraisal Toolbox | 0.75 |
| | | 195 | 6/11/2008 | Informal Reviews | 1 |
| | | 196 | 6/11/2008 | Boards of Revision & Board of Tax Appeals | 1.5 |
| | | 197 | 6/12/2008 | Valuation Media Project | 0.75 |
| | | 198 | 6/12/2008 | Public Relations and Dealing with the Media | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 204 | 7/16/2008 | Fundamentals of Assessment Ratio Studies | 18 |
| | | 208 | 7/25/2008 | Abstracts that are Due in October | 1 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 211 | 8/22/2008 | Project Planning and Strategy | 1 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 225 | 9/26/2008 | CAUV A Closer Look at the Formula | 1 |
| | | 226 | 10/15/2008 | Everything You Always Wanted to Know about | 3 |
| | | 227 | 10/28/2008 | CAUV Formula Changes & Next Steps | 0.5 |
| | | 228 | 10/20/2008 | How to Become a CAUV Expert | 1.5 |
| | | 229 | 10/24/2008 | Personal Property Tax and Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 236 | 11/19/2008 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 250 | 1/23/2009 | BOR Legal Updates and Refresher | 1.25 |
| | | 252 | 2/4/2009 | Legislative Meeting | 1 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 26 | 7/27/2007 | BOR: Challenges of Valuing Lakeside Propertie | 1.25 |
| | | 279 | 5/29/2009 | Update from State Legss & IT on a Tight Budg | 1.75 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 29 | 6/1/2007 | Budget Proposal on Expansion of Homestead Ex | 1 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 293 | 6/11/2009 | How Tough Times Create Communications Opp | 1 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 297 | 6/25/2009 | ARRA Training | 2.5 |
| | | 317 | 7/24/2009 | Courage in Tough Times & State Budget Update | 1 |
| | | 322 | 8/4/2009 | ARRA Training | 2 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 325 | 8/28/2009 | Implmenting Mandatory Cost Saving Program fo | 3 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 364 | 1/22/2010 | Going Paperless - Benefits of Technology | 1.5 |
| | | 380 | 3/26/2010 | ARRA Requirements | 1 |
| | | 386 | 4/23/2010 | Board of Revision Today and Tomorrow | 1.25 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | Cauv Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 420 | 9/1/2010 | Building Strong Communities through Assessme | 13 |
| | | 422 | 9/24/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities | 1 |
| | | 427 | 10/22/2010 | Future of CAUV Sol Values; Do We Need to Ch | 1.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 440 | 1/28/2011 | Getting Ready for BOR Season | 1 |
| | | 48 | 6/11/2007 | Remarks from Treasurer of State | 0.5 |
| | | 49 | 6/11/2007 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 50 | 6/11/2007 | CAAO & Affiliate Organizations | 0.5 |
| | | 51 | 6/11/2007 | Update-Implementation of HB694 | 0.75 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 64 | 6/13/2007 | Manufactured Homes/Real Property Conveyance | 1 |
| | | 66 | 6/13/2007 | Tax Incentive Review Councils | 1 |
| | | 67 | 6/14/2007 | Everything You Want to Know / Being Co. Audi | 2 |
| | | 73 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues A.M. Session | 2.5 |
| | | 74 | 9/19/2007 | Budget Issues P.M. Session | 2.25 |
| | | 83 | 10/26/2007 | Update from State Legislators | 1 |
| | | 84 | 11/14/2007 | Legislative Update/Tom Pappas | 0.5 |
| | | 85 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks of Ohio AG Marc Dann | 0.5 |
| | | 86 | 11/14/2007 | Remarks from OH Governor Ted Strickland | 0.5 |
| | | 87 | 11/14/2007 | Central Weights & Measures Assc/OH Weights | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 88 | 11/14/2007 | Hiring Practices & Current Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 9 | 3/30/2007 | Legislative Review and Update | 1.75 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | <i>Williams Total</i> | 240.5 |
| Wood | Michael Sibbersen | | | | |
| | | 13 | 4/17/2007 | * Ohio Ethics Laws | 1.5 |
| | | 14 | 4/17/2007 | * Beyond Positive & Negative Substance Abuse in | 1 |
| | | 15 | 4/17/2007 | Personnel Issues in Your Office/Civil Service Re | 3 |
| | | 17 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 178 | 5/30/2008 | Special Assessments | 1.5 |
| | | 18 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative & Bienial Budget Bill Update | 1 |
| | | 19 | 5/2/2007 | Legislative perspectives on State Budget | 1 |
| | | 20 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks from State Tax Commissioner | 0.75 |
| | | 208 | 7/25/2008 | Abstracts that are Due in October | 1 |
| | | 209 | 8/5/2008 | Valuation Public Relations Roll Out | 1 |
| | | 21 | 5/2/2007 | Remarks:Deputy Tax Cmsr for Real Estate Taxes | 0.75 |
| | | 211 | 8/22/2008 | Project Planning and Strategy | 1 |
| | | 22 | 5/2/2007 | County Policies on Taxable Fringe Bebefits | 0.5 |
| | | 225 | 9/26/2008 | CAUV A Closer Look at the Formula | 1 |
| | | 229 | 10/24/2008 | Personal Property Tax and Sales Tax Updates | 1.5 |
| | | 23 | 5/2/2007 | IRS Audit of Counties: How to React, What to E | 1 |
| | | 237 | 11/19/2008 | Keynote Address from Auditor of State | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 238 | 11/19/2008 | 10 Mill Certificate & Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 239 | 11/19/2008 | County Internal Accounting Controls Manual Us | 1 |
| | | 240 | 11/20/2008 | Personnel Issues | 2 |
| | | 241 | 11/20/2008 | Forfeiture Sales & HB 138 Implementation | 1 |
| | | 242 | 11/20/2008 | Record Retention Issues for Local Government | 1.25 |
| | | 243 | 11/20/2008 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 244 | 11/21/2008 | Panel Discussion on Valuation Issues | 2 |
| | | 252 | 2/4/2009 | Legislative Meeting | 1 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 26 | 7/27/2007 | BOR: Challenges of Valuing Lakeside Propertie | 1.25 |
| | | 262 | 3/27/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 279 | 5/29/2009 | Update from State Legss & IT on a Tight Budg | 1.75 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiseal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 29 | 6/1/2007 | Budget Proposal on Expansion of Homestead Ex | 1 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 317 | 7/24/2009 | Courage in Tough Times & State Budget Update | 1 |
| | | 325 | 8/28/2009 | Implmenting Mandatory Cost Saving Program fo | 3 |
| | | 333 | 9/25/2009 | Henry Cty Transportation Initiaitive & Cty Budg | 1 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 364 | 1/22/2010 | Going Paperless - Benefits of Technology | 1.5 |
| | | 380 | 3/26/2010 | ARRA Requirements | 1 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 401 | 6/16/2010 | IT w/in State Gov't: Challenges & Opportunities | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 422 | 9/24/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities | 1 |
| | | 427 | 10/22/2010 | Future of CAUV Sol Values; Do We Need to Ch | 1.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptrnshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practiees | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|----------------|-------------------------------|----------|------------|---|---------------|
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 440 | 1/28/2011 | Getting Ready for BOR Season | 1 |
| | | 52 | 6/12/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State | 0.5 |
| | | 53 | 6/12/2007 | Debt Issues | 0.75 |
| | | 54 | 6/12/2007 | Payroll & Accts Payable; Encumbran.,Purchase | 2 |
| | | 55 | 6/12/2007 | Budget Commission | 1 |
| | | 56 | 6/12/2007 | Finan. Statement Preparation & Reporting | 0.5 |
| | | 57 | 6/12/2007 | Financial Audits-Understanding Audit Process | 1 |
| | | 58 | 6/13/2007 | TPP Phase-Out & Certificate of Resources | 0.75 |
| | | 59 | 6/13/2007 | Expanded Homestead Exmpt Program | 0.5 |
| | | 60 | 6/13/2007 | Establishing the Tax Rate | 1.75 |
| | | 61 | 6/13/2007 | Budget Comm. & Rate Setting & Appr Contracts | 1 |
| | | 89 | 11/15/2007 | Montgomery Cty Data Protection Process | 1 |
| | | 9 | 3/30/2007 | Legislative Review and Update | 1.75 |
| | | 90 | 11/15/2007 | Disaster Recovery Planning for Counties | 1.25 |
| | | 91 | 11/15/2007 | Panel Discussion: Findings for Recovery | 1 |
| | | 92 | 11/15/2007 | Remarks from Auditor of State Mary Taylor | 0.5 |
| | | 93 | 11/15/2007 | Local Governments' Reaction to Natural Disaster | 1 |
| | | 94 | 11/16/2007 | HB9 Certified Public Records Training | 3 |
| | | | | Wood Total | 106.75 |
| Wyandot | George W. "Bill" Kitzl | | | | |
| | | 250 | 1/23/2009 | BOR Legal Updates and Refresher | 1.25 |
| | | 255 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day A.M. Program | 1.5 |
| | | 256 | 3/4/2009 | CAAO Legislative Day P.M. Program | 2 |
| | | 262 | 3/27/2009 | Growth Levies, Conversion Levies & Estimating | 1 |
| | | 279 | 5/29/2009 | Update from State Legss & IT on a Tight Budg | 1.75 |
| | | 283 | 6/8/2009 | ARRA: Details for County Auditors | 2 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|--|--------------|
| | | 284 | 6/8/2009 | State Budget and Legislative Update | 1.25 |
| | | 285 | 6/9/2009 | Valuable Applications of GIS for your Reapprais | 1 |
| | | 286 | 6/9/2009 | Public Records, Retntion & Electronic Records | 1.5 |
| | | 287 | 6/9/2009 | Updates & News from Ohio PERS | 1.5 |
| | | 288 | 6/9/2009 | CAUV - What Farmers Want | 1.5 |
| | | 289 | 6/10/2009 | Economic Impact & Fiscal Opportunities of ARR | 1.5 |
| | | 290 | 6/10/2009 | Personnel Issues during Difficult Budgets | 2 |
| | | 291 | 6/10/2009 | Update on the Credit Markets | 1.5 |
| | | 292 | 6/10/2009 | Effective Rates in a Decreasing Housing Market | 0.5 |
| | | 294 | 6/11/2009 | Motivation of Employees in this Economic Envir | 1 |
| | | 325 | 8/28/2009 | Implmenting Mandatory Cost Saving Program fo | 3 |
| | | 341 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Oho PERS | 1 |
| | | 342 | 11/17/2009 | Legislative Update | 0.75 |
| | | 343 | 11/17/2009 | Update from Ohio Department of Agriculture | 0.75 |
| | | 344 | 11/17/2009 | Collaborative IT Opportunities w/ State of Ohio | 1.25 |
| | | 345 | 11/18/2009 | Ohio Tax Reform, State Budget & Recession | 1.5 |
| | | 346 | 11/18/2009 | Review of DTE Form 15 Series | 0.75 |
| | | 347 | 11/18/2009 | Valuing Real Property, Judicial Update | 0.75 |
| | | 348 | 11/18/2009 | Appraisal of Federal LIHTC Properties | 1 |
| | | 349 | 11/18/2009 | Defending Property Values in Common Pleas Ct. | 1.25 |
| | | 350 | 11/19/2009 | * Ethics | 1 |
| | | 351 | 11/19/2009 | * Substance Abuse | 1 |
| | | 367 | 3/10/2010 | Media Relations - Handling Inquiries of he Press | 1 |
| | | 368 | 3/10/2010 | Auditor's Web Site as a Communications Tool | 1 |
| | | 369 | 3/10/2010 | Update on UAN & Cty Financial Project | 1 |
| | | 370 | 3/10/2010 | Social Networking Strategies Pros and Cons | 1.25 |
| | | 371 | 3/10/2010 | Communicating on the Stump | 0.75 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|-------------|--------------|----------|------------|---|--------------|
| | | 372 | 3/12/2010 | Media and the County Auditor | 0.75 |
| | | 373 | 3/12/2010 | TIF and TIRC in Delaware County | 1 |
| | | 374 | 3/12/2010 | Board of Revision Today and Tomorrow | 1 |
| | | 380 | 3/26/2010 | ARRA Requirements | 1 |
| | | 386 | 4/23/2010 | Board of Revision Today and Tomorrow | 1.25 |
| | | 395 | 5/26/2010 | Certified Public Records Law | 3 |
| | | 396 | 6/15/2010 | CAUV Best Practices | 1.5 |
| | | 397 | 6/15/2010 | BOR Going Paperless | 1 |
| | | 398 | 6/15/2010 | What's Wrong w/ BOR? How to Fix | 1.5 |
| | | 399 | 6/15/2010 | Implementatin of SB 124 Transfer on Death | 0.75 |
| | | 400 | 6/16/2010 | ODT Web Portal for Cty Aud Vendor Registratio | 1 |
| | | 402 | 6/16/2010 | Fraud Schemes You Should be Aware of | 1.25 |
| | | 403 | 6/16/2010 | News & Updates from IRS | 1 |
| | | 404 | 6/16/2010 | Legislative Update | 1.5 |
| | | 405 | 6/17/2010 | Real Property Tax Exemption Process Update | 0.5 |
| | | 406 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Alternative Plan Design | 1 |
| | | 407 | 6/17/2010 | OPERS Healthcare | 1 |
| | | 422 | 9/24/2010 | CAAO Legislative Priorities | 1 |
| | | 427 | 10/22/2010 | Future of CAUV Sol Values; Do We Need to Ch | 1.5 |
| | | 428 | 12/1/2010 | Implementation of Alternative Energy Tax Exem | 1 |
| | | 429 | 12/1/2010 | State Owned Prop, LBRS, GIS & OGRIP | 0.75 |
| | | 430 | 12/1/2010 | Importance of Weights & Measures | 1 |
| | | 431 | 12/1/2010 | IRS Estate & Gift Tax, Agency Ptnrshp | 1 |
| | | 432 | 12/2/2010 | System Automation Yields, Leveraging IT | 1.25 |
| | | 433 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Web Site, Sales Tax, TPP Issues | 1.25 |
| | | 434 | 12/2/2010 | ODT Revenue, CAUV Updates, Sales Ratios, etc | 2 |
| | | 435 | 12/2/2010 | BOR Best Practices | 1 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

| County Name | Auditor Name | Course # | Date | Course Title | Credit Hours |
|--------------------|---------------------|-----------------|-------------|------------------------------|---------------------|
| | | 436 | 12/3/2010 | Legislative Update | 1 |
| | | 440 | 1/28/2011 | Getting Ready for BOR Season | 1 |
| | | | | <i>Wyandot Total</i> | 75.5 |

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements